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Abstract 
The Belt and Road Initiative advocated by China is expecting to assist in the infrastructure and financing of 
participating countries and promote free trade through cooperation with countries along the Belt and Road. 
China hopes to lead the regional economic integration process through investment-driven trade. Out of 
geopolitical considerations, Russia and India initially held a relatively negative or cautious attitude towards the 
Belt and Road Initiative. Therefore, Russia proposed the concept of the Eurasian Economic Union (EEU) in 
2011 in order to unite the other independent ASEAN countries based on the customs alliance consisting of 
Russia, Belarus, and Kazakhstan, and thus create a supranational consortium, which in turn have the ability to 
compete and cooperate with the Belt and Road Initiative proposed by China. In 2014, India launched the Indian 
version of the Belt and Road Initiative, named Project Mausam, expecting to promote the integration of 
economic and trade exchanges around the Indian Ocean with India as the center. However, after recent strikes by 
the trade war, China actively seeks assistance from India and Russia in order to break through the US trade 
blockade. During the G20 summit held in Japan in June 2019, China, India, and Russia held a three-party talk. 
After the talk, the three countries issued a joint statement claiming that “they shall undertake more global 

responsibilities to protect the fundamental and long-term interests of the three countries themselves and the 
world”, which seems to have opened up opportunities for future cooperation among the three countries. 
Therefore, this paper explores the competitive and cooperative relationship among China, India, and Russia 
under the Belt and Road Initiative. 

Keywords: Belt and Road Initiative, Eurasian economic union, project Mausam 

1. Introduction 

The Belt and Road Initiative is the response of China to its slowing economic growth in recent years. China 
expects to enhance its global economic and trade status and political influence through international economic 
cooperation. As the Belt and Road Initiative spreads across Europe, Asia, and Africa, China can integrate the 
economic interests of many countries along the strategic path and hopes to resolve the dilemmas of domestic 
excess capacity and fund idling. In particular, the Belt and Road Initiative can help China achieve the military 
purpose of expanding overseas military bases or deploying submarines in the Arctic Circle, which serves as an 
important strategy for economic, political, and military considerations. The promotion of the Belt and Road 
Initiative guided by the Belt and Road Initiative, and supplemented by the Asian Infrastructure Investment Bank 
(AIIB) and the Regional Comprehensive Economic Partnership (RCEP). As the policy will bring considerable 
economic benefits to the countries along the path if it is implemented smoothly, most countries show a welcome 
attitude. However, in the early stage, Russia located along the Belt and India located along the Road held a 
mixed attitude toward China’s promoting the Belt and Road Initiative, concerned while reserved. However, as 
recently hit by the trade war, China has actively sought assistance from India and Russia to break through the US 
trade blockade. China, India, and Russia held a three-party talk at the G20 summit in June 2019, which seems to 
have opened up opportunities for future cooperation among the three countries. If China hopes to cooperate with 
India and Russia, it must break away from its political considerations, connect with the countermeasures against 
Russia and India through economic means, and thus create a mutually beneficial environment. 

Different from the previous “Western China Development” policy which aims to balance the domestic regional 
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economic development and improve the overall national strength, the Belt and Road Initiative involves the 
political and economic interests of many countries. The threat of rising China results in a sense of cautious fear 
to the United States and the world. Russia located to the north of China and India located to the south of China 
are both directly affected by the Belt and Road Initiative, and can directly affect the Belt and Road Initiative. 
Especially, under the great influence of Russia on the five Central Asian countries and the great influence of 
India on the Association of Southeast Asian Nations, the success of the Belt and Road Initiative in these two 
blocks is related to the westward expansion success of the Belt and Road Initiative. Therefore, China’s 

relationship with Russia and India as well as the countries in the above two blocks is the key to the Belt and 
Road Initiative and also an observational focus of this study. 

2. Literature Review 
According to Li (2015), there have been various Silk Road development plans around the world. For example, 
the New Silk Road Initiative advocated by the US Government originated from the New Silk Road proposed by 
Professor Frederick Star, and was originally based on the concept of the “Greater Central Asia Plan” proposed by 

the United States; New Silk Road Initiative was a cross-regional economic plan formally proposed by former US 
Secretary of State Hillary Clinton in July 2011, and aimed to help Afghanistan integrate into the Central Asian 
region by rebuilding various infrastructures, and thus create an economic circle to connect the Central Asian 
region and the South Asian region centered on Afghanistan to contribute to realizing the strategic goals of 
southward energy transmission and northward commodity transportation. The “Asia-Europe Silk Road” of Japan 

aimed to connect Japan with Turkey to curb the development of China, but the Japanese version of the “New 

Silk Road” lacked a trade route between Asia and Europe; the “Eurasia Economy Union” proposed by Russia 

focused on the revival of Russia. Du and Ma (2015) pointed out that the strategic fulcrum of the Belt and Road 
Initiative is as follows: the South China Sea and the surrounding region is the strategic base of the Maritime Silk 
Road; Myanmar and Pakistan are the eastern and western anchors of the Maritime Silk Road; Central Asia and 
Russia are the commercial throats and bridges of the Land Silk Road. The Chinese version of the Silk Road 
Economic Belt is targeted at implementing the “two routes and one road” planning model, which refers to 

developing the “north route” based on the coordination of Uzbekistan, Kazakhstan, and Russia, and the “south 

route” based on the cooperation of Kyrgyzstan, Turkmenistan, and Iran. The north route focuses on the 

cooperation in traditional energy resources and new energy resources while the south route is supported by 
industries and emphasizes the infrastructure investment. As a result, the two routes make full use of their 
advantages and competitiveness. The other one road mainly focuses on the “energy channel”, namely the Eurasia 

Energy Channel, which highlights the locational and capacity advantages of Central Asia, develops the 
cooperation of oil and gas resources, and gradually rises to a new industrial belt consisting of new energy 
resources and environmental cooperation (Li, 2015). 

Russia is a transit country with great strategic value. Considering the continued turmoil in the Middle East and 
Transcaucasia, the transportation artery of the Belt and Road Initiative across Russia has been given a vital 
significance. Although Moscow is not a market target for the Belt and Road Initiative, the sanctions imposed by 
the United States and the European Union on Russia have made people re-recognize the importance of the 
Russian market: the consistently hostile economic policies of the European Union and the United States toward 
Russia have increased the risk of China being isolated by the US-led international economic system. China needs 
to cooperate with Russia while the sanctions of Western countries against Russia provide a broad market for 
Chinese commodities. On the one hand, the Silk Road Economic Belt is beneficial for resolving the difficulties 
which Russia faces in its Far East Development Plan. As nothing can replace pragmatism in Central Asia, 
Kazakhstan and Russia may seek to establish a balanced relationship with China and other participants in the 
region for the purpose of stability. Kazakhstan can benefit from the Belt and Road Initiative (Lu and Wang, 
2016). Chen (2015) pointed out that India believes that accepting the Belt and Road Initiative is conducive to its 
economic construction. On the other hand, India believes that the Belt and Road Initiative promoted by China is 
an investment-driven regional engagement strategy: on the economic level, it can expand China’s influence in 

the surrounding regions through investment; on the diplomatic level, it contributes to shaping China’s positive 

image in the global community; on the security level, it is capable of partially offsetting the military pressure 
exerted by the Asia-Pacific Rebalancing Strategy launched by the Obama administration; on the strategic level, it 
can guarantee the safety of China’s energy import channel. In addition, the unique mentality and pride of great 

power long held by India make it easy for India to take a zero-sum gaming perspective toward the Sino-Indian 
interaction. It believes that China’s rising influence in the Indian Ocean region will directly lead to a decline in 

the leadership of India in the region. As pointed out by Indian scholars, India regards the 21st Century Maritime 
Silk Road as a symbol of Chinese nationalism. Moreover, India even launched the Project Mausam in June 2014 
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in order to counter the Belt and Road Initiative. On the Belt and Road Initiative International Cooperation 
Summit held in Beijing on May 14, 2017, India also protested against China’s incorporating the China-Pakistan 
Economic Corridor resulting from the cooperation between China and Pakistan into the Belt and Road Initiative, 
and was absent as it planned to construct dams in the Kamil area at the center of India-Pakistan sovereignty 
dispute. 

According to World People News (2017, May 18), India believes that China is trying to indirectly dominate the 
foreign policies of the related countries through economic assistance, infringe on their national sovereignty and 
territorial integrity. As the China-Pakistan Economic Corridor resulting from the cooperation between China and 
Pakistan passes through the disputed area between India and Pakistan, it has decided to boycott the corridor and 
promote the “free corridor” with Japan. In addition, it plans to invest in the development of ports in Africa, Sri 

Lanka, Iran and Southeast Asia in order to counter the Belt and Road Initiative, and balance China’s influence in 

relevant regions. Chen (2013) believed that factors affecting the foreign policies of India can be roughly 
categorized into domestic and international factors. For India, the internal factors include territorial disputes: 
(Southern Tibet, small undemarcated areas in the middle, Aksai Chin Saiqin area), historical issues (the defeat of 
India in the Sino-Indian border war in 1962, the resulting feeling of stigma and betrayal by China has continued 
to this day.), trade imbalances (China enjoys huge trade surplus); the external factors involve the geopolitical 
strategies of India and the relationship of China and India with other small South Asian countries. For example, 
China assisted Pakistan in the construction of the Gwadar Port project, invested in the Chittagong Deepwater 
Port, the construction of projects in Bangladesh, and the reconstruction of the Hambantota Port, Sri Lanka, etc., 
as well as leased the offshore islands of Myanmar as a radar station and military base. Meng (2017) proposed 
that the four long-lasting mentalities of India have largely constituted the basis of India’s national policies, which 

will determine the success or failure of India’s dream of becoming a great power. The four mentalities include: 

(1) The proud posture of a great power that cannot be put down; (2) the complex emotion toward China that 
cannot be understood; (3) the dissatisfied psychology that cannot be faded; (4) the political correctness that 
cannot be driven away. Furthermore, he analyzed the motivations for India’s provocation in Dong Lang Village 

as follows: (1) Intend to transfer the focus on domestic conflicts, enhance the national spirits, and unite the 
people; (2) attempt to strengthen or maintain its control and influence on neighboring countries in South Asia; (3) 
try to gain international support and compassion; (4) plan to create trouble for China, and increase its bargaining 
chips; (5) seek military adventure and strategic gambling. 

3. Research and Analysis 

As the success of reform and opening-up has laid the foundation for the rise of China, the Belt and Road 
Initiative is another important policy that China extends to the west. The Belt and Road Initiative is proposed to 
provide economic assistance for the small and medium-sized countries along the path. Most of these countries 
are optimistic about the Belt and Road Initiative, especially the five Central Asian countries along the Belt and 
the Association of Southeast Asian Nations along the Road. However, when it comes to Russia and India which 
hold a mixed attitude toward the Belt and Road Initiative, China may need to seek a solution that benefits both of 
them. First, this study analyzes the relationship between China, India, and Russia from a historical perspective to 
investigate how Russia and India respond to the Belt and Road Initiative. 

3.1 Impact of the Belt and Road Initiative on the Sino-Russian Political and Economic Relationship 
Sino-Russian relationship is sometimes close and sometimes tense just as the relationship between lip and mouth. 
Initially, during the one-sided period, the two countries were closely related and mutually dependent; the Soviet 
Union provided a large amount of economic assistance to China while China was politically standing along the 
Soviet Union to confront the United States. At that time, the Sino-Soviet relationship was in an excellent state. 
After the implementation of the Great Leap Forward, conflict emerged between the two countries, which 
changed the relationship between the two countries. From the political criticism of the Sino-Soviet debate into 
the Zhenbao Island Incident, the relationship between the two countries was at the tensest stage. However, as the 
Chinese proverb goes, “If the lips are gone, the teeth will be cold”, the two countries must maintain moderate 
cooperation during the Cold War to fight against the third party. It was not until the Gorbachev visit to China in 
1989 that the tension between the two countries was gradually resolved. But until now, China and Russia have 
still kept a rather subtle relationship. Whether the Sino-Soviet relationship is hostile or intimate after the 
economic assistance, political criticism, and military conflict is often based on the international situation or the 
interests of the two countries, which can be seen from Russia’s seemingly agreement but also opposition toward 

the Belt and Road Initiative. However, Jia and Chen (2015) believed that Russia is a major energy and military 
power, while China rises from industrial production, and thus China and Russia share high economic 
complementarities. The oil and gas resources of Russia are essential for China to safeguard its energy security. In 
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addition, Russia is also the main external supplier of many advanced armaments and technologies that are 
needed for China to enhance its national defense capabilities. For Russia, China is one of the important sources 
of industrial manufactured commodities. But, in response to the Belt and Road Initiative, Russia also establishes 
its own economy version. Specifically, the Presidents of Russia, Belarus, and Kazakhstan signed the Eurasian 
Economic Union Treaty in May 2014. Later, the Eurasian Economic Union was officially launched in January 
2015. Afterward, Armenia and Kyrgyzstan also joined in the Eurasian Economic Union. While promoting 
Eurasian integration, Russia faces many external challenges from the magnetic attraction of the European Union. 
In particular, the launch of the Oriental Partnership Program proposed by the European Union makes the 
European Union more attractive. In this circumstance, some countries demonstrate a high willingness to 
integrate into the European Union, rather than join in the Russian-led Eurasian Economic Union. Another 
external challenge that Russia faces is the so-called Belt and Road Initiative proposed by China, especially the 
Silk Road Economic Belt Program which was advocated by the Chinese President Xi Jinping in 2013 when 
visiting Kazakhstan (Wei, 2017).  

The first reaction to the proposal of the Belt and Road Initiative was that China intends to make an offensive 
westward advance from the eastern direction of the Eurasian continent to the former Soviet Union region 
through another integration approach that bypasses Russia, especially to expand its influence in the Central 
Asian region. However, on May 8, 2015, China and Russia issued the Joint Agreement between the People’s 

Republic of China and the Russian Federation on the Construction of the Silk Road Economic Belt and the 
Eurasian Economic Union in Moscow, indicating that the connection process is on the right track.The two 
countries initiate the dialogue mechanism connecting the Silk Road Economic Belt with the Eurasian Economic 
Union in order to realize the economic integration of Europe and Asia, and promote the discussion among 
experts and scholars on the development of a common economic space (Chen, 2015) Hu et al. (2015) presented 
that only Russia has the conditions to jointly build the Belt and Road Initiative and is currently the best partner. 
As a natural opponent, the United States will spare no effort to obstruct the construction of the Belt and Road 
Initiative in order to maintain its global dominance.Although in the middle position, India is slightly tilted 
towards the United States in the short term. However, India needs to develop itself, and thus will act according to 
the cooperative economic interests and the communication results of the two countries. Due to the dispute in the 
South China Sea, the Philippines and Vietnam will stand with the United States in the short term and have a 
negligible promotional effect on the Belt and Road Initiative. In addition, the countries in Africa, Europe, and the 
Middle East with no territorial disputes will maintain a neutral status and actively participate in both the Belt and 
Road Initiative and the US-led economic cooperative organization, which makes them a solid force for the joint 
construction of the Belt and Road Initiative.Since the disintegration of the Soviet Union, Russia has established 
several economies to maintain its influence. The aforementioned Eurasian Economic Union, which was launched 
in 2015, is apparently in response to the Belt and Road Initiative. Chi and Ji (2015) pointed out that 1) the 
differences between the two include: (1) Regional development and cooperation models; (2) beneficiary subjects; 
(3) promotion methods, and that 2) the commonalities between the two include: (1) geographical similarity; (2) 
consistency of economic objectives; (3) coincidence of common tasks.However, Wan (2016) stated that the 
development of the Eurasian Economic Union mainly faces both internal and external issues. Specifically, 1) the 
internal issues of the Eurasian Economic Union include: (1) The establishment of a redistribution mechanism in 
the process of building a unified market; (2) the excessive transaction costs resulting from the non-tariff barriers; 
(3) the poor coordination of macroeconomic policies; (4) the difficulties in the free flow of labor force within the 
Eurasian Economic Union; (5) adverse impact from the accession of Kazakhstan to the WTO on the operation of 
the Eurasian Economic Union. 2) The external economic and trade issues of the Eurasian Economic Union 
include: (1) economic and trade relationships with Ukraine; (2) economic and trade cooperation with China. 

Yang (2017) pointed out that Russia believes that its top priority is to strengthen the construction of the Eurasian 
Economic Union in order to create conditions for equal cooperation with the European Union. However, 
Russia’s plan is unacceptable to the United States and the European Union for the reason that the United States 
and the European Union are very clear that this will increase the chances and bargaining chips of Russia during 
the negotiations. They do not recognize or accept the Eurasian Economic Union, and do not allow Russia to 
hinder the development of relationships between the European Union and the countries within the former Soviet 
Union. In their eyes, Greater Europe should not result from the merger of two mechanisms, but from the 
eastward expansion of the European Union. Russia should carry out various reforms as required by the United 
States and the European Union. Only under acceptable conditions will the European Union absorb Russia, 
making it a part of Greater Europe. As the two sides seriously opposed, their relationship turns cold. The 
European Union has implemented special policies in the energy sector starting from the implementation of the 
third energy package in 2011, which imposes severe restrictions on Russia. In response, Russia has set up 
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protective trade barriers targeting European products. Since the Ukrainian crisis in 2014, Russia has suffered 
overwhelming sanctions and isolation from the United States and the European Union, which greatly pushed 
Russia to officially shift its national strategic focus from Greater Europe to Greater Eurasia. As a result, Russia, 
which is blocked in its westward expansion, has seriously considered the possibility of eastward development. 
Zhan (2017) claimed that the difference between the Belt and Road Initiative and the Eurasian Economic Union 
is that they are not fundamentally opposite, but compatible and complementary. Although the regions involved 
in the Belt and Road Initiative and the Eurasian Economic Union are geographically overlapping, they can 
develop in harmony. Therefore, it is possible to connect the Belt and Road Initiative with the Eurasian Economic 
Union. At the end of the 1980s, the comprehensive disintegration of the Soviet Union, and the reform and 
opening up of China have led to different fates of the two countries. The former has been caught in economic 
recession due to political shrinkage, while the latter has risen magnificently due to its prosperous economic 
development. Therefore, the fluctuating Sino-Russian relationship has finally calmed down. As the proposal of 
the Eurasia Economic Union shows that Russia has the will to revitalize its national economy, how to connect 
the Belt and Road Initiative with the Eurasian Economic Union has become the research direction of many 
scholars. 

3.2 Impact of the Belt and Road Initiative on the Sino-Indian Political and Economic Relationship 
Although the Cold War situation was formed after World War II, China and India were on their respective sides 
at that time, maintaining confrontation only in form. At the end of 1953, when Zhou Enlai met with the Indian 
government delegation, he first proposed the five principles of peaceful coexistence, including “mutual respect 

for territorial integrity and sovereignty, mutual non-aggression, mutual non-interference in each other’s internal 

affairs, equality and mutual benefit, and peaceful coexistence” (Men, 2017). However, after the Tibetan religious 
leader Dalai Lama escaped to India in 1959 and was granted asylum by the Indian government, the relationship 
between two countries began to deteriorate.On one hand, China accused India of attempting to foster the Tibetan 
separatist forces and then cooperate with the Western world to contain China; on the other hand, India identified 
China’s entry into Tibet as a major threat to its national security (Chen, 2009). As early as the 1990s, India 
launched the Act East Policy, which aimed to rapidly expand the diplomatic target of India from the Indian 
Ocean to the Pacific Ocean and extend its policy objectives from Southeast Asia to East Asia. In the second half 
of 2010, when Sino-Japanese relationships were tense due to the collision on the Diaoyu Islands, India and Japan 
became closer and strengthened their cooperation in the fields of politics, economy and maritime security.Both 
sides have an urgent desire to check and balance China and expand their geopolitical and geoeconomic influence 
relying on the power of the other side. They are committed to deepening their cooperation in the security and 
economic fields. In terms of national defense and security, China has been a long-term concern for India and 
Japan, which are highly concerned about the military strength of China. Regarding politics, the common political 
requirements of India and Japan are to become permanent members of the UN Security Council. In economic 
terms, India and Japan have greater appeal to each other, which demonstrates great potential for cooperation 
(Wei, 2013). 

Lou and Zhang (2010) asserted that India is stuck into a dual mentality of both inferiority and self-esteem facing 
the rise of China. The shadow of the 1962 border conflict, the pressure of China’s rapid economic development 

and the doubts about China’s cooperation with small-sized South Asian countries have made India look at China 
with distrust, concern and even fear. In the meanwhile, India believes that it will ascend from the South Asian 
leader to a great power in the world, and is proud of its ancient civilization and its status as the world’s largest 

democracy. After the Cold War, the disintegration of the Soviet Union and the external strategic adjustment of 
Russia, India lacks traditional allies or new partners in the world. Coupled with the domestic economic 
development dilemma, India started to adjust its foreign strategies in the face of a profound international 
transformation. The Ministry of Foreign Affairs of India first proposed the Act East Strategy in 1995, which 
marks the starting point of India’s Act East Strategy and serves as the focus of India’s Asia-Pacific strategic 
adjustment (Wu, 2015).Wu (2015) pointed out that the joint statement issued by the United States and India in 
January 2015 stated that India and the United States will actively deepen the regional interactions within the 
framework of the Eastward Action Policy and the Re-balancing Strategy under the guidance of the US-India 
Joint Strategic Vision in the Asia-Pacific and Indian Ocean Region. Besides, their bilateral relationships have 
also been upgraded to “global strategic partnerships.” Yang (2018) believed that after the Trump government 
took office, although it raised certain objections to some of the Asia-Pacific Rebalancing Strategy initiated by the 
Barack Obama administration, and no longer publicly addressed this strategy, the core of this strategy has been 
retained and renamed as the new Indo-Pacific Strategy.After replacing the Rebalancing Strategy, the Indo-Pacific 
Strategy has gradually constituted the core of the Asia-Pacific strategy upheld by the Trump administration. 
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Zhang and Li (2016) presented that perhaps there are three following reasons which explain India’s doubts 

toward the Belt and Road Initiative proposed by China. First, objectively, if implemented smoothly, the Belt and 
Road Initiative will help China strengthen its economic and trade cooperation with the countries along the path, 
and further consolidate the bilateral relationships between China and the countries along the path.Second, 
subjectively, India has always considered that it enjoys natural geographical advantages in the regions 
surrounding the Indian Ocean and South Asia. It is not willing to tolerate the entry of outsiders, such as China, or 
follow the advance of China. Third, India may use this a bargaining chip in order to request corresponding 
reward or greater profits from China.Regarding whether India is willing to participate in the Belt and Road 
Initiative, and strategically integrate with China, according to Ye (2016), although Project Mausam has a certain 
impact on China’s21st Century Maritime Silk Road, based on the national development strategic demands of 
both countries, the possibility of cooperation between China and India regarding the Project Mausam and the 
Maritime Silk Road cannot be ruled out.Ye (2016) stressed that regarding India’s participation in the construction 
of theBelt and Road Initiative, China must seek truth from facts, considering the possible benefits from India’s 

participation and recognizing India’s suspicious and speculative mentality on this issue.  

According to the literature review of Sun (2014), some foreign scholars proposed that China integrates its 
military bases with the military presences in Thailand (Songkhla), Myanmar (Cocos Islands and Sittwe Port), 
Pakistan (Gwadar Port), Bangladesh (Chittagong), Sri Lanka (Hambantota Port), Maldives (Gan Islands), 
Seychelles (Mahe Island) and Sudan (Port Sudan), thus strategically forming a “pearl chain”. In particular, 

Myanmar plans to lease the Cocos Islands to China as its naval base, which will help China to build a “pearl 

chain” from the South China Sea to the Middle East through the Indian Ocean. The terminal of this “pearl chain” 

is the African continent. These scholars believed that the proposal of the 21st Century Maritime Silk Road by 
China in October 2013 actually serves as a cover for the “pearl chain” strategy. Du and Ma (2015) pointed out 

that the strategic fulcrum of the Belt and Road Initiative is mostly countries that are relatively friendly to China, 
such as Pakistan. Therefore, China seems to deliberately rule out India due to its own political considerations. As 
Southeast Asia is the only way to westward expansion, promoting the implementation of the Road and striving 
for support from countries along the path is naturally a subject that China must work on. However, in India’s Act 

East Policy, Southeast Asia also occupies a very significant position. India has always regarded ASEAN 
countries as a breakthrough in its entry into the Asia-Pacific region. On the political level, both India and 
ASEAN regard each other as an important power which they can rely on. In economic terms, India regards 
Southeast Asia as an indispensable external environment for its own economic development. Regarding security, 
India’s military cooperation with ASEAN has expanded from the initial military exchanges to comprehensive 
defense cooperation, indicating that the level of cooperation has been upgraded. (Zhang and Chiou, 2012). Lin 
(2016) pointed out that the power vacuum left by the US-Soviet withdrawal from Southeast Asia has resulted in 
uncertainty in regional security, while the rise of China has become a potential threat. China’s strong territorial 

proposition in the South China Sea in 1992 triggered regional tension, making the South China Sea one of the 
conflict regions in the Asia-Pacific region. India has no territorial disputes with Southeast Asia, but is also 
cautious about China. Therefore, ASEAN has sought to establish close relationships with India. The 
re-appearance of India is consistent with ASEAN’s principle of seeking a balance of great powers, improving 
maritime security and strengthening the Asia-Pacific multilateral security mechanism (Lin, 2016). In addition, 
Zhu (2015) presented that India’s diplomatic policy toward China faces the following problems: First, the 

strategic dilemma in which India unites with the United States to contain China, and adheres to the non-alliance 
diplomacy. Second, the cooperation dilemma of China Threat and the development of economic 
relationships.Third, the security dilemma from the joint construction of the Belt and Road Initiative and the 
increase of national security threats. In other words, although the two policies proposed by China and India are 
considered to be mutually beneficial on the economic level, they are conflicted on the political and military 
levels. Under tense relationships and conflicts of interests between the two countries, it is difficult to integrate 
the two policies, making the ideal of Chindia even more out of reach. 

3.3 Trilateral Political and Economic Relationships Among China, India, and Russia 
Fang (2005) investigated the trilateral relationships among China, India, and Russia from the perspective of 
strategic triangle, and pointed out that the India-Russian relationship is more stable than the Sino-Russian 
relationship and the Sino-Indian relationship, and that the development of Sino-Indian relationship is far worse 
than the India-Russian relationship and the Sino-Russian relationship. In other words, the trilateral relationships 
among China, India, and Russia are like an irregular triangle. As Russia maintains good relationships with China 
and India, it actively promotes the normalization of the Sino-Indian relationship in order to catalyze the 
China-India-Russia Strategic Triangle. However, once the three countries are allied, they will face great risks 
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and costs if they confronting the United States directly. At present, China, India, and Russia still hope to 
maintain normal relationships with the United States, and thus will not form a formal group to confront the 
United States openly and directly. However, the desire of the three countries for greater international influence in 
the new international order will not suddenly disappear. Therefore, the three countries have not yet ruled out the 
opportunities to deepen trilateral cooperation in order to defend their common interests (Fang, 2005). Tu (2017) 
considered that due to the complexity and variability of the strategic triangle, one important aspect of China’s 

strategic planning involves the management of the relationships among the three countries. First, the institutional 
management of the triangular relationships among China, India, and Russia should be further strengthened. 
Second, the improvement of the political mutual trust is the basis of the triangular relationships among China, 
India, and Russia. Furthermore, dealing with the US factor is a challenge for China, India, and Russia. If the 
China-India-Russia Strategic Triangle is established, it may indeed form an opposition to the United States as 
described by Fang (2005). However, for China which is fully developing its economy, unreasonably raising the 
tensions between China and the United States will only affect its economic development. However, as mentioned 
above, considering the importance of Russia and India to the Belt and Road Initiative, even if the strategic 
triangle cannot be formed, it is necessary for China to deal with the US factor, strengthen the political mutual 
trust among China, India, and Russia, and maintain good relationships with Russia along the Belt and India 
along the Road as mentioned by Tu (2017). 

Chen and Feng (2016) summarized the favorable and unfavorable conditions affecting the development of the 
trilateral relationships among China, India, and Russia. The favorable conditions include: First, the reform and 
power transfer of the current international political system are generally beneficial to the expansion and 
mechanism construction of the trilateral relationships. The macroscopic transfer of international power from 
west to east forms a macroscopic strategic foundation for the development of trilateral relationships among 
China, India, and Russia. Second, as the reorganization of power in the Eurasian region is gradually accelerating, 
urgent international governance needs have arisen from the common surrounding regions of China, India, and 
Russia. The reorganization of the power structure in Central Asia and South Asia and the fading of the US 
dominance provide a valuable strategic space for the three countries to expand their influence in the middle of 
the Eurasian continent, and also requires the strengthening of the strategic communication and policy 
coordination among the three sides. Third, the changes in the current international situation are conducive to 
enhancing the cooperation willingness of the three countries. The Ukrainian crisis, the conflict between the 
Western countries and Russia as well as the sanctions against Russia have forced Russia to shift its diplomatic 
focus to the East to a certain extent and seek new economic and political cooperation space in the Asia-Pacific 
region. While promoting the Act East Policy, the Modi government also actively consolidates its bilateral 
relationships with Russia, China, and other Eurasian countries, and becomes an official member of the SCO. The 
unfavorable conditions include: First, from the perspective of political systems, the internal differences of the 
three countries determine that the development of trilateral relationships demonstrates significant 
exogenous-driven characteristics. Specifically, the mutual strategic demand far exceeds the realistic cooperation 
foundation, while the lack of endogenous motivation constrains the development of the trilateral cooperation 
mechanism. Second, from the perspective of national cognition, the three countries are also significantly 
different in their attitudes toward the development and mechanism construction of the trilateral relationships. 
Third, from the perspective of regional structure, many structural factors in the political field of the Asia-Pacific 
region will also directly affect the development of trilateral relationships. Fourth, from the perspective of specific 
operations, there are still many problems such as insufficient strategic mutual trust and poor cooperation 
foundation in non-political fields affecting the development and mechanism construction of the trilateral 
relationships. 

The US factor affecting the China-India-Russia Strategic Triangle aforementioned by Tu (2017) can be analyzed 
from the statement of Zhang and Chiou (2012). Facing the rise of China and the changes in the Asia-Pacific 
order, the United States announces its return to the Southeast Asia in a high profile, and strengthens its 
cooperation with traditional allies, such as Japan, Korea, Australia and Philippines. In addition, it urges India to 
play a greater leading role in Asian affairs. Therefore, India will place more emphasis on strengthening its 
relationships with Asia-Pacific countries and expanding its influence in the Asia-Pacific region. Besides, Luo 
(2008) pointed out that in order to prevent China, the United States actively approaches India and attaches great 
importance to India’s position and role in the US rebalancing strategy. Since the Cold War, in order to maintain 

its global hegemony, the United States has strengthened its bilateral alliance relationships with Japan, Korea, 
Australia and Philippines in the Asia-Pacific region while improving its relationships with India in order to curb 
the rise of China and Russia, and attempt to form a mutually balancing pattern among Japan, China, Russia, and 
India, thereby building a balanced US-led Asia-Pacific region and keeping this region under its control. However, 
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according to the literature review of Luo (2014), India and the United States are still only “partners” for now 

instead of allies. The two countries still face many difficulties in establishing future alliances. First, India has 
long pursued a non-alliance diplomatic policy, and practices have proved the non-alliance diplomatic policy has 
enabled India to have its bread buttered on both sides and win a broad diplomatic space for India. India will not 
easily abandon this diplomatic tradition through which it can gain both international reputation and real benefits. 
Second, if India is aligned with the United States, its strategic partnership with China is bound to disintegrate, 
which is unacceptable for India as China has an increasingly broad strategic and economic interest in the eyes of 
India. Third, although the United States and India are carrying out comprehensive cooperation, the two countries 
have discrepancies on issues such as nuclear non-proliferation, intellectual property rights, human rights, 
economic and trade cooperation. In particular, it is difficult to reconcile the conflict between the United States 
and India in the leadership of the Indian Ocean. In other words, if the relationships among China, India, and 
Russia are like an irregular triangle as described by Fang (2005), the relationships among China, India, Russia, 
and the United States are like an irregular quadrangle. This quadrangle not only symbolizes more complicated 
relationships but contain greater tensions and severer frictions. As the biggest variable in the quadrangle, if the 
United States approaches India to check and balance China facing the rise of China at present, in the face of 
future rise of India, the United States presumably will propose the India Threat Theory and approach one certain 
country to check and balance India. But in such circumstances, China must still balance these countries, actively 
promote mutual trust and benefit, and seek common ground while reserving differences. Only when the four 
sides can obtain benefits simultaneously will the Belt and Road Initiative be smoothly implemented without 
being hindered by the United States, Russia, and India. 

4. Results and Discussion 
To sum up, the connection with Russia and India is mutually beneficial in economic terms. However, in political 
and military terms, Russia and India have doubts and are not actively involved. In particular, out of political and 
military considerations, India would rather sacrifice its own economic interests than cooperate with China. If all 
the great powers only consider their own interests, they will not support or even obstruct the Belt and Road 
Initiative. On one hand, under the banner of Asia-Pacific Rebalancing, the United States which employs political 
power in the east to instigate Japan and other Asian allies to check and balance the Belt and Road Initiative is 
certainly the biggest obstacle. On the other hand, the two countries close to the north and south borders of China 
can affect or hinder the smooth implementation of the Belt and Road Initiative in the most direct manner. The 
Eurasian Economic Union proposed by Russia and the Project Mausam launched by India are clearly targeted at 
the Belt and Road Initiative. The Eurasian Economic Union led by Russia can help Russia maintain its leading 
position in the regional economy, and confront with the European Union. In addition, Russia can also maintain 
its political influence in Central Asia and then exert influence on the Belt and Road Initiative. For the 
consideration of economic interests, connecting the Eurasian Economic Union with the Belt and Road Initiative 
is beneficial for both China and Russia. In addition, the Project Mausam launched by India is only a product of 
India to counter the Belt and Road Initiative under the mentality of “great powers”. Based on the above analysis 

and the views of many scholars, if India can get rid of its mentality factor and rule out political considerations, 
actively participating in the Belt and Road Initiative or even connecting with the Project Mausam will yield the 
greatest economic benefits for both China and India on the economic level. Although Chen (2015) pointed out 
the possibility of connecting the Belt and Road Initiative with the Project Mausam and the Eurasian Economic 
Union, but due to the different considerations of the three countries, there are still many problems which cannot 
be solved. According to Hu et al. (2015), compared to India, Russia has a higher possibility for cooperation or 
connection. The greatest goodwill of India is that it does not obstruct the Belt and Road Initiative, not to mention 
cooperation or connection. Even in this circumstance, China must circumvent in the irregular triangle or the 
irregular quadrangle and try to maintain good relationships with each side. The initial start of the Belt and Road 
Initiative has met with the great pressure from the United States (east), Russia (north), and India (south). As 
China has recently been hit by the trade war, it has been actively looking for allies and seeking assistance from 
India and Russia in order to break through the US trade blockade. The three-party talk between China, India, and 
Russia at the G20 summit held in Japan in June 2019 seems to have opened up opportunities for future 
cooperation among the three countries. But overall, there is an extremely hard and long way to go for this key 
westward development policy of China. 
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Abstract 
This research aimed to examine the effect of using the Six Sigma approach with its sub-variables (management 
commitment and support, feedback and measurement, continuous improvement, processes and systems, human 
resources) on improvement quality of health services with its sub-variables (response, reliability tangibility) at 
Jordanian Ministry of Health ,at the top management level, to achieve the study objectives, a questionnaire was 
designed which consists of (48) items , used for collecting primary data from study sample (57) participant of top 
management level at the Ministry of Health, Accordingly the data were collected, analyzed, and hypotheses were 
tested using the Statistical Package for Social Sciences (SPSS), other statistical methods were used to achieve the 
study, The study finding revealed that: "There are a statistically significant impact at the level of significance 
(P≤0.050) of the Sigma Six standards and its sub -variables on the improvement of the Health services quality 
which presented ,by the Jordanian Ministry of Health, Based on such results the researcher recommended a number 
of recommendations, the most important one are :The Ministry of Health should introducing Sigma Six concept , 
standards, and implementing it at the top level management, and training all the employees at top management on 
sigma six, linking Sigma Six standards to ministry strategies, and provide all the necessary for that. 

Conducting further studies that will show the positive effects of Six Sigma standards application in reducing the 
financial costs for health services ,and working to applying these standards to the human resources management 
functions.  

Keywords: Six Sigma standards, health service quality, ministry of health, top management 

1. Introduction 
The first decade of the twenty-first century witnessed a set of economic technological changes, that creation 
many challenges for organizations business, public and private sectors, including organizations specialized in 
health services, needing to develop itself and improve the quality of services provided to its customers, so they 
can gain an advantage to Their competitiveness with other organizations working in the same service sector, 
achieving their priority in growth, continuity and competition. 

Health care organizations face many problems trying to satisfy their patients, whether in terms of their needs or 
expectations, employees motivation, intense competition, modern technology and high costs of health care, 
which obliged these organizations to find ways that are effective, useful for health institutions and patients and 
employees, and here comes Sigma Six the role as an effective tool that helps in obtaining accurate explicit data 
to prevent employees at higher administrative levels, from making their decisions based on personal judgments, 
Sigma Six reduces incorrect solutions , reduces the cost of the service. 

Health care institutions are focusing their attention ,on improving the safety and satisfaction of patients, because 
patients are, looking for quality as a condition for choosing a care service ,because there is no way that the 
quality of service is poor (defective), because it is sometimes a decisive factor between life and death. Six Sigma 
in Health Care, help improve the quality of patient care, and reduce waste and get rid of defects. 

The health system in Jordan, like other health systems in the world, facing challenges related to comprehensive 
coverage of health services and financing, quality of services and governance ,in all its dimensions, and keeping 
pace with medical technology , information technology, which requires it to address these challenges in 
coordination, cooperation with other health sectors, to achieving the desired goals, and contribute effectively to 
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Promote sustainable development in Jordan, in line with Jordan Vision 2025 and the National Health Sector 
Reform Plan. 

Achieving quality in any service process is no longer a luxury but a necessity for the continuation of this process 
and reaping the desired fruits, it was necessary to use the Six Sigma method as one of the methods of continuous 
development in which the Ministry of Health found a new method to improve the quality of its health services. 

Based on his position and social responsibility, the researcher seeks to conduct this study to demonstrate the 
impact of using Six Sigma approach in improving the quality of health services in the Jordanian Ministry of 
Health at the top management level] 

1.1 Research Problem and Research Questions 

Jordan take a place at middle regional location making it the first attention from the Arab countries, a good 
medical reputation that exceed surrounding countries, made it the first tourist destination in the Arab world, but 
Jordan has been exposed during the past years, to many international, regional pressures, which posed a 
challenge and burden, ministry hospitals, facilities , as a result of the refuge operations from neighbor countries, 
also government pressure and popular demands to develop and improve the quality of health care services. 

The problem of the study was touched by the researcher , from his personal experience, through his working in 
the ministry of Health, there is a decline and disparity in the level of health service delivery between place and 
another therefore there is a lack of knowledge about Sigma six approach by employees at top management levels, 
and awareness of its importance, in improving the quality of health service in case It was applied in the Ministry 
of Health, therefore the importance of the study coming from answering the following key question: 

1. What is the effecting by using Six Sigma methodology in improving the quality of health services provided by 
the Ministry of Health? 

2. The main question has emerged from the following sub-questions: 

� What is the possibility of using the Six Sigma standers at the higher administrative levels in the Ministry of 
Health? 

� What is the importance of Sigma Six in improving the quality of health service? 

1.2 Significant and Contribution 
The importance of the study lies in its originality, it is considered the first of its kind in Jordan, which studied the 
use of Sigma Six methodology in the health services sector, specifically the Ministry of Health - as far as the 
researcher is aware - and that most studies have addressed, this issue in the industrial, academic establishments, 
and health institutions in the private sector, The importance of the study as the following: 

1.2.1 Scientific Importance 

By providing a scientific addition about the variables of the study and provides ,a theoretical framework, that 
addresses those variables , linking its results with the results of previous studies, and to know the extent of 
agreement or disagreement, with them and to propose further studies in the future. 

1.2.2 Practical Importance 

The study draws its importance from the variables that dealt with, Sigma Six standers, and its impact on 
improving the quality of health services provided by the Ministry of Health, through a field study that leads to a 
set of results, conclusions and recommendations, that will be placed in the hands, of decision makers to benefit 
from them.  
1.3 Study Objectives 
This study is the first of its kind, according to the knowledge of researcher, which dealt with Sigma Six 
methodology in measuring the quality of health services in the Ministry of Health, the following objectives are 
set: 

1 - Identify the effect of implementing Sigma Six standers at Ministry of Health through five main axes that 
considered as the requirements of applying the Sigma Six standers(commitment and Support of top management, 
continuous improvement, availability of necessary human resources, operations and information systems, 
feedback and measurement). 

2 - Contribution to increase knowledge, and perception of this modern concept at the level of top management to 
improve the quality of health services provided. 
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2. Literature Review 
2.1 Introduction 
[As a result of the great developments in the field of management, and continuous change, in the work 
environments that imposed, many administrative concepts, whether new, or existing, but need to develop 
commensurate with the change experienced by organizations, and these concepts (Six Sigma), this concept has 
achieved widespread, It was first introduced by Motorola in the 1980s, which began using this method to express 
its quality program. It was also used by many international companies, such as General Electric, Sony and Ford, 
and achieved success in providing millions of States S correct application of the Six Sigma approach] 

2.1.1 Six Sigma Concept 

Sigma is a Greek symbol used as a standard to measure standard deviation, or dispersion of any phenomenon, 
whether physical, chemical, service, and dispersion often causes, a departure from the typical values required of 
that phenomenon. (Awad, 2012) 

The term Sigma Six expresses that 99.99966% of production is not defective or rather 3.4 million is only 
defective while the 1 Sigma expresses that 31% of production is defective production. 

As for the number six "6" it symbolizes a level of "Sigma," where there are several levels of Sigma as shown in 
the table below where the greater the number accompanying Sigma, this indicates an increase in the level of 
quality and decrease the percentage of defects in the product and vice versa, This is true and there are segments 
that use eight sigma instead of six such as the airline sector, and the ophthalmology sector. 

 

Table 1. Sigma levels, defects and payoff 
Defects Sigma levels million chance of % return 

1 691.462 68.27%  
2 308.538 95.45%  
3 66.807 99.73% 
4 6.214 99.9937%  
5 233 99.999940%  
6 3.4 99.9999998%  

Source: ( Salaymeh , 2007) 

 

There are many six Sigma definitions all around one content: 

• Sigma Six: (a process or strategy that enables enterprises to improve significantly in terms of their core 
operations, through the design and control of daily business activities, and reduce waste, and consumption of 
resources, while at the same time to meet the needs of the client and to satisfy him. (Nasr, 2009) 

• Sigma Six: An administrative philosophy, contributing to problem solving and devising ways to improve both 
process and performance, through the recognition and / or elimination of unnecessary goods and services and 
loss of jobs and activities and can be described as a tight application of a wide range of statistical and 
non-statistical skills and methods to reduce The size of the resulting contrast in any given process. ( Nazer , 
2017) 

• Sigma Six in the health sector: It is a regular statistical process to detect and address defects in performance, 
using the method of Sigma Six to reduce clinical bottlenecks and mechanism that leads to prolong time and high 
costs and bad results (Noor et al., 2012). 

The definition according the researcher in the health sector refers to the "process analysis of technical processes 
to raise the level of quality of health care, and in accordance with the requirements of the patient." 

2.1.2 Sigma Six Curriculum Criteria 

-Six Sigma Approach : A clear methodological constructive strategy that includes a number of proven statistical 
and administrative tools such as illustrative maps are integrated in order to improve the quality of products or 
services by trained teams to apply this methodology .(Awad, 2011) 

-Top management: Is the body responsible for setting the objectives and policy of the organization and long-term 
strategic planning and linking the organization with the environment and decision-making key governance and 
crisis management. (Abu Nasr, 2009) 

-Feedback and Measurement: Provides feedback on quality programs staff performance continuously, allowing 
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for improved processes to raise the level of quality, contribute to the opportunities of excellence, creativity and 
success of the organization and the engagement of its customers. (Abdul Rahim, 2014) 

-Continuous Improvement: A never-ending-process that aims to make modifications to processes and work 
methods to improve the quality of outputs, with the aim of achieving perfection through continuous 
improvement of business and production processes . (Sanjak , 2010) 

-Human resources: efficient human resources required before the implementation of the Six Sigma (or during it 
in any organization), trained in the management operations, analysis of customer requirements ,and statistical 
tools in dealing with problems and linking the Six Sigma approach (promotions, incentives and rewards) Senior 
management to successfully apply this approach .(Jaber, 2015) 

-Operations and systems: Includes a set of operations and activities carried out by the organization with the aim 
of providing service to customers. 

3. Six Sigma Basic Principles 
3.1 Principles of Sigma Six 
Sigma Six is based on six principles according to: (Al-Otaibi, 2017) 

Principle 1: Customer Focus. 

The performance measurements at Sigma Six begin with the internal client “employees” and the external client 

“beneficiaries” because it is the first priority for the success, and continuity of the organization, so the institution 

is required to strive to meet the needs, and expectations of the client taking into account the continuous change 
of their needs and expectations. 

Principle 2: Knowledge Management. 

By focusing on solving its problems by building performance standards, and analyzing problems for 
decision-making based on scientific facts through data and information. 

There are three main groups to choose the most suitable tools for solving problems through Sigma Six: 

� -Team tools through responsibilities network and hands-on training. 
� -Process development tools such as brainstorming, Pareto map, cause and effect analysis, and experimental 

design. 
� -Statistical tools such as variance analysis, standard deviation, and graphs. 

Principle 3: Focus on the Organization's operations and activities: 

The term is intended to seek to prevent the problem before it occurs, to focus on how to address it, to review 
objectives on a continuous basis, to clearly identify priorities, and to avoid problems rather than remedy them 
after they have occurred. 

Principle 4: Towards the Summit. 

This requires meeting many conditions and requires management to have the ability to convince employees of 
the new changes that will occur and that this will affect them positively. 

Principle 5: Unlimited Cooperation. 

the elimination of administrative and psychological barriers, between the employees of the organization, and 
encourage ,and expand opportunities for cooperation ,between the internal groups of the organization instead of 
the spirit of competition, between them at all administrative levels with great care to encourage cooperation with 
the outside community. 

Principle 6: Striving for perfection while allowing for error and continuous improvement: 

The idea of continuous improvement stems from the principle of developing knowledge of the administrative 
and technical dimensions of the process and taking the necessary measures to develop to maintain the quality of 
performance and the application of new ideas and approaches to strive for perfection and excellence through 
Sigma Six. 

4. Six Sigma Characteristics 
The main objective of Sigma Six approach is to improve quality and efficiency, reduce waste in time, effort and 
energy ,and maximize profits, Sigma Six offers the benefit of companies in the form of profits, and value to the 
customer, and high quality products, and services at the lowest possible cost, thus companies can improve their 
competitive position ,in the markets by reducing defects In this regard, the organizations are interested in the 
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Sigma six method because of its characteristics, the most important are : - (Al-Rawi, 2011) 

1. Access to permanent success: control of the market, innovation and continuous modernization in organizations 
and keep up with the administrative, technical, cultural developments appropriate to the success of constant and 
continuous in the competitive market. 

2. Goal Setting: Sigma Six approaches focuses on the process and the client to set a fixed goal is to reach high 
performance as determined by Sigma Six approach or a level of performance close to perfection as expected by 
customers .(Al Nuaimi & Sweiss, 2008) 

3 Continuous Improvement: The philosophy of Sigma Six emphasizes the importance of continuous 
improvement for organizations, wishing to develop from the principle of developing knowledge, to reduce the 
administrative, and technical process and taking the necessary measures to develop, and to reduce the deviations 
that occur in the technical scientific which helps in maintaining the quality of performance and increase 
productivity. (Abdul Rahim, 2014) 

4. Encourage training and learning: Sigma Six standers contributes significantly to the speed of implementation 
of tasks, and brainstorming, acquire new skills of staff with an emphasis on the willingness of each organization 
its members, to learn and continuous improvement, and thus the appreciation of these employees and motivated 
and rewarded. 

5. Implementation of strategic change: the proper application of Sigma Six requires a full understanding of the 
operations teams, and procedures of the organization, as a way to achieve success in the work, especially with 
regard to the introduction of new products, or access to new markets, or the acquisition of new customers and 
must be linked to this approach to the strategies of the organization and long-term trends. 

6. Focus on defects: Sigma six methods focus on defects and reduce the likelihood of their occurrence and this 
requires the identification of organizational processes clearly which helps in identifying the defect in the 
company's operations. (Abdul Rahim, 2014). 

5. The Benefits of Implementing Six Sigma 

The benefits of implementing Six Sigma approach are considered one of the most important reasons that led the 
major international companies to implement it’s:  

1. Rise in the level of revenue: through efficiency and the ability to provide services and products better and 
without errors, which reflects positively on revenue. 

2. Reduce the costs borne by the establishment: Reduce the error rate in products and waste in resources in 
addition to saving time and effort. 

3. Reducing the cost of poor quality: It is the costs related to the correction of errors after the occurrence, which 
is accomplished in a non-conformity and is called the cost of failure and there are two internal divisions before 
the product or service to the client and outside any arrival, and contribute to the application of the approach to 
reduce these costs. 

4. Reducing the cost of production per unit: The role of the product in reducing errors or defects of products and 
services by taking advantage of the property of production in large quantities, which reduces the cost per unit. 

6. Six Sigma Theoretically  
6.1 Organizational Structure of Six Sigma 
The quality of Sigma Six is customer-centric, everything starts and ends with the customer, that customers have 
the right to expect performance, reliability, prices, competitiveness, punctual delivery, service , clear and 
accurate processing of transactions, all of which requires a strong vision of what Six Sigma can achieve for the 
company, Freedom to explore new ideas, and concepts and the authority, and resources needed to make the 
decision to apply the approach in the work within the facility and requires management to start mobilizing 
members of the organizational structure of the team, to implement the Six Sigma standers , and also identifies 
the members of the team special tasks commensurate with His rank, named after the art of karate, is a martial 
arts art: such as the master black belt, the black belt, the green belt, and their roles can be illustrated as follows: 
(Omari, 2015) 

1. Champion: The executive director of the Six Sigma project is called one of the tasks of the hero to manage 
individuals through change, determine the Six Sigma vision of the organization, and choose the project and the 
candidates to implement it. 

The hero has other tasks, including the allocation of resources to the team to complete his work, set a schedule 
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for the team to complete the project and evaluate the team's efforts, and also the necessary communications to 
move forward with the project and develop a road map for the implementation of Sigma Six. 

2.  Master Black Belt: Black Belt President participates the hero or sponsor of the project in some tasks, and has 
knowledge and understanding in the overall picture of the activity of the institution, and have a certificate of the 
Black Belt President, and the role of providing training and development at various levels of the institution, and 
help identify Projects, lead black belts in project work and support, participate in project reviews to provide 
technical expertise, assist in training and accreditation of black belts, assume key leadership programs, and 
facilitate the exchange of best practices in all organization facilities. 

3. Black Belt: Black belt represents the person expert in the strategy of penetration, and the roles of several of 
the most important to identify obstacles and lead teams implementation of the project and guide, and reporting 
on each stage to the appropriate leadership levels. 

4. Green Belt: The so-called trained employees who will lead the improvement teams, where they spend part of 
their time to complete the projects, but in return they will maintain their work and their basic responsibilities and 
can spend the green belt from 10 to 50% of their time on their projects and this depends on Their main business. 

5.  Yellow Belt (yellow belt): The yellow belt is called the project team members who work in Sigma six 
part-time projects part-time and yellow belt is the employee who received training in the basics of Sigma six 
during the full two or three days and has a greater understanding of the processes using Six Sigma tools and 
simple techniques. 

6. Executive leader (implementation leader): It is the executive leader, where he carries out the full efforts of 
Sigma Six and usually holds the position of Vice President, which takes upon himself the development of Sigma 
Six vision within the framework of the company's business strategy, and his tasks are summarized in the 
following (remove obstacles and reduce resistance to change Encouraging others to respond to change, monitor 
results and share black belts in reviewing project outcomes, and must have strong leadership skills. 

7. Health Services 

7.1 Health Service Concept 
The health service is the key to achieving health for all, and this has been confirmed by the Alma-Ata 
Declaration since 1977. It is also part of the development required to achieve social justice. It is the first contact 
of the people with the health care system. Although health services can be bought and sold, health cannot be 
traded. Good health is defined as a state of complete physical and mental health. Live and treat these problems if 
they occur. 

7.2 Health Service Characteristics 
The health services provided by hospitals have a number of characteristics that distinguish them from other 
services where the specificity of those services reflects the way in which the service can be provided to 
customers in terms of the following:- (Bakri, 2015)  

1. The services of the hospital are characterized by being aimed at achieving a public benefit to various parties 
and beneficiaries, whether individuals or organizations. 

2. The medical service is characterized by a high degree of quality because of its association with human life. 

3. Government laws and regulations affect the operation of health institutions and hospitals, in particular, 
whatever their dependence. 

4. Decision-making power in health organizations is somewhat distributed between management and physicians. 
Unlike business organizations, decision-making power is handled by one person or a group of people 
representing the power of management. 

5. Health service can only be provided in the presence of the patient himself. This requires direct contact 
between the hospital and the beneficiary of the health service. 

6. Because health services are linked to humans, they do not adopt the same standards as other services. 

7. The fluctuation of demand for health services in the hours of the day or week requires the provision of health 
service to its applicants because it cannot apologize for the provision of those who need it 

7.3 Health Services Provided by the Jordanian Ministry of Health 
The Ministry of Health is one of the most important health sectors provide health services to citizens which 
concerned improving the quality of health services, continuing to work for all hospitals and health centers, to get 
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accreditation, and to reduce the steady increase in the increasing rates of non-communicable diseases, and reduce 
their complications, strive to contribute to universal health coverage, Completing computing and electronic 
linking projects in addition to supporting all possible measures to contribute to the promotion of medical tourism, 
controlling spending and directing it towards priorities to contribute to stimulate economic growth and promote 
sustainable development. MOH, in line with the vision of Jordan 2025. (Ministry of health strategy,2018-2012) 

7.3.1 Types of Health Services Provided by the Jordanian Ministry of Health 

The Ministry of Health provides many services, including primary health care services, which are provided 
through a wide network of comprehensive, primary and secondary health centers, communicable and no 
communicable diseases, in addition to mental health and addiction services, reproductive health, health 
awareness and information programs, environmental and occupational health, and health. School, secondary and 
advanced health care, medical and nursing services, specialized, laboratory, ambulance, emergency, radiology 
services, blood transfusion. Pharmacy, quality and reliability .(strategy of ministry of health ,2018-2012) 

8. Health Service Quality 
8.1 Health Service Quality Concept 
There are many definitions of the concept of quality and service, those who defined it as (a dynamic situation 
associated with physical products and services and individuals and processes and the surrounding environment to 
match expectations. (Al-dradka, 2002)  

It has been defined by the British Standards Institute (BSI) "a set of qualities, features and properties of the 
product or service to satisfy and satisfy the urgent and necessary needs". (Abu El Nasr, 2009). 

Accordingly, the quality as a simple concept refers to the quality of work and performance, which reflects 
positively on the client by obtaining his requirements and needs in the right form and quality required. 

8.2 Dimensions of the Quality of Health Services 
The dimensions of Sigma Six are divided into the following: (Issawi et al. 2018)  

1. Continuous improvement: In the field of health services, it is an administrative philosophy aimed at 
continuously developing processes and activities related to machinery, tools, materials and personnel. 

2. Response: In the field of health services, it means the ability, willingness and willingness of the service 
provider to continuously provide the service to the beneficiaries when they need it. 

3. Reliability: means the ability of the health service provider (doctor, nurse, etc.) to perform the promised health 
service in a reliable manner. 

4. Guarantee: In the field of health service is the result of accreditation or trust of patients with doctors and 
hospital staff, and confidence in their qualifications and ability. 

5. Concrete: In the field of quality of health service, the following elements are included: Clean medical offices, 
hospital staff using standard means or machines, and prescriptions (medicines and medical supplies) should be 
easy to understand. 

9. Previous Studies 

(Alqatawneh et al,2019): “ Six sigma application in Healthcare logistics " a Framework and a Case Study aimed 
to develop a proposed, framework for how to apply Sigma Six in the scope of healthcare logistics" researchers 
have used the study methodology One of the most important findings of the study, was the selection of the Six 
Sigma project to improve healthcare logistics ,one of the recommendations of the study was to use it to pave the 
way for further future research to clarify the ways in which Six Sigma is used in the field of improvement Health 
care Logistics.10 

(Ahmad et al, 2017): "Effects of Six Sigma initiatives in Malaysian private hospitals" the studying aimed at 
applications of Six Sigma methodology, in Malaysian private hospitals, by measuring Six Sigma initiatives of 
private hospitals based on demographic composition such as Sex, Attitude and Work Experience Randomized 
stratified samples were used to collect data from eight hospitals, descriptive analysis and independent t-test and 
ANOVA samples were conducted in one direction using SPSS version 23, and from the results of this study, 
male respondents have a better perception of four aspects of Six Applications. Sigma such as process 
optimization tools, process optimization methods, Management of quality improvement activities and the formal 
planning process compared to the respondents, one of the most important recommendations is the continuous 
pursuit of knowledge in the field of Six Sigma using the strength of the relevant theories and basic principles of 
Six Sigma. 
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(Khalil, et al, 2014): Requirement for implementing six sigma approach in “Jordanian pharmaceutical industry, 

This study aimed to prove the key factor in making the application of Sigma Six in pharmaceutical factories 
possible, the exploratory method was used by designing Questionnaire to collect information on the trends of 
managers in pharmaceutical manufacturing factories, the most important results of the study that the key factor is 
the support and commitment of senior management and its role in cultural change in this concept, and the most 
important recommendations of the study to provide adequate support to achieve the objectives of Sigma six in 
addition to the need to train and educate workers in this concept. 

10. Research Methodology  
10.1 Study Hypothesis 
Based on the study questions, to achieving the desired objectives, the following hypotheses have been 
formulated: 

Main Hypothesis  
(H01): There is no statistically significant effect at the level of significance (P≤0.050) of the Sigma Six 

Approaches with its combined dimensions (commitment and management support, feed feedback and 
measurement, continuous improvement, processes and systems, human resources) in improving the quality of 
health services by its combined dimensions (response). (Reliability, Tangibility) in Jordanian Ministry of Health. 

A number of sub-hypotheses emerge from this hypothesis: 

1. (H01-1): There is no statistically significant effect at the level of significance (P≤0.050) of the Sigma 

Six methodology by its combined dimensions on the response in improving the quality of health 
services in the Ministry of Health. 

2. (H01-2): There is no statistically significant effect at the level of significance (P≤0.050) of the Sigma 

Six curriculum standards by its combined dimensions on reliability to improving the quality of health 
services in the Ministry of Health. 

3.  (H01-3): There is no statistically significant effect at the level of significance (P≤0.050) of the Sigma 

Six approach criteria on tangibility to improve the quality of health services in the Ministry of Health. 

10.2 The Study Model  

  

Figure 1. the study model 

 

Figure (1) the study model prepared by the researcher based on the following references: 

- Independent variable (Sigma six) : (Melhem, 2014), (Ahmed, 2017), (Naimi and Sweiss, 2008), (Tawfik, 2008) 
(Omari, )2011  

- The dependent variable (quality of services): (Taie et al., 2009) 
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10.3 Terms of Study / Procedural Definitions 
For the purposes of the present study, the procedural definitions of the dependent and dependent variable will be 
as follows: 

-Six Sigma Approach: A quantitative approach to improve the quality of service in the Ministry of Health, by 
improving the leadership style, performance levels through the use of a number of mathematical equations to 
measure , determine the success of the Ministry of Health in its work. 

- Top Management: It is the highest administrative levels in the Ministry of Health and concerned with planning, 
guidance, monitoring the overall results of the Ministry and the amendment of strategic plans. 

- Feedback and Measurement: It is one of the evaluation methods used by the Ministry of Health to collect 
information on levels of performance and achievement, identify weaknesses and shortcomings and take 
corrective actions for errors and performance. 

- Continuous improvement: One of the strategies followed by the Ministry of Health to improve its performance 
and , reduce waste in its resources, of time ,expenses , operational costs, to achieve the highest levels of 
performance required. 

- Human Resources: Human resources refers to the people working in the Ministry of Health, at various levels of 
management, where the Department of Human Resources is concerned with the management ,of these people 
through certain methods, and strategies that work to raise, the performance of employees and solve the problems 
of work and achieve the ministry 's desired objectives. 

- Operations and systems: Includes a set of operations and activities carried out by the organization with the aim 
of providing service to customers. 

- Quality of health service: The researcher believes that the quality of health service is represented by, a set of 
policies , procedures to provide health care services to the beneficiaries in a systematic, and objective manner 
and solve ,the problems in a scientific way, through the workers in health organizations, who use their skills and 
expertise and health care techniques available to them, to meet the needs of patients Ensures the best results at 
the right time and place at the lowest possible cost. 

- Reliability: The reliability of the researcher's point of view indicates, the ability of the service provider 
organization ,to perform the service promised by the client ,with a high degree of health, accuracy, time and 
performance. 

- Quality: A set of characteristics enjoyed by the product that affects its ability to meet the stated and implied 
needs and the ultimate goal of service recipients' requirements and satisfaction. 

- Concrete: The researcher means the physical facilities, associated with the provision of health service in the 
Ministry of Health, such as equipment, personnel, lighting, decoration, which is an influential element, in the 
patient's perception of the quality of service and build mental image of the service. 

10.4 Study Determinants 
Time Limits: The duration of the study procedures was determined in the summer semester of the academic year 
2018/2019. 

Spatial limits: the study is limited to senior management in the Ministry of Health. 

Scientific Limits: The present study was limited to addressing the criteria of Sigma Six, represented by 
(commitment and support to management, feedback and measurement, continuous improvement, processes and 
systems, human resources) and the dimensions of the quality of health services ,represented by (reliability, 
response, tangibility). 

11. Sampling and Data Collection  
Type and nature of the study: The study used the descriptive analytical methodology as a method of data 
collection, illustrative in terms of purpose. Syllabus is considered in terms of time horizon because it takes place 
on a sample at one time. 

Strategy used in research: The researcher used the survey or sampling strategy as one of the most commonly 
used strategies in human and social research, as it allows the collection of a large amount of data, and we can 
obtain standard data that allows easy comparison and enable us to quantify them using descriptive statistics to 
reach the relationships between variables. (Najjar et al., 2018) 
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12. Sample Study 
Study community: The study community consists of all employees at the top level of management in the 
Jordanian Ministry of Health (Center) and the number (57) employees. 

Sample of the study: The researcher adopted Comprehensive survey method so that it is representative of each 
element of society without bias of the researcher due to the limited study population, the researcher has followed 
the method of comprehensive survey by distributing the questionnaire to all vocabulary of the study where the 
(57 A questionnaire distribution on all employees in the administration, who holds a job title manager and 
director of the Department and Assistant Secretary-General and the number of (57) employees and 41 
questionnaires were recovered, about (0.719) .% Of the study sample] 

Analysis Unit: The analysis unit consisted of employees at the higher administrative levels in the Jordanian 
Ministry of Health, where the data were analyzed using SPSS and using the following tests: 

� Cronbach Alpha Coefficient to ensure the reliability and stability of the scale. 

� Analysis of multiple linear regression and descriptive statistics (arithmetic mean, standard deviation, 
iterations and percentages. 

� Data Collection Method (Study Tool): 

� The researcher adopted the descriptive analytical method , the method of study applied and adopted several 
methods to collect the necessary data represented by the following: 

� Secondary data: The data related to the subject of the study was collected through books, references, studies, 
previous research, letters and theses related to the subject of the study. 

� Preliminary data were collected through a field study based on a questionnaire designed for the purposes of 
the study using the Likert scale which divided to. 

Section I: Demographic data of the respondent. 

Section II: paragraphs of the questionnaire and divided into two dimensions (48) paragraphs distributed as 
follows: 

The first dimension: It was represented by a set of questions related to the standards of Sigma Six (namely, 
support and commitment of senior management, reverse feeding and measurement, continuous improvement, 
processes and systems, human resources) about (30) paragraph. 

The second dimension: It was represented by questions associated with the dimensions of the quality of health 
services and divided into (response, tangibility, reliability) about (18) paragraph. 

13. The Relevance of the Study Model to the Statistical Methods Used 
To test the suitability of the study model, linear regression analysis and parameter tests, multiple linear 
correlation and autocorrelation, multicollinearity were tested as follows: 

13.1 Multicollinearity Test 
This phenomenon indicates that there is an almost complete linear correlation between two or more variables, 
which amplifies the value of the R2 coefficient and makes it greater than its actual value. 

 

Table 2. correlation matrix of independent variables 

Variable  Management 
commitments and 

support  

Feedback and 
measurement  

Continues 
improvement  

HR  Operation 
and 

systems  
Management commitments and 

support  
1.000    

Feedback and measurement  0.769** 1.000 
Continues improvement 0.785** 0.880** 1.000  

HR 0.669** 0.829** 0.814** 1.000 
Operation and systems 0.738** 0.799** 0.770** 0.815** 1.000 

 

Table (2) shows that the highest correlation coefficient was between the two variables (feedback and 
measurement) and (continuous improvement), which reached (0.880), which is greater than (0.80), this may 
indicate the existence of the phenomenon of multiple linear correlation between the variables. The value of the 
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correlation coefficient exceeding 0.80 is an indication of the problem of multiple linear high correlations.  

To confirm the previous result, the coefficient of variance inflation was calculated for each of the independent 
variables to ensure a multiple linear correlation. The results were as follows: 

 
Table 3. Multiple correlation test results between independent variables 

Variable  VIF Tolerance 
Management commitments and support  3.082 0.324 

Feedback and measurement 5.866 0.170 
Continues improvement 5.607 0.178 

HR 4.386 0.228 
Operation and systems 3.862 0.259 

 
Table (3) shows that the values of the variance inflation factor were all greater than the number 1 and less than 
the number 10, and the value of (Tolerance) was limited between the number 0.1 and the number 1, which 
indicates that there is no problem of multiple linear correlation between the variables of the study. 

13.2 Validity and Stability of the Study Tool  
The study tool has been subjected to a number of tests as follows: 

- The questionnaire of the study instrument: The questionnaire was presented to a group of specialized arbitrators 
in order to express their opinion and in the light of the suggestions and observations made by the arbitrators, the 
researcher made the required adjustments. A number of observations were taken, which included an amendment 
to the wording of some paragraphs in terms of construction, language and content. 

- Cronbach Alpha Coefficient was calculated to ensure the reliability and stability of the scale of the study 
variables and dimensions and the study tool as a whole, to determine the consistency of the answers; the results 
were as follows: 

 

Table 4. Coherence coefficient values for the study instrument paragraphs 

Number Dimension  Number of paragraphs Alpha value 
1 support and commitment of senior management 6 0.863 
2 feedback and Measurement 6 0.941 
3 Continuous Improvement 6 0.912 
4 Human Resources 6 0.907 
5 Processes and Systems 6 0.864 

Sigma Six Standards 30 0.972 
6 Response 6 0.893 
7 Reliability 6 0.790 
8 Intangibility 6 0.873 

Health services quality dimensions 18 0.923 
All paragraphs 48 0.973 

 

From Table (4), the values of the internal coefficient of Cronbach's alpha coherence for the study instrument 
ranges (0.790 - 0.972), and the value of alpha for all paragraphs was (0.973). Study, the reliability and reliability 
of the study tool for statistical analysis. 

14. Data Analysis and Hypothesis Testing 
14.1 Characteristics of Sample Study 
This section includes a description of the demographic and demographic characteristics of the study sample. 
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Table 5. Duplicates and percentages of the demographic and demographic characteristics of the study sample:  
Variable Category Frequency Percentage 
Gender Male 25 61.0 

Female 16 39.0 
Total 41 100 

Job Title Assistant Secretary General 3 7.3 
Director of Administration 4 9.8 

Manager 34 82.9 
Total 41 100 

Years of senior 
management 
experience 

less than 5 years 10 24.4 
Less than 10 years 4 9.8 
10 - Less than 15 years 12 29.3 
15 years and above 15 36.5 

Total 41 100 
Educational Level Diploma 0 0.0 

Bachelor's degree 24 58.5 
Master 10 24.4 

Doctorate 7 17.1 
Total 41 100 

 
It is clear from Table (5) that the category (males) constituted the largest proportion of the sample of the study 
sample, where they reached (61.0%), while the category (females) accounted for (39.0%) of the study sample, 
and this indicates that the vast majority Of the workers at the higher administrative levels are males, this may be 
due to the precedence of men for women to the labor market, and given the data and requirements of leadership 
and administrative positions, which may not be available to females. 

And that the largest proportion of the sample of the study sample (Director), which reached (82.9%), and this 
corresponds to the nature of the organizational pyramid in modern organizations, where the number increases as 
we move to the base of the pyramid, and vice versa. 

The sample (15 years and above) constituted the largest percentage of the sample (36.5%), followed by the 
experience category (10 - less than 15 years), which amounted to (29.3%). An indication that the senior 
management in the Jordanian Ministry of Health has sufficient experience to assume senior management 
positions and carry out their duties and duties and reflects their ability to absorb and quickly understand the 
Sigma Six standards. 

Finally, we find that the category of holders of the first university degree (bachelor) has made up the majority of 
the sample of the study, where the proportion (58.5%) and this indicates a good percentage of the higher 
academic levels within the higher management levels. 

14.2 Analysis of Study Tool Paragraphs 
First: Description of Independent Variables, Six Sigma Method Criteria: 

To compare the dimensions of the Six Sigma Curriculum Standards, the following table was prepared: 

 

Table 6. Arithmetic averages, standard deviations, grades and relative importance of Sigma Six standards 

Number Variable Arithmetic standard 
deviation 

rank relative 
importance 

1 top management commitment and support 2.817 0.703 3 medium 
2 Intermediate feedback and measurement 3.024 0.921 2 medium 
3 Continuous Improvement 3.093 0.824 1 medium 
4 Processes and systems 2.659 0.813 4 medium 
5 Human Resources 2.654 0.758 5 medium 

Six Sigma curriculum standards 2.850 0.734  medium 

 
We note from the previous table that the overall average of the Sigma Six curriculum standards in terms of 
relative importance is average, where the average was (2.850) and a standard deviation of (0.734). After 
(continuous improvement) was ranked first with an average of (3.093) and standard deviation (0.824) and 
medium relative importance, while (human resources) was ranked last with an average of (2.654) and standard 
deviation (0.758) and of relative importance. 
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- Description of dependent variables, quality of health services: 

To compare the dimensions of the quality of health services, the following table was prepared: 

 

Table 7. Arithmetic averages, standard deviations, grades and relative importance of health service quality 
dimensions 

Number Variable Mean Arithmetic Standard Deviation Rank Relative importance 
1 Response 3.008 0.735 2 Medium 
2 Tangibility 3.085 0.641 1 Medium 
3 Reliability 2.967 0.651 3 Medium 

Quality of health services 3.020 0.585  Medium 

 
We note from the previous table that the overall average of the quality of health services in terms of relative 
importance is average, where the overall average (3.020) and standard deviation (0.585). After (tangibility) was 
ranked first with an arithmetic mean of (3.085) and standard deviation (0.641) and medium relative importance, 
while (reliability) was ranked last with an arithmetic mean (2.967) and standard deviation (0.651) and of relative 
importance. 

14.3 Test Hypotheses of the Study 
The main hypothesis: 

 :H0 "There is no statistically significant effect at the level of significance (P≤0.050) of the Sigma Six Criteria 

with its combined dimensions (management commitment and support, reverse feeding and measurement, 
continuous improvement, processes and systems, human resources) on improving the quality of health services 
by its dimensions(Tangible, responsive) at the Jordanian Ministry of Health. 

To test the main hypothesis and its subdivisions, multiple linear regression analysis was used. 

H01: There is no statistically significant effect at the level of significance (P≤0.050) of the Sigma Six curriculum 

standards by its combined dimensions on the response in improving the quality of health services in the Ministry 
of Health. 

 

Table 8. Impact test results (Six Sigma curriculum criteria) on response 

variable Model 
Summery 

ANOVA Coefficients 

R 
 

R2 
 

F 
 

Df Sig F* 
 

Statement B Standard 
error 

T 
 

Sig t* 
 

Response 0.784 0.615 11.199 5 0.000 Senior management 
commitment and 

support 

0.669 0.192 3.476 0.001 

Feedback and 
Measurement 

0.059 0.203 0.291 0.772 

Continuous 
Improvement 

0.586 0.221 2.646 0.012 

Operations and 
Systems 

0.149 0.198 0.750 0.458 

Human Resources 0.382 0.200 1.912 0.064 
* The effect is statistically significant at (p≤0.05). 

 

The results of table (8) indicate that the correlation coefficient (R = 0.784) indicates the relationship between the 
independent variables and the dependent variable, and the effect of the independent variables (Sigma Six Criteria 
criteria) on the dependent variable (response) is statistically significant, where the value of F calculated (11.199), 
and the level of significance (Sig = 0.000), which is less than 0.05, where it appeared that the value of the 
coefficient of determination (R2 = 0.615) It indicates that (61.5%) of the variance in (response) can be explained 
by the variance in ( The Sigma methodology criteria are six (combined), and the table of transactions showed 
that the value of B at the dimension (commitment and support of senior management) was (0.669) and the value 
of t at (3.476), and the level of significance (Sig = 0 .001), indicating that the effect of this dimension is 
significant. And that the value of B at the dimension (feedback and measurement) was (0.059) and the value of t 
at (0.291), and the level of significance (Sig = 0.772), which indicates that the effect of this dimension is not 
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significant. The value of B at (Continuous Improvement) was (0.586) and the value of t at (2.646), and the level 
of significance (Sig = 0.012), which indicates that the effect of this dimension is significant. The value of B at 
the dimension (processes and systems) (0.149) and t at (0.750), and the level of significance (Sig = 0.458), which 
indicates that the effect of this dimension is not significant. The value of B at the dimension (HR) 

)0.382 ( and the value of t is (1.912), with a level of significance (Sig = 0.064), which indicates that the effect of 
this dimension is not significant 

Based on the above, we reject the first nihilistic hypothesis and accept the alternative hypothesis: 

"There is a statistically significant impact at the significant level (P≤0.050) of the Sigma Six curriculum 

standards by its combined dimensions (commitment and support of senior management, feedback and 
measurement, continuous improvement, processes and systems, human resources) on the response in improving 
the quality of health services in the Ministry of Health". 

H02: There is no statistically significant effect at the significant level (P≤0.050) of the Sigma Six curriculum 
standards by its combined dimensions (commitment and support of senior management, reverse nutrition and 
measurement, continuous improvement, processes and systems, human resources) on the reliability in improving 
the quality of health services in the ministry of health. 

 

Table 9. Impact test results (Sigma Six curriculum criteria) on reliability 

variable Model 
Summery 

ANOVA Coefficients 

R 
 

R2 
 

F 
 

Df Sig F* 
 

Statement B Standard 
error 

T 
 

Sig t* 
 

Reliability 0.685  0.469 6.173 5 0.000 support of top 
management 

0.213 0.200 1.061 0.296 

Feedback  0.143 0.211 0.677 0.503 
Continuous 

Improvement 
0.261 0.230 1.134 0.264 

Operations and 
Systems 

0.380 0.207 1.841 0.074 

Human Resources 0.242 0.208 .164  0.252 
 *The effect is statistically significant at (p≤0.05). 

 

The results of table (9) indicate that the correlation coefficient (R = 0.685) refers to the relationship between 
independent variables and dependent variable, and the effect of independent variables (Sigma Six Criteria 
criteria) on the dependent variable (reliability) is statistically significant, where the value of F calculated (6.173), 
and the level of significance (Sig = 0.000) which is less than 0.05, where the value of the coefficient of 
determination (R2 = 0.469) It indicates that (46.9%) of the variance in (reliability) can be explained by the 
variance in ( Six Sigma curriculum criteria) combined. 

The transactions table showed that the value of B at the dimension (commitment and support of senior 
management) was (0.213) and the value of t at (1.061), and the level of significance (Sig = 0.296), which 
indicates that the impact of this dimension is not significant. The value of B at the dimension (feedback and 
measurement) was (0.143) and the value of t at (0.677), and the level of significance (Sig = 0.503), which 
indicates that the effect of this dimension is not significant. The value of B at (continuous improvement) was 
(0.261) and t at (1.134), and the level of significance (Sig = 0.264), which indicates that the effect of this 
dimension is not significant. The value of B at the dimension (processes and systems) (0.380) and t at (1.841), 
and the level of significance (Sig = 0.074), which indicates that the effect of this dimension is not significant. 
The value of B at (human resources) dimension (0.242) and t at (1.164), and the level of significance (Sig = 
0.252), which indicates that the effect of this dimension is not significant. 

Based on the above, we reject the second hypothesis and accept the alternative hypothesis: 

"There is a statistically significant impact at the significant level (P≤0.050) of the Sigma Six curriculum 

standards by its combined dimensions (commitment and support of senior management, reverse feeding and 
measurement, continuous improvement, processes and systems, human resources) on the reliability in improving 
the quality of health services in the Ministry of Health". 

H03: There is no statistically significant effect at the significant level (P≤0.050) of the Sigma Six curriculum 

standards by its combined dimensions (commitment and support of senior management, reverse feeding and 
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measurement, continuous improvement, processes and systems, human resources) on the concreteity in 
improving the quality of health services in the ministry of health. 

 

Table 10. The results of the impact test (Six Sigma Curriculum Standards) on concrete 

variable Model Summery ANOVA Coefficients 
R 
 

R2 
 

F 
 

Df Sig F* 
 

Statement B Standard 
error 

T 
 

Sig t* 
 

Tangible 0.631 0.398 4.633 5 0.002 support of 
top 

management 

0.244 0.210 1.161 0.253 

Feedback 0.237 0.221 1.074 0.290 
Continuous 

Improvement 
0.421 0.242 1.742 0.090 

Operations 
and Systems 

0.096 0.217 0.445 0.659 

Human 
Resources 

0.617 0.218 2.830 0.008 

The effect is statistically significant at (p≤0.05). 

 

The results of Table (10) indicate that the correlation coefficient (R = 0.631) indicates the relationship between 
the independent variables and the dependent variable, and that the effect of the independent variables (Sigma Six 
Criteria Methods) on the dependent variable (tangibility) is statistically significant. F calculated (4.633), and the 
level of significance (Sig = 0.002), which is less than 0.05, where the value of the coefficient of determination 
(R2 = 0.398) It indicates that (39.8%) of the variance in (tangibility) can be explained by the variation in ( Six 
Sigma curriculum criteria) combined. 

The table of transactions showed that the value of B at the dimension (commitment and support of senior 
management) was (0.244) and the value of t at (1.161), and the level of significance (Sig = 0.253), which 
indicates that the impact of this dimension is not significant. The value of B at the dimension (feedback and 
measurement) was (0.237) and the value of t at (1.074), and the level of significance (Sig = 0.290), which 
indicates that the effect of this dimension is not significant. The value of B at (Continuous Improvement) was 
(0.421) and t at (1.742), with a significance level (Sig = 0.090), which indicates that the effect of this dimension 
is not significant. The value of B at the dimension (processes and systems) (0.096) and t at (0.445), and the level 
of significance (Sig = 0.659), which indicates that the effect of this dimension is not significant. The value of B 
at (human resources) dimension (0.617) and t value at (2.830), and the level of significance (Sig = 0.008), which 
indicates that the effect of this dimension significant. 

Based on the above, we reject the third hypothesis and accept the alternative hypothesis: 

"There is a statistically significant impact at the level of significance (P.00.050) of the Sigma Six curriculum 
standards by its combined dimensions on the concretely in improving the quality of health services in the 
Ministry of Health" 

To test the first major hypothesis, multiple regression analysis was used. The results were as follows: 
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Table 11. Results of the impact test (Six Sigma Curriculum Standards) on the quality of health services 

variable Model Summery ANOVA Coefficients 
R 
 

R2 
 

F 
 

Df Sig F* 
 

Statement B Standard 
error 

T 
 

Sig 
t* 
 

Health 
Services 

Quality and 
Commitment 

0.785 0.616 11.207 5 0.000 support of 
top 

management 

0.375 0.153 2.450 0.019 

Feedback 0.107 0.161 0.664 0.511 
Continuous 

Improvement 
0.423 0.176 2.399 0.022 

Operations 
and Systems 

0.144 0.158 0.914 0.367 

Human 
Resources 

0.414 0.159 2.602 0.013 

 *The effect is statistically significant at (p≤0.05) . 

 

The results of Table (11) indicate that the correlation coefficient (R = 0.785) indicates the relationship between 
the independent variables and the dependent variable. The effect of the independent variables (Sigma Six Criteria 
criteria) on the dependent variable (health services quality) is statistically significant. The calculated value of F 
was (11.207), and the significance level (Sig = 0.000) is less than 0.05, where the value of the coefficient of 
determination (R2 = 0.616), which indicates that (61.6%) of the variation in (quality of health services) can be 
explained by during the contrast in (Six Sigma curriculum criteria) combined. 

The transactions table showed that the value of B at the dimension (commitment and support of senior 
management) was (0.375) and the value of t at (2.450), and the level of significance (Sig = 0.019), which 
indicates that the effect of this dimension is significant. The value of B at the dimension (feedback and 
measurement) was (0.107) and the value of t at (0.664), and the level of significance (Sig = 0.511), which 
indicates that the effect of this dimension is not significant. The value of B at (Continuous Improvement) was 
(0.423) and t at (2.399), and the level of significance (Sig = 0.022), which indicates that the effect of this 
dimension is significant. The value of B at (processes and systems) dimension (0.144) and t at (0.914), and the 
level of significance (Sig = 0.367), which indicates that the effect of this dimension is not significant. The value 
of B at (HR) dimension (0.414) and t at (2.602), and the level of significance (Sig = 0.013), which indicates that 
the effect of this dimension significant. 

Based on the above, we reject the main hypothesis and accept the alternative hypothesis: 

"There is a statistically significant effect at the level of significance (P≤0.050) of the Sigma Six Approach 

dimensions by its combined dimensions (management commitment and support, reverse feeding and 
measurement, continuous improvement, processes and systems, human resources) on improving the quality of 
health services by collecting them at the Jordanian Ministry of Health". 

15. Discuss and Conclusion 

15.1 Descriptive Analysis of Study Variables (Relative Importance of Study Variables 

1. The results of the descriptive analysis of the independent variable (Sigma Six Criteria) showed, that the Sigma 
Six Criteria in terms of relative importance was average, as well as the analysis showed, that after (Continuous 
Improvement) came first and with relative importance, while (Human Resources) came last. And of relative 
importance. 

2. The results of the descriptive analysis of the dependent variable (the quality of health services) showed that 
the overall average of the quality of health services, by dimensions in terms of relative importance, was the 
average, as well as the analysis showed that after (tangibility) came first, and with relative importance, while 
came after (reliability) in The last rank is of relative importance. 

16. Recommendations 
Based on the previous results, the researcher recommended the following: 

1. The Ministry of Health should pay more attention to the concept, and criteria of Sigma Six curriculum, and its 
application at the level of top management, and its role in the success of this curriculum. 

2. Train all employees in the top management and various levels in these departments on the Sigma Six, 
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standards and provide the necessary financial support, to motivate the employees by linking the use of Sigma Six 
standards, with material and moral incentives. 

3. The top management must set their priorities to develop and improve, the service and adopt new initiatives 
contribute, to improve the levels of service provided in the ministry. 

4. The need to create specialized administrative units to receive complaints and suggestions, from the recipients 
of the service, and give them the opportunity to contribute, to the development and improvement, of performance 
and service by providing an information system, on the service provided, which helps in decision-making 
processes and improve. 

5. Supplying the ministry, with its human needs of medical and technical cadres, expanding the residency 
programs and providing a system of scholarship for comprehensive medical specialties. 

6. The Ministry should carry out more future studies that show the positive effects of the application of the 
Sigma Six criteria on the financial costs of health services and study the possibility of applying these Sigma Six 
approach to human resources management functions. 

7. Researchers should conduct future studies on other variables. 
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Abstract 
Workplace spirituality is a novel concept and it has been identified as a unique way to improve organizational 
performance. On the other hand, many organizations are experiencing undesirable consequences of lack of 
workplace spirituality, such as employee stress, turnover, absenteeism, and lack of employee creativity. Hence, 
organizations are now focusing on developing workplace spirituality in the workplaces as it offers many 
advantages to organizations. Despite the growing interest on workplace spirituality, there is still a dearth of 
research on the topic of workplace spirituality. Literature suggests that employee innovative work behavior 
directly leads to enhance organizational performance and workplace spirituality leads to increase innovativeness 
and creativity of employees. Hence, the purpose of this paper is to fill the gap in literature, to a certain extent by 
proposing a conceptual model to examine the effect of workplace spirituality on employee innovative work 
behavior. Thus, it proposed that there is a positive effect of workplace spirituality on employee innovative work 
behavior. Consequently, intrinsic motivation from componential theory of creativity was integrated to identify 
the mediating effect of intrinsic motivation on the effect of workplace spirituality on innovative work behavior.  
Keywords: workplace spirituality, innovative work behavior, intrinsic motivation 
1. Introduction 
Employee innovative work behavior is essential for long-term survival of organizations (Afsar & Rehman, 2015; 
Oldham & Cumming, 1996) as innovative work behavior is essential for achieving competitive advantage over 
their competitors (Aravamudhan & Krishnaveni, 2014). Innovative work behavior of employees has taken a 
burgeoning interest of employers in organizations due to highly dynamic economic environment, globalization, 
ever changing customer wants in the business environment and rapid change in the market (Akram, Lei & Haider, 
2016; Tajeddini & Trueman, 2008). According to Afsar and Rehman (2015) spirituality of an individual’s 

mindset encourage or motivate creativity and innovativeness within a person and it directly affects organizational 
productivity. Moreover, workplace spirituality brings happiness and joyfulness to the employee and it provides a 
meaningful working environment for the employees (Milliman, Czaplewski & Ferguson, 2003). Today, 
organizations are experiencing negative consequences of lack of workplace spirituality, such as employee stress, 
turnover, and absenteeism which reduces organizational performance (Ashmos & Duchon, 2000; Hassan, Bin 
Nadeem, & Akhter, 2016).  

Previous studies revealed that workplace spirituality positively related with employee work attitudes (Neck & 
Milliman, 1994), employee engagement (Roof, 2015; Saks, 2011), organizational citizenship behavior (Saks, 
2006), intrinsic work satisfaction (Milliman et al, 2003), trust and personal fulfillment (Krishnakumar & Neck, 
2002), and job satisfaction (Lee, Lovelace, & Manz, 2014; Mydin, Kanesan, & Pitchay, 2018; Milliman, et al., 
2003). Further, workplace spirituality increase the productivity of the organization (Fry & Matherly, 2006), 
innovation and creativity of the employees, and employee performance (Giacalone & Jurkiewicz, 2003; 
Jurkiewicz & Giacalone, 2004). Fry (2003) identified that workplace spirituality encourages employee to play 
extra role or pro-social behavior, develop unity within the organization, reduce absenteeism, reduce turnover 
(Milliman et al., 2003; Gatling, Kim, & Milliman, 2016) and decrease employee deviant behavior (Ahmad & 
Omar, 2014). Lee et al. (2014) examined the relationship between workplace spirituality and the ethical climate 
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and identified a significant positive relationship between workplace spirituality and ethical climate. Workplace 
spirituality has a positive impact on decision-making, problem solving capabilities, and greater creativity (Weitz, 
Vardi, & Setter, 2012). Ahmadi, Nami, and Barvarz (2014) posited that workplace spirituality is not related to 
any particular religion or religious system. Moreover, prior studies found that valuing the work is a vital driving 
force to be intrinsically motivate the employee (Fry, 2003; Urdan & Maehr, 1995).  

Though the organizational leaders have understood the importance of innovative work behavior of employees 
and workplace spirituality (De Jong & Den Hartog, 2007; Gupta, Kumar, & Singh, 2014; Rego & Pina e Cunha, 
2008; Saks, 2011), it was not sufficiently studied (Afsar & Rehman, 2015; Duchon & Plowman, 2005; 
Jurkiewicz & Giacalone, 2004). Burgeoning interest on workplace spirituality has led to develop different 
theories and empirical work on workplace spirituality and its outcomes (Kolodinsky, Giacalone, & Jurkiewicz, 
2008; Pawar, 2009). However, dearth of research on the topic of workplace spirituality was highlighted (Gatling 
et al., 2016; Pawer, 2014; Sheep, 2006) especially in the Eastern world (Petchsawang & Duchon, 2009). Besides, 
human beings are not only rational but also emotional and spiritual (Rego & Pina e Cunha, 2008). Hence, the 
objective of the current study was to examine the effect of workplace spirituality on the innovative work 
behavior of employees. Further, intrinsic motivation from componential theory of creativity was integrated to the 
model to identify the mediating effect of intrinsic motivation on the effect of workplace spirituality on innovative 
work behavior. 

To align with the objective of the study, this paper hypothesized a conceptual model for workplace spirituality 
and employee innovative work behavior. The conceptual model was developed based on the literature related to 
the innovative work behavior (as the dependent variable) and workplace spirituality (as the independent variable). 
Employees show creative working behavior when their work is meaningful (Afsar & Rehman, 2015). Moreover, 
intrinsic task motivation is one of the components that enhance individual’s creative behavior (Amabile, 2012; 

Vinarski-Peretz & Carmeli, 2011). Besides, there is a significant positive effect of workplace spirituality on 
intrinsic motivation (Chalofsky & Krishna, 2009; Fry, 2003; Urdan & Maehr, 1995). Hence, the proposed 
conceptual model suggests that intrinsic motivation mediates the effect of workplace spirituality on the 
innovative work behavior of employees.   

The rest of the paper is organized as follows. Section 2 presents the review of literature concerning workplace 
spirituality and innovative work behavior of employees. Next, in Section 3, formulation of hypotheses and the 
development of the conceptual model is discussed. Section 4 presents the theoretical framework and 
methodology of this study is given in Section 5. Then, the implications of this study and directions for future 
research are presented in Section 6. Finally, the conclusion of the study is given in Section 7.  

2. Literature Review 
2.1 Workplace Spirituality 
Workplace spirituality refers to “the recognition that employees have an inner life that nourishes and is 

nourished by meaning work that takes place in the context of community (Ashmos & Duchon, 2000, p.137). 
Belwalkar, Vohra, and Pandey (2018) defined workplace spirituality as the experience which people undergoing 
when seeking meaning in their work and desire to connect with other human beings. According to Harrington 
(2004, p.33) “spirituality is employees’ sharing and experiencing some common attachments and attractions with 

each other within the workplace.” Pawar (2009) explained spirituality as the employee experience that includes 

sense of meaning, community, and transcendence Kolodinsky et al. (2008) referred organizational spirituality as 
employee attitudes towards higher order values and promoting those values to realize collective interest through 
fulfilling an individual’s interests. 

According to Mousa and Alas (2016), the concept of workplace spirituality has become a buzzword in 
contemporary organizations. Further, organizations consist of group of people and the spiritual needs of 
individuals should fulfill accordingly (Krishnalumar & Neck, 2002). Otherwise, individuals become dissatisfied 
and organizational spirituality becomes low. Bringing employees’ heart, soul, mind, and body into one place is 

very much important for both individual and organizational success (Mousa & Alas, 2016). 

Workplace spirituality consists of individual experience with his/her inner feelings (Kinjerski & Skrypnek, 2004) 
and his/her workplace environment (Jurkiewicz & Giacalone, 2004). Workplace spirituality is not about specific 
religion or converting people to a particular religious’ system (Ashmos & Duchon, 2000; Afsar & Rehman, 2015; 
Pourmola, Bagheri, Alinezhad, & Nejad, 2019). According to Fagley and Adler (2012), through workplace 
spirituality, employees can find out their ultimate purpose of life. Thus, it leads to develop connectedness with 
peers and others related to the working environment. Workplace spirituality includes tolerance, feeling of 
interconnectivity, acceptability of the norms in organizations (Afsar & Rehman, 2015), kindness, empathy, and 
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trust (Hassan, Bin Nadeem & Akhter, 2016). According to the review of literature much of the studies defined 
workplace spirituality at individual level (Ashmos & Duchon, 2000; Duchon & Plowman, 2005; Milliman et al., 
2003) and some other studies have defined workplace spirituality at organizational level (Jurkiewicz & 
Giacalone, 2004; Kolodinsky et al., 2003). 

Now a days most of the people are more spiritual not only in their personal life but also in their working life 
(Neck & Milliman, 1994). The benefits of workplace spirituality can be categorized under three levels; 
individual-level, organizational level and societal level (Faro Albuquerque, Campos Cunha, Dias Martins, & 
Brito Sá, 2014). Individual level benefits include the mental and physical fitness of employees, dramatic increase 
in personal growth and self-worth (Krahnke, Giacalone, & Jurkiewicz, 2003), and realization of employee full 
potential (Mitroff & Dentor, 1999). Workplace spirituality leads to an increase in work productivity because it 
creates an enjoyable working experience in the workplace (Janfeshan, Panahy, Veiseh, & Kamari, 2011). 
According to Neck and Milliman (1994) organizations focusing on spiritual values tend to provide more 
opportunities to employees for their personal growth and development. Furthermore, it was observed that 
workplace spirituality leads to increase feeling toward others and it acts as a weapon that attracts and retain 
employees within the organization (Giacalone & Jurkiewicz, 2003; Jena & Pradhan, 2018). Enhancing trust 
among people (Neck & Milliman, 1994) and increasing interconnectedness (Daniel, 2015) create a more 
motivated organizational working environment as benefits of workplace spirituality. Workplace spirituality is 
very much important not only because it leads to enhance personal growth but also to increase the psychological 
contract between employers and employees (Ahiauzu & Asawo, 2012). Simply, the goals of the spirituality are to 
reach a higher personal potential that leads to greater employee creativity, commitment, and motivation (Osman‐

Gani, Hashim, & Ismail, 2013). Pandey, Gupta, and Arora (2009) identified workplace spirituality as an 
employee friendly working environment which mainly focuses on employee spirit. Moreover, Fairholm (1996) 
identified organizations as spiritual entities because employees spend more hours at the workplace. According to 
Brown (2003) organizational spirituality leads to improve integrity, introduce ethics to the workplace, motivate 
emotional competencies, and establish specific groups in the workplace and empowering the workforce.  

Different scholars see workplace spirituality as a multi-faceted construct (Hussain & Sharma, 2012; Singh & 
Mishra, 2016). There are six dimensions of workplace spirituality, namely, 1) inner life 2) meaning and purpose 
in work 3) a sense of connection and community 4) block of spirituality 5) personal responsibility and 6) positive 
connection with other individual and contemplation (Ashmos & Duchon, 2000). However, Milliman et al. (2003) 
did some modifications to these dimensions and introduced three new dimensions that mainly focus on 
motivation and psychology. Meaningful at work focus on individual level was the first dimension (Janfeshan et 
al., 2011). The sense of community was the second dimension focusing on the community level. The third 
dimension was organizational values which aligned with the organizational level. Some scholars categorized 
workplace spirituality into three camps based on the definitions, such as individual experience and organizational 
facilitation and a mix of both (Petchsawang & McLean, 2017). According to Burack (1999) workplace 
spirituality has three main components, namely internal, external and integrated. 

2.2 Intrinsic Motivation 
Intrinsic motivation refers to the degree of interest or enjoyment that an individual is experiencing when 
performing a work task without being controlled by external factors (Saeed, Afsar, Shahjehan, & Shah, 2019). 
According to Legault (2016), intrinsic motivation refers to engaging in the behavior that is inherently enjoyable 
and intrinsically motivated action that is not separable from the behavior. For instance, children play outdoor 
games (such as running, jumping) not for any reason just because of their fun and internal satisfaction. Ryan and 
Deci (2000) found that enjoyment and psychological well-being as some benefits of intrinsic motivation. 
Nevertheless, the social environment should play an important role to flourish the intrinsic motivation and this 
can be done by influencing perceived autonomy and competence. For an example, when supervisors give 
positive feedback to their employees, intrinsic motivation of those employees rises. However, to have more 
fruitful results employees should have autonomy and feel competent in performing the action. 

Componential theory of creativity (Amabile, 2013) identified three components of creativity namely domain 
relevant skills, creativity relevant process, and task motivation. According to Amabile, intrinsic motivation 
involves activity of interest, enjoyment and personal sense of challenge and this is only not sufficient to get 
favorable creative outcomes (Vinarski-Peretz & Carmeli, 2011). Intrinsic motivation is an important condition 
for innovative work behavior because it influence employee’s cognition, behavior and emotions and directly 
affect their performance (Saeed, Afsar, Shahjehan, & Shah, 2019; Zhou & George, 2003). When employee 
behavior is controlled by intrinsic motivation, his/her actions become more stabilize and his/her performance 
goes up. According to Jaussi and Dionne (2003) employee creative performance increase when they are 
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intrinsically motivated. Saeed, Afsar, Shahjehan, and Shah (2019) also highlighted that intrinsic motivators are 
bound up with the work itself. 

2.3 Innovative Work Behavior 
Innovative work behavior is considered as a very important tool that leads to gain competitive advantage over 
competitors in this knowledge-driven economy as no organization can survive without having continuous 
innovation (Mayfield & Mayfield, 2014). Innovative work behavior refers to deliberately introducing new ideas 
and implement those ideas with the behavior modification to increase organizational as well as employee’s 

performance (De Jong & Den Hartog, 2007). Employee creativity and innovative work behavior are two 
different concepts. Innovative work behavior focusses on discovery, recognition, generation, development, 
modification, adaption and implementation of ideas (King & Anderson, 2002; Scott & Bruce, 1994) while 
creativity involved with novel, new and useful ideas (Scott & Bruce, 1994). According to Singh and Sarkar 
(2019) innovative work behavior means the employee’s ability to find new ideas, promote them and to 

implement new ideas.  

Innovative work behavior consists of three steps namely idea generation, idea promotion, and idea realization 
(Rahman, Osman-Gani, Momen, & Islam, 2015). Idea generation happens when employees produce new ideas, 
whereas idea promotion means finding supporters surrounding the ideas and idea realization involves producing 
a prototype, which can test by individuals or organizations (Rahman, Osman-Gani, Momen, & Islam, 2015). 
Moreover, De Jong and Den Hartog (2010) introduced another step as idea implementation that transform 
creative ideas into innovative ideas. There are many benefits of innovative work behavior including increasing 
work engagement, declining work-life conflicts (Abstein, Heidenreich, & Spieth, 2014), and increasing 
organizational effectiveness (Basadur, 2004). Most of the organizations use employee innovation ideas as 
building blocks to produce new products or services in their organizations (De Jong & Den Hartog, 2007).  

Previous study findings have indicated employee innovative work behavior highly dependent on their 
relationship with their peers, subordinates, supervisors and the clients (Anderson, De Dreu, & Nijstad, 2004). 
Moreover, employees are able to enhance their business performance through their ability to create and translate 
their ideas to successful business outcomes (Pradhan & Jena, 2019). The importance of innovative work 
behavior of employees has encouraged researchers to examine the impact of different factors such as personality 
types, leadership styles, and working environment on innovative work behavior (Pelz & Andrews, 1966). 
Moreover, a plethora of studies revealed that there is a positive impact of transformational leadership on 
employee innovative behavior (Afsar, Badir, & Bin Saeed, 2014). Some scholars have examined the relationship 
between innovative work behavior and organizational resources (Spreitzer, 1995; Madjar, 2008), climate for 
innovation (Scott & Bruce, 1994), personality (George & Zhou, 2001), self-efficacy (Axtell, Holman, Unsworth, 
Wall, Waterson, & Harrington, 2000), problem solving skills (Scott & Bruce, 1994), transformational leadership 
(Masood & Afsar, 2017; Pieterse, Knippenberg, Schippers, & Stam, 2009). However, the review of literature 
highlighted that workplace spirituality is not sufficiently studied (Afsar & Rehman, 2015; Duchon & Plowman, 
2005; Jurkiewicz & Giacalone, 2004). Even though there is a burgeoning interest on workplace spirituality 
(Kolodinsky, Giacalone, & Jurkiewicz, 2008; Pawar, 2009), little research has been carried out on the topic of 
workplace spirituality (Gatling et al., 2016; Pawer, 2014; Sheep, 2006). Hence, by developing a conceptual 
model and by statistically validating the model, researcher contribute to fill the gap of workplace spirituality 
literature to a certain extent.  

3. Hypotheses of the Study 
3.1 Workplace Spirituality and Innovative Work Behavior 
Most of the prior research focused on the benefits of workplace spirituality (Quatro, 2004). It was found that 
workplace spirituality positively affects organizational performance (Quatro, 2002), profitability (Duchan & 
Plowman, 2005), organizational commitment (Fry, Vitucci, & Cedillo, 2005), job involvement and 
organizational based self-esteem (Milliman et al., 2003). According to Milliman et al. (2003), meaningful work 
is expected to be related to individual attitudes towards the organization. Employees exhibit creative behavior 
(Jung, Chow, & Wu, 2003), discretionary behavior such as innovative work behavior (Pierce, Gardner, 
Cummings, & Dunham, 1989), and they try to do changes in the work place accepting challenges (Afsar & 
Rehman, 2015) when they find meaning in work. Moreover, employees try to understand the problems in a way 
that is more rigorous and try to search for more solutions when they perceive that their work roles are important 
in the organization, (Gilson & Shalley, 2004). Besides, some other research posited that workplace spirituality 
assist achieving sense of purpose, encourage creativity, and in turn leads to motivate innovative work behavior 
(Pawar, 2009; Gupta et al. 2014; Afsar & Rehman 2015). Based on the above justification, hypothesis one (H1) is 
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proposed: 

H1: Workplace spirituality has a significant positive effect on innovative work behavior.  

3.2 Mediating Role of Intrinsic Motivation on the Relationship Between Workplace Spirituality and Innovative 
Work Behavior 
Intrinsic motivation refers to the will and energy that leads to the behavior or the interest and the pleasure or 
satisfaction that employee gets when he/she engaged in an activity (Saeed et al., 2019). According to Saeed et al. 
intrinsic motivation affects employee’s emotions, behavior, and cognition. Accordingly, it leads to enhance more 

stable and better performance. When an employee intrinsically attracts to an activity, he/she is focused on it and 
tries to do experiments with it and this leads to having more creative behavior (Jaussi & Dionne, 2003). Intrinsic 
motivation is one of the components in the componential theory of creativity which leads to uplift the 
individual’s creative behavior. Further, when employees try to find out the final meaning and the purpose of 
his/her work, it motivates employees to do differences within the working environment (Afsar & Rehman, 2015). 
The link between meaning at work [workplace spirituality] and intrinsic work motivation was established in very 
early research as well (Hackman & Oldham, 1976). Well-established self-determination theory also highlighted 
that employee freedom, competence, and relatedness in their work activities leads to intrinsic motivation (Ryan 
& Deci, 2000) When employees think their task as interesting and meaningful, they engage with it in a 
psychological freedom that enhance intrinsic motivation (Steger, Dik, & Duffy, 2012; Hackman & Oldham, 
1976). Workplace spirituality leads to share power, trust and flexibility which leads to improve intrinsic 
motivation (Afsar, Badir, & Kiani, 2016; Chalofsky & Krishna, 2009). Based on the above justification, 
hypothesis two (H2), hypothesis three (H3), and hypothesis four (H4) are proposed:  

H2: Workplace spirituality has a significant positive effect on intrinsic motivation.  

H3: Intrinsic motivation has a significant positive effect on innovative work behavior 

H4: When intrinsic motivation is high, workplace spirituality has a stronger effect on innovative work behavior. 
4. Theoretical Framework  
Based on the comprehensive review of literature, it was clear that there is an impact of workplace spirituality on 
innovative working behavior. When workplace spirituality level increases, the innovative working behavior also 
increases. In addition, workplace spirituality has an impact on intrinsic motivation and intrinsic motivation has 
an impact on innovative work behavior. Further, intrinsic motivation influences the relationship between 
workplace spirituality and innovative working behavior. Therefore, based on literature the conceptual model 
developed for the current study is given in Figure 1: 

 
 
 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Figure 1. Conceptual model 

 
5. Implications and Directions for Future Research 
As the impact of workplace spirituality and innovative work behavior was not addressed to date, this study offers 
important implications to theory and practice. . It is very much important to identify the factors that foster 
innovative work behavior of employees as the human resource in an organization vary according to their culture, 
family and educational background (Afsar & Rehman, 2015). Thus, this study may assist to understand the 
drivers of innovative work behavior among employees through workplace spirituality and intrinsic motivation. 
Up until to date, most of the research on spirituality at work has focused at individual level. This study is 
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amongst the few studies that attempts to examine workplace spirituality at the organizational level on innovative 
work behavior of employees. The model developed in the current study considered only two factors; workplace 
spirituality and intrinsic motivation as the factors that promote innovative work behavior. Future research needs 
to be done to examine other factors that may have an impact on innovative work behavior.  

6. Conclusion  
The objective of this study was to develop and validate a theoretical model to understand the effect that 
workplace spirituality has on innovative work behavior and how intrinsic motivation influence the impact of 
workplace spirituality on innovative work behavior. It is theorized that when workplace spirituality is high in the 
organization, the innovative work behavior of employees tends to be high. Furthermore, literature argued that 
intrinsic motivation has an influence on the effect of workplace spirituality on innovative work behavior of 
employees. Thus, based on the literature the theoretical model was hypothesized. The model developed will be 
empirically tested in future research for its statistical validity. 
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Abstract 
Using the 2013 World Bank Enterprise Survey Data for Uganda, this paper employs the logit and quintile 
estimation technique to explain the relationship between tax administration and entrepreneurial performance 
among SMEs in Uganda. The study also employed interviews to obtain expert opinion about tax administration 
and also explain the results of logit models. Our results indicate that tax rate positively and significantly affect 
entrepreneurial performance, while tax administration has no effect on entrepreneurial performance. Other key 
factors that promote entrepreneurial performance include access to credit, firm age, male ownership, training and 
participation in exporting. Our results suggest that efforts to incentivize and set a conducive tax rate, ease of 
access to financing and training need to be strengthened for higher entrepreneurial performance among SMEs in 
Uganda. 

Keywords: tax administration, SME performance, Uganda 
1. Introduction 
1.1 Problem Introduction 
Tax administration is vital for economic performance in both government revenue collection and business 
performance (Godin & Hindriks, 2015; Kangave, Nakato, Waiswa & Zzimbe, 2016). Tax administration in 
Uganda has gradually improved from manual forms to electronic system where tax payers need to access tax 
information at their convenience and consult on tax matters 24 hours using the toll free line. Furthermore, URA 
opened up a number of fora for tax education and sensitization for instance; URA launched ‘Ask URA’ mobile 

application with Mobile Telephone Network Company (MTN), URA conducts workshops and seminars to 
vendors and landlords (Uganda Revenue Authority Annual Report, 2015/2016). The efforts are in the spirit of 
improving tax compliance with minimum cost to the tax payer. It can be argued that once the compliance cost in 
terms of efforts, time and monetary losses to SMEs are minimized, the resources saved may be utilized by SMEs 
for market penetration hence increased sales or financing working capital or any other SME activity. 

Despite the fact that URA has endeavored to administratively simplify the tax system, the cost of compliance is 
still a problem to SMEs. Some SME entrepreneurs are illiterate, therefore, they need to hire tax consultants to 
help them file returns and interpret trade laws and regulations especially for custom purposes. Besides hiring tax 
consultants, the internet supply in Uganda is not reliable, or in other cases the cost of internet adds extra burden 
to SME operators. Furthermore, despite the numerous complaints made by traders about delayed administrative 
feedback (Kato, 2017) especially in clearing imports at various customs points, URA has not yet established a 
proper solution. In addition, taxes such as Value Added Tax (VAT) require filing monthly returns, this alone may 
be cumbersome to SMEs because of the costs of filing returns and the implications if the tax payer defaults. 
Therefore, there is high compliance encumbrance which tends to divert SMEs resources from entrepreneurial 
performance. It has not yet been established in Uganda’s context whether the wasted time (delayed feedback and 
delay in understanding customs regulations and procedures) and money while endeavoring to comply for tax can 
impact on SME innovations, working capital, sales volume and market share. In other words, it is not yet clear 
whether tax administration can be an obstacle to SMEs’ performance in Uganda, and to what extent it can be. 

However, in South Africa’s construction industry, a study by Matarirano, Chiloane-Tsoke and Makina (2019) 
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established that, while internal tax compliance costs (such as; employing extra personnel to handle filing of 
returns, time and procedure to understanding the compliance procedure and issuing of invoices) are positive and 
significantly related to firm performance, the external tax compliance costs (such as; hiring professional 
accounting firms, clearing agents and buying internet services) are negative and significantly related to firm 
performance. And, whereas the Matarirano et al; (2019) study was about the construction sector, the World Bank 
Enterprise survey (2013) where secondary data was obtained for analysis was not limited in scope. The survey 
considered both manufacturing and service sector firms in Uganda. 

This study set out to investigate the relationship between tax administration (as an obstacle or not obstacle) and 
tax rates on firm performance taking into consideration other firm and entrepreneurial characteristics and the 
business environment. The firm performance measures were discussed by Yu (2013) and Bosma, Van Praag and 
Wit (2002). The same measures were tested in Uganda’s informal economy by Kintu (2017). 

Despite the improvements made by URA to ensure convenient and cost effective tax administration, there are 
still aspects of delayed decision making by revenue officers and bureaucratic tendencies (Kato, 2017). These tax 
administrative challenges may affect performance of SMEs in terms of time wastage or cash flow stagnation in 
case a decision requires monetary compensation or release of trader’s goods for the market. This may impact on 
entrepreneurial performance. Moreover, there is relative research paucity about tax administration and 
entrepreneurial performance in Uganda’s SME sector. The study by Dabla-Norris, Misch, Cleary, and Khwaja 
(2017) was not country specific. 

The objective of this study was to establish the effect of tax administration and selected firm and owners’ 

characteristics on firm performance in Uganda using the World Bank Enterprise Survey data. From the reviewed 
studies, it implies that there is need to understand the importance of tax compliance cost on SMEs’ performance. 

This has policy implication regarding tax administration and tax rates for firm performance. In addition, the 
study contributes to literature since there is literature dearth about tax administration and tax rates on firm 
performance in Uganda. 

Section 1.2 reviews the selected literature. The data and empirical strategy are described in section 2. Section 3 
presents empirical findings and section 4 discusses the study findings, while section 5 presents the concluding 
remarks. 

1.2 Literature   
Uganda has structured business licensing to facilitate business start-ups. The Uganda Investment Authority was 
formed to ensure that all investors operate legally within Uganda. Furthermore, different sectors have unique 
laws governing licensing in those sectors. For instance, financial institutions are governed by the Financial 
Institutions Act (2004) with its subsequent amendments. In the same way, the mining sector is regulated by the 
Uganda Mining Act (2003). In addition, to facilitate an easy registration of patents and business undertakings, 
Uganda Registration Services Bureau (URBS) was formed by an Act of parliament in 1998. The URBS is 
responsible for civil registration, business registration, patents, intellectual property rights and other activities as 
required by law. 

Besides registration, taxation and customs laws and regulations are in place. For instance, the Value Added Tax 
Act (1996) streamlines the operations of VAT domestically and at customs, the East African Customs 
Management Act (2004) together with the East African Customs Management (Amendment) Bill (2015) 
streamline the operations of customs activities at all East African border points. In addition, the Common 
External Tariff (CET) was established to guide on all duties for commodities imported from outside the East 
African Community. It is imperative to know that today, under the Tax Payer Registration Expansion Program 
(TREP), Small and Medium Size Enterprises (SMEs) are required to register for both business licensing and tax 
at one point. This implies that all SMEs leave the registration point with both the business operational license 
and the Tax Identification Number (TIN).   

It is argued that, World over, formality is not a major goal for SMEs. They focus on expanding sales. Whereas 
tax and local authorities want SMEs to be registered and formalize their operations in order to collect tax 
revenue, SMEs want to remain informal to avoid paying taxes. It has been observed in Lima that obtaining a 
trading license does not guarantee increase in firm revenue (Alcazar, Andrade & Jaramillo, 2010). Therefore, 
SMEs find no urgency in formalization. Moreover, obtaining a license involves costs in terms of monetary 
payments to local authorities and wasted time. Furthermore, trade is hampered by inconsistent collection of 
duties which influences traders to issue bribes to customs officials (United States Country Commercial Guides, 
2017). Although the government of Uganda through Uganda Investment Authority (UIA) introduced one- 
stop-center for registering businesses, the business registration period is an average of twenty six days (World 
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Bank, 2016). This is still a long period of time. The United Nations Doing Business report (2017) indicates that 
the efficiency and quality of regulatory framework in Sub-Saharan Africa is still low at 56.5% and 36.7% on the 
Distance to Frontier (DTF) score. Therefore, the tax administrative system may be bypassed with irregular 
payments to favor some business operators at expense of others.  

In addition, another conundrum originates from unrealistic tax rates. The high tax rates may also induce irregular 
payments because people feel that to survive in business, pay irregularly at below the rates. Furthermore, it can 
be argued that the tax rates imposed can hinder firm performance, for instance, the excise duty imposed on items 
can increase the selling price of an item, which may reduce the sales volume. The empirical findings of Gatsi, 
Gadzo and Kportorgbi, (2013) among Ghanaian manufacturing firms indicate that whenever tax burden increases, 
the firm’s financial performance declines. Thus, whenever tax rates especially under the indirect tax regimes 

increase, there is expected reduction in firm clientele and sales hence more pressure on firm cash flows. 
Furthermore, in Malaysia, the Goods and Services Tax (GST) have slowed down the sales of the shipbuilding 
and ship repairing business (Sim, 2019). 

Whereas tax/duty collection and business registration has been made easy through online platforms (online filing 
of returns and online business registration), business community is complaining about bribery and irregular 
payments (World Economic Forum, 2017). Moreover, public servants are corrupt (Enterprise Survey Uganda, 
2013), this is coupled with bureaucratic hurdles which hamper efficiency (Investment Climate Statement, 2017; 
United States Commercial Guides, 2017).  

It is based on the bribery, bureaucratic, high tax rates and inefficient ways of operation that the authors envisage 
that tax administration, tax rates and business licensing can hinder firm performance. Furthermore, delays in 
obtaining information wastes traders productive time, slows decision making in business hence low productivity 
and performance. For instance, innovation time is wasted, cash is used for bribes instead of funding the firm’s 

liquid requirements.   
Uganda like any other East African state has structured the customs procedures following the East African 
customs protocol. Before the protocol, each member state was following her own customs procedures. However, 
today, the common customs laws to all East African customs points were introduced. Laws such as; the East 
African Customs Management Act (2004) together with the East African Customs Management (Amendment) 
Bill (2015) regulate customs business at all East African border points.  In addition, the Uganda National 
Bureau of Standard regulations (2015) are provided to guide the inspection of imports and exports to ensure 
compliance with international standards and to confirm the quality of imports. The Uganda National Bureau of 
Standards introduced a Pre-Export Verification of Conformity (PVoC) following the World Trade Organisation’s 

notification requirements and the Technical Barriers to Trade (TBT) article 5. The PVoC requires that all goods 
imported to Uganda are inspected for quality in the country of Origin. However, the clearance requirement 
challenges traders since they buy and import merchandise from open market rather than manufacturers (Musoke, 
2012). 

Furthermore, to ensure that customs regulations are implemented in a proper and efficient manner, new 
technology such as single customs territory has been introduced. The single customs territory enables traders to 
comply with customs procedures, and pay customs taxes at one entry point within a maximum of two days 
(World Bank, 2017; Nakaweesi, 2018). In addition, United Nations Doing Business report (2017) indicates that 
URA introduced one-stop center at Malaba in effort to expedite customs clearing processes.  On top of these 
initiatives is the ASYCUDA World, the technology which is an enabler of efficient customs clearance process. 
Although the regulatory framework and technology has facilitated the reduction in hindrances at customs entry 
points, for instance, reduced time for customs processes and reduced time for client contact with the customs 
officers, the systems can only operate on internet. It is not prudent to assume that every place in Uganda has 
stable internet. 

Important to state, most people in business community are not conversant with the customs regulations. They 
survive at the mercy of clearing agents who sometimes may not offer satisfactory advice, hence tax disputes 
between URA and the tax payer. It is also important to understand that although Uganda has a clear mechanism 
to address tax disputes between tax payers and URA provided in the Tax Procedure Code Act (2014), Uganda’s 

commercial court is perceived to favor politically connected firms where such firms induce bribes to judges to 
delay cases or rule in their favor (United States Country Commercial Guides, 2017). In addition, the World 
Economic Forum (2016) indicates that border administration in Uganda is not transparent, has a lot of irregular 
payments and the clearance process is inefficient. Moreover, the main problem facing tax authorities in African 
countries in tax administration is corruption (Dube, 2014). 
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The operations at customs guided by the customs regulations have led to significant improvement in efficiency at 
customs entry and exit points. Bogachkova, Usachyova and Usachyov (2019) argue that, a well simplified 
system of tax reporting of entrepreneurs improves SMEs business activities. However, there numerous 
challenges such as; the inadequate awareness of the regulations by business community, yet, tax awareness is 
positive and significantly related to tax compliance (Omondi & Theuri, 2019).  Unstable internet services, 
delays caused by customs officers and delays caused by disputes between URA and tax payers. The delays and 
impromptu bribes affect business performance. It can be argued that if time is lost at customs point, importers’ 

sales will drop. It can further be argued that bribes, extra charges and time wastage during the appeal procedure 
can be a hindrance to firm sales, profitability or working capital.  

2. Methodology and Data  
2.1 Methodology 
To establish the effect of tax administration and tax rates on SMEs’ performance, the logit model was estimated. 
After obtaining results of the logit model, interviews were conducted to explain specifically; how tax 
administration affect the sales of a firm? How tax rates affect the sales of a firm? And how importers perceive 
the customs procedures at Uganda boarders? This is sequential explanatory research approach. The mixed 
methods ensure triangulation of methodologies (Johnson & Onwuegbuzie, 2004).  

Besides tax administration, other factors which can affect performance are; operating expenses such as rent, 
salaries, financial charges and utilities. The effect of tax administration on selected firm and industrial 
characteristics on SMEs’ performance are examined by estimating the following model: 

iiiiii OwnerIndustryFirmTaxadPerm ������ ������ 43210        (1) 

From Equation 1, Permi   denotes firm performance. For this study, firm performance is measured by working 
capital, cumulative employment and sales volume. Taxad denotes tax administration, which is binary and is 
coded as ‘1’ if tax administration has no effect and ‘0’ if otherwise. Firm denotes firm characteristics which 
include firm size and firm age. Industrial factors include; firm location and type of business. Owner denotes 
whether firm owner is male or female and ε is the normally distributed error term.  

For qualitative interviews, purposive sampling was employed to select the customs officers and customs agents 
who are engaged in customs business. SME managers were included because they import goods and services. 
The interviews intended to explain the results obtained from the quantitative logit modelling. The sample size is 
twenty respondents and this is considered adequate (Creswell, 2013). The customs boarder points considered for 
the study are: Busia and Malaba in Eastern Uganda and Mutukula in Southern Uganda. The choice of these entry 
points is for their being busy with clearing imports. 

Before conducting interviews, interviewees’ consent was sought and each interview took a maximum of twenty 

minutes. The interviewers also assured the respondents that they were not under any threat. 

Whereas the quantitative data was obtained from World Bank Enterprise survey for Uganda (2013) thus 
requiring no validity and reliability tests, an interview guide was subjected to peer review and debriefing, 
ensuring adequate sample size, transparency and credibility in handling data. Finally analysis for qualitative 
interviews was conducted through coding and creating themes. 

2.2 Data Description 
This study uses the 2013 WBES data for Uganda which was collected between January and August 2013. The 
survey employed stratified random sampling technique so as to: 1) get rid of biased estimates for the entire 
population; 2) get rid of biased estimates for different subdivisions of the population with a given degree of 
informed precision; 3) ensure that different sectors are well represented in the final sample; and 4) benefit from 
the precision associated with population estimates in stratified sampling as opposed to simple random sampling 
among others. The survey was based on a sampling frame obtained from Uganda Bureau of Statistics. In terms 
of stratification, the survey employed three levels of stratification that is region, size and industry. Specifically, 
in terms of the region, the survey was undertaken in Jinja (central Eastern Uganda), Kampala (City found in 
central Uganda), Lira (Northern Uganda), Mbale (Eastern Uganda), Mbarara (Western Uganda) and Wakiso 
(Central Uganda). In terms of size, the survey covered small, medium and large enterprises. Small enterprises 
comprised of firms with 5 to 19 employees, medium enterprises compromised of firms with 20 to 99 employees 
while large firms had 100+ employees. The data was collected from only formal (registered) companies with 5 or 
more employees.  
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With regard to our study, we have a sample of 698 SMEs of which, 324 SMEs were surveyed in the 
manufacturing sector which included food, textiles, garments, tobacco, leather, wood, paper, publishing, printing, 
and recorded media, refined petroleum products, chemicals, plastics and rubber, non-metallic mineral products, 
basic metals, fabricated metal products, machinery and equipment, electronics, precision instruments, transport 
machines, furniture and recycling.  

The key study variables used in the empirical analysis include firm age. Unlike other study Pervan, Pervan and 
Curak (2017) in Croatia food industry indicates that firm age has a significant negative relationship with firm 
performance. This study only examined the linear effect of age on firm performance. Furthermore, Coad, 
Daunnfeldt and Halvarsson (2017) established that new firms strive to grow in sales level, however, after some 
few years, growth loses momentum. However, the current study takes into account the nonlinear effect of age on 
firm performance.  

Also, the study employs firm size following Perez-Quiros and Timmerman (2000) who contend that small firms 
have a lower return on stocks during recession compared to large firms. This implies that small firms face more 
liquidity problems compared to large firms. Furthermore, Capenter and Petersen (2002) in the study of ‘is the 

growth of small firms constrained by internal financing?’ concluded that the growth of small firms is constrained 

by internal financing. Implying that whenever small firms have constraints in liquidity, sales, market share, and 
assets level can be low.  

In addition, this study employs firm location to examine firm performance following Holmes (1999) who argues 
that firms that locate in places of high population growth experience increased local production. He concluded 
that as population increases, a set of goods expand. Firms tend to locate where tax rates are lower compared to 
places of higher tax rates. This is basically because some tax rates affect business cash flows for instance excise 
duty. Fossen and Steiner (2014) established that the variation in elasticity of local business tax among Germany 
municipalities is -0.45.  

Gender of the owner is also used to examine firm performance following Coleman (2007). Women owned firms 
find it difficult to secure external capital which humpers their business growth compared to men (Coleman, 
2007). De Mel, McKenzie and Woodruff (2009) established that men invest both the small and large grants while 
women only invest large grants. Men can earn more return by 6.5-14% while women do not get a return (De Mel 
et al., 2009). 

3. Results 
Table 1 provides the summary statistics for the key selected study variables. Firm performance is measured as a 
firm’s total annual sales in the fiscal year prior to the survey divided by the number of permanent full time 
employees at the firm in the fiscal year prior to the survey. The mean sales is UGX 6,330 million. The minimum 
and maximum firm sales is UGX 400,000 and UGX 9, 7000 million respectively. Firm age defines the number of 
years a firm has been in existence. The mean age of the firms is 15 years to suggest that on average many of the 
firms are mid-aged. The youngest and oldest firm is 2 and 87 years old respectively. On average 31 percent of 
firms are managed by female managers. Export measures a firm’s export status and it takes a value of ‘1’ if a 

firm exports otherwise ‘0’. One average 8 percent of firms engage in exports. Use of website and emails for 

business were coded as ‘1’ and ‘0’ otherwise. On average 18 percent of firms have own websites and 39 percent 
use email for business. On average 88 percent of firms are domestically owned, 4 percent are jointly owned, 
while 8 percent are foreign owned.   
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Table 1. Summary statistics for the study variable 

Variable N Mean Sd Cv Min  Max 
Firm sales 460 6.33E+09 5.1E+10 8.06 400000 9.75E+11 
Female owner 689 0.31 0.46 1.48 0 1 
Years of experience 670 13.37 8.21 0.61 1 41 
Firm age 646 15.17 9.9 0.65 2 87 
Exporter  698 0.08 0.27 3.36 0 1 
Domestic ownership 695 0.88 0.33 0.38 0 1 
Joint ownership 695 0.04 0.2 4.88 0 1 
Foreign ownership 695 0.08 0.28 3.32 0 1 
Access to credit 606 0.61 0.49 0.8 0 1 
Medium firm 698 0.33 0.47 1.43 0 1 
Use website 692 0.21 0.41 1.96 0 1 
Use email 691 0.39 0.49 1.25 0 1 
Tax rate 693 0.61 0.49 0.8 0 1 
Tax admin 696 0.56 0.5 0.88 0 1 
Customs  686 0.46 0.5 1.08 0 1 
Training  693 0.7 0.46 0.66 0 1 
Ltd company 679 0.08 0.27 3.44 0 1 
Sole proprietor 679 0.68 0.47 0.68 0 1 
Partnership 679 0.24 0.43 1.78 0 1 
Licensed business 696 0.49 0.5 1.01 0 1 
Registered at startup 666 0.6 0.49 0.81 0 1 
Working capital 662 5.91 13.82 2.34 0 100 
Source: Authors’ tabulation from WBES (2013) 

 

Table 2 presents the mean difference analysis for the study variables to explore the difference between male and 
female owned firms. It can be observed that age, access to credit and source of financing are key factors that 
differentiate between male and female owned firms. 

 

Table 2. Summary statistics for differences between male and female firm owners 

   99%***, 95%**,  90%*CI 
Variables G1(0) Mean1 G2(Yes) Mean2 Mean Diff 
Firm sales 301 8.200e+09 154 2.700e+09 5.500e+09 
Male owner 457 13.02 207 14.13 -1.102 
Years of experience 434 14.51 203 16.37 -1.867** 
Firm age 473 0.0820 216 0.0740 0.00800 
Domestic ownership 471 0.877 216 0.894 -0.0170 
Joint ownership 471 0.0280 216 0.0560 -0.028* 
Foreign ownership 471 0.0960 216 0.0510 0.045** 
Access to credit 413 0.579 187 0.679 -0.100** 
Medium firm 473 0.334 216 0.306 0.0280 
Use website 469 0.179 215 0.251 -0.072** 
Use email 469 0.341 213 0.484 -0.142*** 
Tax rate 469 0.597 215 0.651 -0.0540 
Tax admin 472 0.544 215 0.614 -0.069* 
Customs  464 0.459 213 0.460 -0.00100 
Training  471 0.724 213 0.667 0.0570 
Ltd company 461 0.0560 212 0.118 -0.062*** 
Sole proprietor 461 0.748 212 0.557 0.192*** 
Partnership 461 0.195 212 0.325 -0.130*** 
Licensed business 472 0.479 216 0.528 -0.0490 
Registered at startup 450 0.609 207 0.580 0.0290 
Working capital 453 5.113 204 7.838 -2.726** 
Source: Authors’ tabulation from WBES (2013) 

 

3.1 Empirical Results 
From Table 3 while this article provides better understanding of the effect of tax administration taking into 
account tax rate on SME performance in Uganda (Model 1 and 2), for the 25th percentile (low performance firms) 
and 75th percentile. Note, that the 50th percentile results are equivalent to the OLS results (Model 1). Therefore, 
the effect of tax administration on firm performance is examined taking into account firm and business 
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environment characteristics. The use of quintile analysis in this article is to enable us to understand whether the 
relationship between tax administration and firm performance is uniform across different quintiles; as the sales 
of firms varies significant despite being the same size.   

 

Table 3. Estimated impact of tax administration on firm performance 

  99%***, 95%**,  90%*CI 
 Model 1 Model 2 Model 3 
Variables OLS (0.5) 0.25 0.75 
Tax administration not an obstacle 0.201 0.094 -0.311 
 (0.180) (0.531) (0.102) 
Tax rate not an obstacle 0.016* 0.028* 0.507*** 
 (0.077) (0.054) (0.008) 
Male owner 0.094 0.039 0.208 
 (0.555) (0.806) (0.289) 
Firm age 0.033 0.153*** 0.103*** 
 (0.293) (0.000) (0.008) 
Firm age squared -0.037 -0.456*** -0.185* 
 (0.657) (0.000) (0.081) 
Exporter  0.759** 1.054*** 0.389 
 (0.011) (0.001) (0.293) 
Firm ownership (RC: Domestic)    
Both  domestic and foreign 0.292 0.315 -0.143 
 (0.455) (0.413) (0.765) 
Foreign ownership 1.576*** 1.034*** 0.705* 
 (0.000) (0.001) (0.060) 
Access to credit 0.165 0.044 0.498*** 
 (0.274) (0.768) (0.007) 
Medium firms 0.972*** 0.480*** 0.378* 
 (0.000) (0.004) (0.069) 
Firm uses website 0.666*** 1.248*** 1.172*** 
 (0.003) (0.000) (0.000) 
Firm uses email 0.492*** 0.533*** 0.600*** 
 (0.009) (0.004) (0.009) 
Customs  0.095 0.212 -0.128 
 (0.525) (0.153) (0.486) 
Training  -0.441*** -0.358** -0.412** 
 (0.007) (0.026) (0.039) 
Firm legal status (RC: LTD Company)   
Sole proprietor -1.030*** -0.704*** -1.583*** 
 (0.000) (0.006) (0.000) 
Partnership -0.086 -0.238 -0.111 
 (0.752) (0.376) (0.740) 
Business licensed -0.185 -0.291** -0.211 
 (0.215) (0.048) (0.248) 
Constant 18.20*** 16.40*** 19.32*** 
 (0.000) (0.000) (0.000) 
Observations 369 367 367 
R-squared 0.180 0.139 0.208 
 

Besides the quantitative modeling, qualitative interviews were conducted and data analysed for the purpose of 
explaining the quantitative results in table 3. The response rate was 95% and obtained from customs officers, 
customs agents and business community. The data was carefully edited, cleaned and well coded. 

4. Discussion of Findings 
The descriptive statistics from Table 1 indicate that on average, 18% of firms use websites and 39% of firms use 
emails. This implies that all other firms find difficulties in communicating with URA since URA commonly uses 
emails in effecting communication with the tax payers. Besides, firms which do not use emails and websites find 
it difficult to access relevant information on URA website. The findings further imply that many firms in Uganda 
may not be having internet connection. This negatively affects the timely delivery of information from URA. 

In addition, from Table 3 model 1, tax administration is positive and insignificantly related to firm performance 
in the 0.25 and 0.5 quintiles. This is to say, tax administration procedures are not much of an obstacle to firm 
sales. However, in the 0.75 quintile, the relationship between tax administration and firm performance is 
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negative and insignificant. Implying that tax administration procedures mildly obstruct firm sales as level of 
sales increases. The findings concur with, Akinboade (2014) who established that bribes to tax regulators 
negatively impact on business trading volumes. Furthermore, the study findings concur with Dabla-Norris et. al, 
(2017) who established that a sturdier tax administration has a positive effect on productivity of small and young 
firms. Also, the corruption which is in African tax administration bodies cited by Dube (2014) does not affect 
firm performance. Although Uganda Revenue Authority (URA) has a research unit, some traders are of a view 
that the research component is lacking thus impacting on tax administration component of the revenue authority. 
For instance, respondent 4 operating a motor spare shop asserts, ‘tax officials do not conduct enough research 
before a decision is made. So they end up making a lot of mistakes that impact on our sales. Sales revenue differ 
among importers because of difference in tax rates charged to them’.  

Despite the fact that URA has improved the tax administration system by providing information on its website 
and printing tax education materials, some business people still believe that the system is not transparent enough. 
For instance; respondent 6, operating a hardware store asserts, ‘tax policies and tax rates especially on 

consumables are not clear, so we charged taxes we don’t understand as traders, we push the burden to consumers 

which affects our sales’. The responses from interviewees 7,9,10 and 11 concur with interviewee 6 that tax 
administration procedures are not effective enough. Also, tax administration procedures frequently change, so 
traders are always not comfortable with the system. 

The study findings indicate that tax rates are positive and significantly related to firm performance.  This 
implies that tax rates are not an obstacle to firm performance. The effect is much higher at 0.75 quintile. The 
higher the level of sales, the lesser the tax rates become an obstacle.  This is to concur with Mawejje and 
Sebudde (2018) who did not find significant relationship between taxation and firm performance.  

To concur with results in table 3, it was observed that a firm that sells goods where government regulations or 
policy mandates everyone to consume its products, the firm’s sales may not be affected by increase in tax rates 

or sales can be directly proportional to tax rates. This is adduced by respondent 7, a firm transacting in motor 
cycle spares and 14 who avows, “If tax on imports increase, prices on the final product will increase. However, 
for firms importing helmets, their sales may not be affected by increase in tax rates or sales may increase since 
its government policy that everyone riding must wear helmets’. 

Contrary to the findings in table 3 above, respondent 5, an importer of new clothes, respondent 8, selling 
computers and office equipment, respondent 11 who transacts second hand clothes and respondent 12 who 
transacts in mobile telephone accessories, observe, ‘higher tax rates increases prices and leads to reduction in 
business sales. This is because, consumers have less amount to spend’.  But, the difference in argument is 

created by government interference in some of the sectors. 

Furthermore, the study’s findings are in agreement with Alcazar et. al, (2010) who assert that business licensing 
does not guarantee increased revenue. At the lowest level of sales, the 0.25 quintile, business licensing 
significantly reduces firm sales. This is an indicator that firms may choose to remain informal, after all, an 
authority’s license does not translate in more revenue. Results also indicate that the relationship between customs 

and trade regulations and firm sales is insignificant. Implying that customs and trade regulations are not much of 
an obstacle to firms’ performance in Uganda. 

The responses obtained indicate, however, that importers do not fully understand the customs procedures and 
regulations. For instance, respondents 16 and 18 said, ‘customs officers are not transparent, they do not easily 

define taxes payable by importers at entry point’. Some importers have bad experience with customs officers for 

instance, respondent 12 avows that customs officers are too arrogant to give important information about 
customs procedures. The negative remarks are made despite the fact that respondent 1, a customs agent and 
respondent 19, a customs officer at Malaba emphasise that they explain the procedures to importers. Illiteracy 
was also pointed out by respondent 5 as a factor which hinders business community to understand the customs 
procedures. Eventually, a simple process becomes a time wasting event. The experience at customs point 
indicates the weakness in tax awareness process. It must be understood that a good tax awareness system 
improves tax compliance (Omondi & Theuri, 2019). 

The study findings imply that, the time wastage, costs for delayed decisions and tax compliance costs as a result 
of inefficiencies in Uganda’s tax administration does not entirely affect firm sales. Although the quality of tax 

regulatory framework in Sub-Saharan Africa is below the Distance to Frontier Score (Nations Doing Business 
report, 2017), findings indicate that this position does not entirely affect firm sales. This position is similar to 
that of Matarirano et al; (2019) in South Africa who established that internal tax compliance costs are positive 
and significantly related to firm performance.  
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Furthermore, the results in table 3 indicate a significant positive relationship between tax rates and firm sales. 
The study findings differ from that of Gatsi et, al; (2013), who established that when tax burden increases, the 
firm’s financial performance declines.  The bureaucratic huddles are cited in Uganda’s tax administration 

system (Investment Climate Statement, 2017; United States Commercial guides, 2017), however, this does not 
inversely affect firm sales. The study findings also show that the inability for tax payers to understand customs 
and trade regulations is not an obstacle to firm sales. 

5. Conclusion 
This article examine the impact of tax administration on SMEs performance in Uganda taking into account the 
entrepreneur’s characteristics and business environment using data drawn from World Bank Enterprise Survey 

for Uganda (2013). The qualitative interviews were conducted for the purpose of explaining the numeric from 
the logit model. The analysis employs both descriptive and estimation of quintile regression model. The results 
reveal that tax administration is not an obstacle to SME performance but the results are insignificant. Tax rates 
are not an obstacle to SMEs performance and the results are significant. Also, access to credit is significant in the 
0.75 quintile, training has a significant inverse relationship with SMEs performance, male ownership is 
insignificant at all levels and age of the firm significantly increases SMEs’ performance at the .25 and .75 

quintiles. Other household and business environmental factors that are associated with low SME performance 
include legal status of the firm and domestic ownership. The study findings suggest that other factors perhaps 
significantly contribute to the poor performance of SMEs in Uganda but not necessarily tax rates and tax 
administration procedures. 

The findings suggest that efforts for financial access interventions, such as promoting credit guarantee for SMEs 
with formal financial institutions, can have a substantial impact on SME performance. Of course, not every SME 
can apply for credit due to unfavorable business environment and entrepreneurs’ objectives. Such constraints 
should be taken into account when formulating policy, targeting financial access interventions in both rural and 
urban areas where there is difference in access to formal financial institutions. In addition, there is need for 
raising awareness of the advantages of tax administration on SMEs and the benefits of staying away from 
informal business practices, particularly the young SMEs which always operate with no formal business licenses 
should be encouraged to register their businesses. Behavioral change interventions are nevertheless no 
substantial panacea and should be complemented by promotion and providing tax training to the entrepreneurs in 
the country. In the meantime, policy effort should concentrate on promoting tax compliance behavioral strategies 
and promoting business licensing, with the extreme case of eliminating informal businesses that are hard to tax. 
Thus, the combination of strategies targeting tax administration and access to credit are a promising path for 
policy makers.    

6. Study Contribution 
Whereas Dabla-Norris, Misch, Cleary, and Khwaja (2017) employed difference in difference in case of small 
firms and difference in difference in case of young firms, this study used logit and quintile estimation techniques 
to arrive at results. By way of literature, the higher the level of sales, the lesser an obstacle tax rates become to 
SMEs. 
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Abstract 
The Nigerian state has witnessed exponential increase in corruption and various anti-graft agencies have been 
established by government to curb this malaise which has branded the Nigerian state and its citizens all over the 
world as corrupt. The agencies have over the years been criticized as not being effective and a militia of 
government in power in the way they prosecute anti-corruption wars. The study evaluated the anti-graft agencies 
and their governance practices, their effectiveness in addressing the cankerworm in the country by employing the 
purposive sampling technique where 400 copies of questionnaires were distributed to professional accountants, 
bankers, journalist and lawyers. The data collected were analyzed using both descriptive and inferential statistics. 
The study revealed inadequate capacity of the workforce, non-commitment to integrity, ethical values and the 
rule of law, lack of openness, lack of transparency and accountability. The study recommends amendment of the 
extant laws establishing the anti-graft agencies for operational efficiency in prosecution, responsiveness to the 
constitution and adequate and targeted training for officials. 

Keywords: anti-graft agencies, government, corruption, EFCC 

1. Introduction 
1.1 Background of the Problem 

The Nigerian state has witnessed exponential increase in corruption right from the Second Republic as that was the 
excuse given by the military to overthrow the Second Republic Government. However, the military administration 
did not eliminate the cancer of corruption rather the administration inflamed it. The country’s image 

internationally since then has been on a downward spiral lane where Transparency International in 2018 ranked 
Nigeria as 148th most corrupt country in their Corruption Perception Index (CPI). This perception has a negative 
effect on Nigerians travelling abroad as well as cost of doing business internationally. The consequence of 
corruption in the society is the erosion of scarce resources earmarked for infrastructural development as the funds 
are siphoned to private pockets. Efficiency is traded for waste and ethnicity, excellence for mediocrity, hard work 
for lousiness. As a result, in spite of the enormous human and natural resources, the country is still grouped under 
the poorest countries of the world.  

As governance is about the process of making and implementing decisions, governance practices are the panacea 
for politico-economic growth of a nation. The presence of efficient and effective management of resources thus 
enhances development. Good governance is not all about making ‘correct’ decisions, but about the best possible 

process for making those decisions in a transparent manner devoid of personal interest.  

1.2 Statement of the Problem 
As corruption is the use of official authority in taking decisions that are for private gains devoid of transparency, 
successive governments in Nigeria in order to curb corruption and enshrine good decision-making processes and 
good governance, established various anti-graft agencies to curb the menace which has become a cancer in the 
fibre of the Nigerian nation. As good governance and operational practice should among others be participatory, 
effective and efficient in service delivery, equitable, inclusive, responsive, transparent and following the rule of 
law, this paper is to evaluate the anti-graft agencies operational effectiveness and their governance practices in 
prisms of good governance and comparison with other international anti-graft agencies. 
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1.2.1 Objective of the Study 
The objective of the paper is to appraise the operational effectiveness of the anti-graft agencies in the prisms of 
good governance and operational practices mechanism of participatory, effective and efficient service delivery, 
equitable and inclusive, responsive, transparent and following the rule of law. Also ascertain whether board size 
composition, operational reporting channel, prerequisite qualification for the leadership, inter-agency 
collaboration and operations methodology influences its efficiency in service delivery and decision making 
processes in comparison with other international anti-graft agencies. 

1.3 Literature Review 

1.3.1 Economic and Financial Crime Commission 

The Economic and Financial Crime Commission was established under the Economic and Financial Crime 
Commission (Establishment) Act 2002.The Commission’s responsibilities include the investigation, coordination 

and enforcement of all financial crimes including advance fee fraud, money laundering, contract scam etc and 
the adoption of measures to identify, trace, freeze, confiscate or seize proceeds derived from terrorists activities, 
economic and financial crimes related offences or the properties the value of which corresponds to such proceeds. 
The Act stipulates the Chairman who is the Chief Executive and Accounting Officer to be either a serving or 
retired member of any government security or law enforcement agency and 20 other members drawn from 
various security agencies.  

1.3.2 Corrupt Practices and Other Related Offences Act (2004) 

The Independent Corrupt Practices Commission (ICPC) was established through the Corrupt Practices and Other 
Related Offences Act (2004). The Commission is established to prohibit and prescribe punishment for corrupt 
practices and other related offences and is saddled with the responsibility to investigate and prosecute offences 
which are listed in the Act. The Board composition consist of the Chairman who would have held or is qualified 
to hold office as a judge of a superior court of record in Nigeria and twelve (12) other members. The Act 
empowers the Commission to receive and investigate complaint and prosecute offenders. Also the Act empowers 
the Commission to in addition educate the public on and against bribery, corruption and related offences; and 
enlist and foster public support in combating corruption. 

1.3.3 The Code of Conduct Bureau 

The Code of Conduct Bureau and its twin sister, the Code of Conduct Tribunal was set up under the Code of 
Conduct Bureau and Tribunal Act, Cap 56, LFN 1990. The Board was set up against the backdrop of large-scale 
fraud and corruption which has become prevalent in the public service with an inimical effect on economic and 
social development of the country. The Commission has as its mandate to establish and maintain a high standard 
of public morality in the conduct of government businesses and to ensure that the actions and behaviour of 
public officers conform to the highest standards of public morality and accountability. The Commission’s Vision 
is honesty, transparency and accountability.   

1.3.4 Nigerian Financial Intelligence Unit (NFIU) 

The Nigerian Financial Intelligence Unit is the Nigerian arm of the global financial intelligence Units (FIUs) 
recently created out from the EFCC. It has as its vision statement to be amongst the leading financial intelligence 
organisations in the world with a mission to safeguarding the Nigerian financial system and contributing to the 
global fight against money laundering, terrorism financing and related crimes through the provision of credible 
financial intelligence. The core mandate of NFIU is to serve as the national center for the receipt and analysis of 
suspicious transactions and other information relevant to money laundering, associated predicate offences and 
terrorist financing and for the dissemination of the results of the analysis to law enforcement and anti-corruption 
agencies.  

1.3.5 The Federal Bureau of Investigation (FBI) 

The Agency is one of the investigative agencies in the United States. It reports to the Department of Justice and 
operate independently from the Presidency. The Agency is headed by a Director who is a legal practitioner 
appointed by the President and confirmed by the US Senate from outside the service. The Agency’s Mission 
Statement as its culture is the; rigorous obedience to the constitution of the United States, respect for the dignity of 
those it protects, compassion, fairness, uncompromising personal integrity and institutional integrity, 
accountability by accepting responsibility for the actions or decisions of its employees and leadership both 
personal and professional. The culture statement thus captures the governance framework upon which the agency 
operates. It has as its motto: Fidelity, Bravery and Integrity. To achieve its vision and mission, the agency’s area of 
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investigation includes; terrorism, counter intelligence, cyber-crime, public corruption, civil rights, organized 
crimes, white-collar crimes, violent crimes and weapons of mass destruction (WMD). To accomplish the mission 
of integrity, fidelity and bravery, the agency renders Criminal Justice Information Service (CJIS), Critical Incident 
Response Group (CIRG), Laboratory Service, Training academy, operational technology and information 
management. The agency maintains a robust uniform crime reporting program (UCR) with primary objective of 
generating reliable information for use in law enforcement administration, operation and management. This 
program facilitates retrieval of information on crime in the US for law enforcement executives, students of 
criminal justice, researchers, members of the media and the public at large. This facility enhances quality of crime 
data collected by law enforcement thus improves inter-agency synergy, data sharing and co-operation.  

1.3.6 Serious Fraud Office (SFO) 

Due to considerable public dissatisfaction with the UK system for investigating and prosecuting serious or 
complex fraud, the Serious Fraud Office (SFO) was established in 1988 following the Roskill Report (Fraud Trials 
Committee) recommendation. The office as part of UK criminal justice system is a specialist prosecuting authority 
tackling the top level of serious or complex fraud, bribery and corruption cases in the UK. It undertakes large 
economic crime cases by investigating any suspected offence which appears to her on reasonable grounds to 
involve serious or complex fraud. Also investigates criminals for the financial benefits they may have made from 
their crimes. They assist overseas jurisdiction with their investigations into serious and complex fraud, bribery and 
corruption cases as additions to investigating and prosecuting offences of corporate failure to prevent the 
facilitation of overseas tax evasion. Unlike other agencies, the agency both investigate and prosecute its cases 
because of the complexity of the cases assigned to it. The agency is headed by a Director who is responsible for 
overall responsibility for the SFO’s strategic direction, case decisions and organisational management. While the 

Chief Operating Officer is responsible for the day to day running of the business and deputies for the Private Office 
& Governance, the General Counsel, Chief Operating Office and International Liaison and Investigations 
Adviser’s role is to provide quality assurance, day to day running of the business, oversight advice and quality 
control on the agency’s case development and trial preparation. The three non-executive directors in the board 
contribute to the agency’s strategic development and providing constructive challenges. The Agency reports to the 
Attorney General’s office and work in collaboration with other UK law enforcement agencies like the National 

Crime Agency’s Economic command, international corruption unit and bribery and corruption intelligence unit. 
Also the City of London Police, the UK Police forces and regional organised crime units, the HM Revenue and 
Customs and the Financial Conduct Authority. Over 80% of staff members are specialist caseworkers and where 
the director believes there are reasonable grounds to suspect complex or serious fraud, bribery or corruption, she 
opens an investigation which is taken on by a multidisciplinary case team. If sufficient evidence of criminal 
behaviour is uncovered during the investigation and a prosecution is found to be in the public interest, charges are 
brought. This methodology has greatly enhanced the efficiency and effectiveness of the agency’s cases 

prosecutions.  

1.3.7 Governance Practice and Graft 

Governance is the medium of administering a people for the overall good of the society. There are various means 
of governance in both the public and private sectors. Governance ranges from dictatorial autocratic to participatory 
governance. Governance can be adjudged good or bad governance. Accountability is the bedrock of good 
governance and in the public sector, government agencies’ officials have an obligation to report, explain and be 
answerable for the consequences of decisions they make on behalf of the citizenry. Good governance therefore 
should exhibit openness, participatory, effective and efficient, equitable and inclusive, responsive, transparent and 
compliance to the rule of law.  

Board effectiveness and efficiency has also been attributed to board composition and quality of board members. 
Studies have attributed the effectiveness of a group decision making process decreases as the size of the group get 
larger. They opined the optimum size for a decision-making group to be seven people and that for each person 
added above this, the group decision making effectiveness is reduced by 10% (Blenko, Mankins & Rogers, 2010). 
However, Margolis (2011) posit that other studies revealed the most effective number in the board to be five but 
noted that the most effective of the group decision making is between five and eight, (Margolis, 2011). 

The public sector plays a major role in society as public sector expenditure forms a significant part of a nation’s 

Gross Domestic Product (GDP). This is so because public sector entities are major employers of labour and, its 
operations significantly influences socio-economic growth and development. To promote a robust governance 
structure, the International Public Sector Governance Framework was developed jointly by the Chartered Institute 
of Public Finance and Accountancy (CIPFA) and the International Federation of Accountants (IFAC).  
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1.3.7.1 Aim of the International Public Sector Governance Framework  

The aim of the framework was to promote the development of robust governance by establishing a benchmark for 
good governance in the public sector thus encouraging better service delivery and improved accountability. The 
framework is anchored on six key principles of good governance of ensuring agencies act in the public interest at 
all times. These include; Strong commitment to integrity, ethical values and the rule of law, openness and 
comprehensive stakeholder engagement, defining outcomes in terms of sustainable economic, social and 
environmental benefits, determining the interventions necessary to optimise the achievement of intended 
outcomes, developing the capacity of the agencies which include the capability of its leadership and the individuals 
within it through training, managing risks and performance through robust internal control and strong public 
financial management and implementing good practices in transparency and reporting to deliver effective 
accountability. 

 

Figure 1. Roadmap to Good Governance 

 

Demonstrating integrity involves the leadership promoting a culture of acting in the public interest at all times by 
taking the lead in establishing and living up to specific values for the agencies and their staff. These values include 
objectivity, selflessness and honesty. They reflect the public expectations about the conduct and behaviour of 
agencies and people who manage public services and spend public funds. Similarly, strong commitment to ethical 
values involves embedding ethical values and standards throughout the agencies and ensuring the values form the 
basis for all its policies, procedures and actions as well as the personal behaviour of the agencies managements and 
staff. This is through the establishment of code of conduct policy for management and staff and ensuring that steps 
are taken to avoid or deal with any conflict of interest whether real or perceived. Also, the framework requires 
anti-graft agencies as public sector entities and its staff to demonstrate a strong commitment to the rule of law as 
well as compliance with all relevant laws. This is important as fair legal process, rooted on an impartial as well as 
an independent judicial system assist in building societies where individuals and organisations feel safe. This 
informed the crafting of the United States FBI Mission statement. 

1.3.7.2 Corruption in Nigeria 

Corruption has grown in leaps and bounds since the Ibrahim Badamosi Babagida’s era as military President of 

Nigeria when the expression, “settlement” was coined as a synonym for corrupt practices by the general public. 

The country’s image since then has been on a downward spiral lane. In their ranking in 2018, Transparency 
International Nigeria ranked Nigeria as 148th most corrupt country in the Corruption Perception Index (CPI).  
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Various scholars have defined corruption in different ways with overlapping emphasis ranging from unethical 
behaviour to political misconduct, bribe-taking and sale of government assets for personal gain (Shleifer & 
Vishny, 1993, Svensson, 2005). World Bank and Transparency International (TI) defined corruption as “the 

misuse of public office for private gain. Thus it is the misapplication of entrusted power for personal gain by 
dishonest official either appointed or elected official, (The World Bank, 1997). In their contribution, Banerjee, 
Hanna and Mullainathan (2011) define corruption as “an incident where a bureaucrat (or an elected official) 
breaks a rule for private gain‟. Tanzi (1998) opined that it may not be easy to define corruption but is “generally 

not difficult to recognize corruption when observed”. According to Ewa, Kechi,; Adu and Agida,(2017),  the 
misuse of entrusted authority comes in form of bribery, misappropriation, misapplication of entrusted funds and 
property of the organisation or the public for personal use and suppressing the rule of law for selfish reasons. 
Ewa et al (2017) posited that corruption is the “abuse of public power for pecuniary gain or for the benefit of a 

group to which an individual owes allegiance”. While premeditating factors rooted in a country’s peculiar social 

and cultural history, political and economic development, bureaucratic traditions and policies enhances 
corruption, it flourishes when institutions are either weak or non-existent and economic policies distort the 
marketplace (World Bank, 1997b). Klitgaard (1996) developed a model which explained that the extent of 
corruption is determined by the amount of monopolistic and discretionary powers (ability to take responsibility 
solely without external check) that officials exercises without recourse to accountability. 

 C (Corruption) = M (Monopoly power) + D(Discretion) - A(Accountability)  
In explaining the model, he stated that monopolistic and discretionary powers are prevalent where administrative 
roles and regulations are poorly defined. That is, poorly defined ethical standards, weak administrative and 
financial systems and ineffective watchdog agencies.  

1.4 Research Hypothesis 

H0: There is no significant relationship between anti-graft agencies prosecution efficiencies/ obedience to the 
rule of law and their administrative/professional etiquette and good governance practices  

2. Methodology 
This study adopted both exploratory and survey design to collect the data on the study’s variables, analysis and 
testing.  

The functional relationship between the variables of this study is expressed thus: 

SUMEFFIC  = f(SUMGGP, SUMAPE) 

SUMEFFIC   =  α0 + α1SUMGGP + α2SUMAPE + et 

Where; 

SUMEFFIC   = Efficiency on prosecution and Obedience to the rule of law 

SUMGGP   = Good Governance Practices 

SUMAPE   = Admin/Professional etiquette 

β0     = Constant 

α1- α2    = Coefficient of the variables 

μt     = Stochastic error term 

 
2.1 Characteristics of Participants 
A combination of inductive and survey research paradigm was employed in this research. The questionnaire used 
in this study consisted of two sections. The first section collected demographic data. The second section contained 
twelve (12) semantic differential belief statements culled from good governance framework variables. Two 
performance indices were measured by these belief statements – (1) obedience to the rule of law, (2) efficiency in 
prosecution and decision usefulness. The statements were structured as bipolar adjectival statements which were 
separated by five – point likert scales aimed at ensuring that respondents would choose a number from the scale 
which identified their level of agreement with one or the other of the statements. The population of the study 
comprised professional accountants, bankers, journalists and lawyers in Cross River State, Akwa Ibom State, Edo 
State, Bayelsa State, Delta State and Rivers State representing the South-South geopolitical region of Nigeria.  
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2.2 Sample Procedure/Sampling Size 

The purposive sampling technique was employed in the study as 400 copies of questionnaires were distributed to 
100 professional accountants, 100 bankers, 100 journalist and 100 lawyers. The belief statements (variables) were 
individually evaluated in other of significance to ascertain the anti-graft agencies governance practices and their 
success rate in curbing corruption in Nigeria. The data collected were analyzed using both descriptive and 
inferential statistics. Four hundred questionnaires were administered to the respondents in the study. Three 
hundred and fifty questionnaires were returned completed constituting 88% (eighty per cent) success rate. This 
return rate of 80% is considered adequate following the assertion by Moser and Kalton (1971) that the result of a 
survey could be considered as biased and of little value if the return rate was lower than 30 – 40%. Here the return 
rate of 80% is far in excess of 40%.  

3. Results 
3.1 Data Analysis 

3.1.1 Demographics of Respondents 

The survey document was sent to 400 subjects containing 10 belief statements from each of four groups- 
accountants, bankers, lawyers and journalists. Response rates from these groups are as shown below.  

 

Table 1. Demographics of Respondents 

Subject Group No of Survey Sent Responses Received Percentage of Group Responses 
Accountant 100 95 95% 27% 
Bankers 100 85 85% 24% 
Lawyers 100 90 90% 26% 
Journalists 100 80 80% 23% 
Total 400 350 88% 100% 
Source: Analysis of Survey Data (2018) 

The result in Table 1 indicates an overall response rate of 88%. This rate is considered a creditable result for this 
type of data collection method. The target audience for the research are accountants, bankers, lawyers and 
journalists. The choice is anchored on their perceived knowledge of anti-graft agencies and their governance 
practices and so any response from these groups of respondents should add credibility to the investigation.  

 

Table 2. Responses of the Respondents on the Belief Statements: 

S/N Statements SA A U D SD 
 Good Governance Practices      
1 The agencies are not responsive to the 

yearnings of the public in the discharge of 
their responsibilities 

165(47%) 115(33%) 51(15%) 19(5%)  

2 The agencies activities are open to the 
public and interact with the public often 

  91(26%) 159(45%) 100(28%) 

3 The agencies carry out their assignment not 
in a transparent manner 

155(44%) 157(45%) 26(7%) 12(3%)  

4 The agencies do not treat every suspect 
equally no matter your political affiliation 
and status(ie equitable and inclusive) 

116(33%) 180(51%) 31(9%) 23(7%)  

5 The agencies line of reporting do not 
influence their decision making 

  111(32%) 190(54%) 49(14%) 

 Administrative/Professional Etiquette      
6 The agencies staff are not well trained and 

they are effective and efficient in the 
discharge of their duty 

127(36%) 89(25%) 74(21%) 54(15%) 6(2%) 

7 The laws setting up the agencies are not 
standard and operatives are not fully aware 
of the laws 

102(29%) 107(30%) 79(22%) 62(18%)  

8 The composition of the agency boards is 
not moderate 

115(33%) 75(21%) 76(22%) 62(18%) 22(6%) 

9 No knowledge of good governance criteria 102(29%) 81(23%) 110(31%) 57(16%)  
 Prosecution Efficiency/Obedience to the 

rule of law 
     

10 The agencies performances in obedience to 
the rule of law is not outstanding 

100(28%) 155(44%) 76(22%) 19(5%)  
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11 The agencies management is loyal to the 
Constitution than the President 

   283(80%) 67(19%) 

12 The agencies performance creditably is 
questionable by the public 

112(32%) 105(30%) 87(25%) 46(13%)  

Source: Analysis of Survey Date (2018) 

 

Table 3. Least Square Regression Result on Efficiency in Prosecution and the Rule of Law of Anti-Graft 
Agencies in Nigeria (Regression Constant and Coefficients) 

Variable Unstandardized Coefficients Standardized 
Coefficient 

    
       T 

 
      P  

 B Std Error Beta 
Constant 
SUMAPE 
SUMGGP 

2.472 
-.147 
.551 

0.400 
0.037 
0.048 

 
-.347 
1.006 

6.187 
-.345 
11.408 

0.000 
0.000 
0.000 

*Significant at .05 level p<.05 

Dependent variable: SUMEFFIC 

Predictors: SUMAPE, SUMGGP 

Source: Field survey (2018) 

 

Table 4. Least Square Regression Result Model Summary of Efficiency in Prosecution and the Rule of Law of 
Anti-Graft Agencies in Nigeria  

R R-Square Adjusted R 
Square 

Std Error of 
Estimate 

R-Square F Change Durbin-Watson 

.710 .504 .501 1.27625 .504 176.269 .102 
Source of 
Variation 

Sum of 
Squares 

Df Mean Square F P  

Regression 
Residual 
Total 

574.220 
565.198 
1139.417 

2 
347 
349 

287.110 
.1.629 

176.629 0.000  

*Significant at .05 level p<.05 

Dependent variable: SUMEFFIC 

Predictors: SUMAPE, SUMGGP 

Source: Field survey (2018) 

 

Table 5. Inter Correlation among the Variables 

Variables SUMEFFIC SUMAPE SUMGGP   P 
SUMEFFIC 
SUMAPE 
SUMGGP 

1.000 
0.564 
0.694 

0.564 
1.000 
0.903 

0.694 
0.903 
1.000 

0.000 
0.000 
0.000 

*Significant at .05 level p<.05 

Dependent variable: SUMEFFIC 

Predictors: SUMAPE, SUMGGP 

Source: Field survey (2018) 

 

3.1.2 Test of Hypotheses 

H0: There is no significant relationship between anti-graft agencies prosecution efficiencies/ obedience to the 
rule of law and their administrative/professional etiquette and good governance practices. 

H1: There is a significant relationship between anti-graft agencies prosecution efficiencies/ obedience to the 
rule of law and their administrative/professional etiquette and good governance practices. 

Administrative/professional etiquette and good governance practices have positive and significant relationship 
with the Agencies efficiency in prosecution and obedience to the rule of law with the Agencies efficiency in 
prosecution and obedience to the rule of law. The t-statistics shows significant relationship between the variables.  
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In Table 5, the correlation coefficient(R) of 0.710 (71 per cent) indicates a strong relationship between the 
Agencies efficiency in prosecution and obedience to the rule of law and the independent proxies of 
administrative/professional etiquette and good governance practices. The coefficient of determination (R2) of 
0.504 (50.4 per cent) indicates that only 50.4 per cent of total variation in the Agencies efficiency in prosecution 
and obedience to the rule of law is jointly accounted for by administrative/professional etiquette and good 
governance practices while the remaining 49.6 per cent of the variation in efficiency in prosecution and obedience 
to the rule of law is caused by extraneous factors not captured in the model. However the F value of 176.269 
(p=000) is significant at less than 5 per cent. This thus signifies the model as fitting the population well and can be 
used for interpretation about not just the population but also for policy formulation. Therefore based on this result, 
the null hypothesis that there is no significant relationship between anti-graft agencies prosecution efficiencies/ 
obedience to the rule of law and good governance practices is rejected as the agencies prosecutorial efficiencies 
and adherence to the rule of law is greatly influenced by good governance practices as well as 
administrative/professional etiquette.  The Durbin-Watson (DW) for the model of .102 which is below 2 reveals 
that there is a significant threat of independent error for the equation as there is positive autocorrelation. 

4. Findings and Discussions 

The survey on the notion that the agencies are not responsive to the yearnings of the public in the discharge of their 
responsibilities revealed 280 (80 per cent) respondents are of the view that the graft agencies are not responsive to 
the public yearnings. This is in agreement with (Adedokun, 2018; Yakubu, 2018). On the notion that the agencies 
are interactive with the public, majority of the respondents 259 (74 per cent) either strongly disagreed or merely 
disagreed that the agencies are interactive with the public. However, 91 (26 per cent) of the respondents were 
undecided on the notion. They belief the agencies are not telling the people the correct situation of things and they 
are not communicating to the general public as it is in developed countries. This none communication with the 
public reinforced the notion that the agencies are not transparent in their responsibilities as 312 (89 per cent) of the 
respondents either merely or strongly agreed that the agencies do not carry out their assignment in a transparent 
manner. This is in agreement with the position of Justice Gabriel Kolawole, (Madukwe, 2018; Nnochiri, 2018A; 
Adedokun, 2018). This is reaffirmed as 296 (84 per cent) of the respondents are of the opinion that the agencies do 
not treat suspects equally but influenced by political affiliation. This is in agreement with Fabiyi and Akinkuotu 
(2018) who cited Mr Kola Ologbodiyan as saying it is a grave concern that while corruption and corrupt persons 
abound in party in power (The APC) and walking freely, the EFCC prefers to chase after innocent members of the 
opposition party. Writing on Kemi Adeosun and the opportunity lost, Adedokun (2018) lamented that the message 
that anti-graft agencies pass across to Nigerians is that they only serve the interest of the government in power and 
not that of the people and a partisanship that ignores the log in the eye of a family member but identifies the speck 
in the neighbour’s eye as the policy is not only faulty but whimsical and selective. This is in contrast to other 

intelligence agencies in Israel, America or Europe.  

On the perception that the agencies line of reporting do not influence their decision making processes, 239 (68 per 
cent) of the respondents are of the view that the agencies line of reporting to the presidency greatly influences their 
decision making processes while 111 (32 per cent) were undecided. This is in agreement with (Adedokun, 2018; 
Olatunji, 2018 B; Akinkuotu & Olugbemi, 2018). This is contrary to the United States of America (US) where the 
FBI was investigating President Trump through an independent special prosecutor without interference. The 
overbearing control of anti-graft agencies by government especially the executive arm is considered a corruption 
impediment to their effectiveness, (Okeshola, 2012) 

On the level of training, while 216 (61 per cent) of the respondents belief the staff of the agencies are not well 
trained to effectively and efficiently discharge their responsibilities, 74 (21 per cent) respondents were unable to 
comment on the relevance and adequacy of training given to the agency staff. This is in agreement with Nnochiri 
(2018B) citing a prosecution team lawyer in a case between Mr Ibrahim Tumsah and the Nigerian government 
stating the government was withdrawing the case against Tumsah for re-filing after “proper and thorough 
investigation” is conducted in the case. Also Olatunji (2018A) citing Justice Olatokunbo Majekodunmi stated that 
the EFCC failed woefully by relying on third party evidence that lacks in merit when they should have known 
better. 

Similarly, while 209 (59 per cent) of the respondents are of the view that the laws of the agencies are not standard 
and the operatives are not fully aware of the laws, 79 (22 per cent) of the respondents are undecided. Adeleye 
Bamidele cited by Jibueze (2018B) stated that Nigeria lacks strong institutions and there is absence of the rule of 
law in Nigeria  
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On the question of the composition of the agencies board sizes not being moderate and thus affecting its 
performance, while 190 (54 per cent) of the respondents are of the view that the composition of the agencies boards 
is not moderate, 76 (22 per cent) are undecided. But 62 (18 per cent) of the respondents are of the view that the 
agencies board composition and sizes are moderate for effective service delivery. However, while some studies 
have shown that optimum and effective size for a decision-making group to be seven people and for each person 
added above this, the group decision making effectiveness is reduced by 10% (Blenko, Mankins & Rogers, 2010), 
others found that the most effective number as five but noted that the most effective of the group decision making 
is between five and eight, (Margolis & Sheila, 2011). 

While the survey revealed 110 (31 per cent) respondents being undecided as to agencies officials lack of 
knowledge of good governance awareness, 183 (52 per cent) respondents belief officials have no knowledge of 
good governance awareness thus affecting their mode of operations. Therefore while 255 (72 per cent) respondents 
surveyed belief the agencies do not operate in obedience to the rule of law, only 19 (5 per cent) think the agencies 
are in obedience to the rule of law in the discharge of their responsibilities. This is in agreement with Unachukwu 
(2018) citing Chief Emeka Obegolu who in a lecture organised by the NBA Eket branch said the rule of law was a 
hall-mark of democracy and that there is a connection between democracy and good governance. This is in line 
with the works of Ojiakor, Anisiuba and Nnam (2017) and Adegbie and Fakile (2012) that revealed poor 
governance, favouritism, tribalism, poor remuneration, ineffective and wrong judgements as factors mitigating the 
performance of the agencies. Commenting on anti-corruption fight and the rule of law, Olaniyan (2018) stated that 
part of the problem of fighting corruption is the authority’s disdain for the rule of law as illustrated by the tendency 

to pick and choose which court orders it complies with and opined that real progress is yet to be made with respect 
to the prosecution of cases of grand corruption as high ranking corrupt officials rarely end up in jail. Thus the 
assertion as to whether the management of the agencies are loyal to the constitution as against the President, 67 
(19%) of the respondents strongly disagreed that the agencies loyalty is to the Constitution as against the 
Presidency while 283 (80 per cent) similarly disagreed to the notion of loyalty to the Constitution. This is in 
agreement to Adedokun (2018) who opined that the average public officer in Nigeria does not understand that they 
owe their allegiance to the cause of the country because politics has become a major source of survival in Nigeria 
and so they defer to their appointer because of the power to hire and fire by the chief executive. This is in 
agreement with (Olaniyan, 2018; Unachukwu, 2018; Jibueze, 2018B) 

On the effectiveness and credibility of the agencies performances, while the survey revealed 217 (61 per cent) 
respondents believing the agencies have not performed to internationally acceptable standard, only 46 (13 per cent) 
respondent believed otherwise. This is in agreement with the judgement delivered in a case ‘EFCC versus Prof. 
Olusola Oyewole’ where the presiding judge declared that all the evidences presented by the prosecution had been 
manifestly discredited through cross-examination such that the court could not rely on them and thus declared that 
EFCC failed woefully in establishing a prima facie case against the accused persons. Also in agreement with the 
report presented by the Corruption Cases Trial Monitoring Committee (COTRIMO) which stated that offenders 
were charged to court before proper investigations of charges were done. The report stated that prosecuting 
agencies lacked adequate personnel, duplicate charges and multiplication of cases and while some prosecutors 
lacked the requisite experience to prosecute corruption cases, there is lack of commitment and collusion between 
defence counsel and some prosecutors to pervert justice by either stalling trial or by achieving pre-determined 
results, (Jibueze, 2018A). This study is in line with the studies of (Amaefule & Umeaka, 2013; Ojiakor, Anisiuba & 
Nnam, 2017 and Dania, 2017) that posited that the activities of the anti-graft agencies are not effective in curbing 
corruption and financial crimes in Nigeria as cases are lost due to lack of painstaking investigation, lack of 
adequate and requisite trained personnel and lack of strategic preparations. 

4.1 Conclusion/Recommendations 
The study revealed among others the lack of capacity, inefficiency and ineffectiveness in the Agencies in the 
discharge of their responsibilities as well as unresponsiveness of the Agencies to the general public. Also lack of 
transparency in their mode of operations and outright disobedience to the rule of law as well as unequal treatment 
of accused citizenry. The study further revealed that the agencies boards’ compositions affect their level of 
efficiency and effectiveness. 

The study thus recommend as follows: 

i. The review of the extant laws establishing the agencies to make them independent from the executive 
arm of government. 

ii. Improve funding, training and retraining of field staff to enhance investigative skills and prosecution 
efficiency. 
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iii. The leadership of the agencies should be reserved for only seasoned professionals in the field of 
forensic accounting and legal practice. 

iv. The technical staff in the agencies should be drawn from among professional accountants, forensic 
accountants, legal experts, computer specialists and policemen trained in forensic examination. 
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Abstract 
Internationalization represents an obligatory path for firms in order to compete and survive in the current 
competitive environment. However, many enterprises, especially the SMEs, sometimes lack the necessary 
resources to grow and succeed in international markets. Several authors argue that SMEs constantly need to 
create, adapt and reconfigure their relationships and network resources to remain competitive in an international 
environment, that is, they need to develop dynamic capabilities. The aim of this paper is to analyze the 
international growth of gradual global SMEs by adopting the dynamic capabilities framework. Through the case 
study of a firm from South Italy, this paper aims to analyze the role played by dynamic capabilities in the growth 
and success of a gradual global SME in international markets. The results show that the capabilities to perceive 
opportunities and threats in the international context, to seize opportunities through adaptation, reactivity and 
reconfiguration, have been fundamental for the international success of the company analyzed. 

Keywords: gradual global, dynamic capabilities, case study, internationalization, SMEs 

1. Introduction 
The dynamics triggered by the current phase of globalization have determined an increasing complexity in the 
economic system, able to modify organizations’ competitive conditions and perspectives. In this scenario, 

companies are encouraged to continuously analyze the influencing factors in global markets, in order to address 
the strategic choices in line with the context variability. Among those strategic choices, international 
development is considered an inevitable process for companies, in a certain sense "forced" to operate on a global 
scale regardless of their potential and the available resources. However, for many SMEs, internationalization 
represents a challenge, a difficult and demanding path that requires resources, skills and sizes that often they do 
not possess. 

The traditional theories on competitive advantage, such as the Resource-Based View (Penrose, 1959), are 
therefore not sufficient to explain the international success of these companies. The positive results achieved by 
many SMEs in international markets could partly derive from their flexibility and adaptation to the variety and 
variability of the environment - at the endogenous and exogenous level - and from their ability to positively face 
the emerging challenges. 

Dynamic capabilities, defined as the ability of firms to create, adapt or modify their own resources and skills 
(Teece, Pisano & Shuen, 1997), are fundamental in the responsiveness of companies to rapidly changing 
contexts (Teece, 2014). In recent years, those capabilities have been investigated from different perspectives 
aimed at analyzing their influence on improving performance and results at international level (Jantunen, 
Puumalainen, Saarenketo & Kylaheiko, 2005; Evers, 2011; Prange & Verdier, 2011). However, the reference 
literature focused on the study of multinational companies and born global enterprises, neglecting other types of 
companies that characterize the European business system. Based on those considerations, the aim of this work 
is to investigate the role of dynamic capabilities in the internationalization process of gradual global SMEs 
(Moen & Servais, 2002). 

This paper adopts the model of Teece (2007) as its theoretical framework, which identifies three 
macro-categories of dynamic capabilities:  
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- Sensing - the firm’s capability to identify opportunities and threats in the environment through research 
activities, tests and experimentation, aimed at understanding the expressed or latent needs of consumers, the 
responses of suppliers and competitors as well as the structural evolution of markets and the opportunities for 
innovation and technological development;  

- Seizing - the firm’s capability to seize the opportunities identified by adapting the sizing of its offer, its 

business model, its boundaries, and by critically analyzing the errors made to redefine its decision-making 
processes;  

- Reconfiguration - the firm’s capability to recombine and reconfigure its assets according to the changes in 

the environment, particularly through the adaptation of the organizational structure, the knowledge management, 
the collaboration with other companies and the exchange of best practices for innovation. 

Through a qualitative research based on the case study method, this work analyzes the emerging dynamic 
capabilities in the internationalization process of an Italian SME in order to answer the following research 
questions: 

RQ1. Are dynamic capabilities able to support the internationalization of a gradual global SME? 

RQ2. Is there any link between an SME's dynamic capabilities and its competitive advantage in international 
markets? 

RQ3. What are the most important dynamic capabilities for the international growth of gradual global SMEs? 

This paper is organized as follows: firstly, the literature on dynamic capabilities and internationalization is 
analyzed, with a focus on the internationalization of gradual global SMEs; secondly, the method adopted to 
conduct the case study is described, showing the identification of indicators to detect the dynamic capabilities of 
the selected company; thirdly, the results of the study are discussed, with a focus on three categories of dynamic 
capabilities and their links with the internationalization process; finally, conclusions, implications and limitations 
are presented. 

2. Literature 
2.1 Dynamic Capabilities and Firms’ Internationalization 
Several authors tried to explain firms’ internationalization processes by elaborating theoretical models. Since the 

early 90s, this topic generated an extensive body of scientific literature, mainly based on two research lines. The 
first, of Anglo-Saxon origin (Hymer, 1976; Dunning, 1981; 1988; Buckley & Casson, 1976; Rugman, 1981), 
generated various contributions almost exclusively referring to large enterprises. The second, of European origin, 
generated different strands of research, among which the dominant paradigm is the Uppsala model (Johanson & 
Wiedersheim-Paul, 1975; Johanson & Vahlne, 1977), which distinguishes four different steps for entering an 
international market. Other models focused mainly on the born global (Oviatt & McDougall, 1994; Mc- Dougall, 
Shane & Oviatt, 1994), or on the participation of firms in international networks (Hadley & Wilson, 2003; 
Coviello, 2006). Several authors argue that these theories do not provide exhaustive explanations for the 
discrepancies in results achieved abroad by firms in terms of growth and survival (Sapienza, Autio, George & 
Zahra, 2006; Zahra, 2005; Prange & Verdier, 2011). According to Crick (2009), the theories mentioned above 
overlook fundamental factors such as entrepreneurial orientation, managers' international experience and 
capability to sense and seize opportunities - factors that can have a significant impact on the formulation of 
strategies and on performance in a global environment. 

With this in mind, several authors have started to analyze internationalization processes from a dynamic 
perspective (Chang & Rosenzweig, 2001; Luo, 2002; Sapienza, Autio, George & Zahra, 2006; Tallman & 
Fladmore-Lindquist, 2002). This perspective allows to scrutinize aspects such as learning, integrating, building 
and reconfiguring internal and external competences (Teece, Pisano & Shuen, 1997) that, once adapted to a 
firm's specific internationalization processes, suggest a predefined path for developing distinctive capabilities. 

According to Pitelis and Teece (2010), managing a firm in a global economy characterized by greater volatility 
and dynamism requires flexibility, agility, entrepreneurship, learning and smart investment choices; all central 
aspects in the dynamic capabilities’ framework. Several authors believe that an effective internationalization 
process can be largely explained by a firm's dynamic capabilities (Dunning & Lundan, 2010; Pitelis & Teece, 
2010; Teece, 2014). Teece (2007), for example, states that owning difficult-to-replicate assets is not enough to 
gain a competitive advantage for enterprises operating in complex competitive environments with a high number 
of activities to be managed globally, and that those enterprises need unique dynamic capabilities, such as the 
ability to orchestrate the assets and exploit co-specialized and complementary resources at the global level 
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(Katkalo, Pitelis & Teece, 2010). The greater the dynamism of the environments in which a firm operates, the 
more dynamic capabilities become critical (Augier & Teece, 2007) and their effect on performance prominent 
(Fang & Zou, 2009). Therefore, the impact of dynamic capabilities is more obvious in international enterprises 
(Frasquet, Dawson & Mollá, 2013) that operate in environments volatile by nature (Pehrsson et al., 2015).  

The processes of enterprises' international expansion require the development of two distinct levels of dynamic 
capabilities, defined by the literature as generic dynamic capabilities and specific dynamic capabilities. Generic 
dynamic capabilities are needed to start and support internationalization processes, and serve to build and 
support specific capabilities related instead to each strategy adopted by the enterprises in those processes. 

Frasquet, Dawson & Mollá (2013) gather classifications from previous authors and identify three main types of 
generic dynamic capabilities: international entrepreneurial orientation, learning and adaptation. International 
entrepreneurial orientation is defined as the dynamic capability to sense and seize international opportunities in 
an innovative, visionary, proactive and timely way, with a market orientation (Knight & Cavusgil, 2004; 
Weerawardena et al., 2007; Cavusgil & Knight, 2015). Learning consists in acquiring, integrating and exploiting 
all information acquired during the internationalization process (Villar et al., 2014), and turning it into 
knowledge (Luo, 2002; Prange & Verdier, 2011). Adaptability is the reconfiguration of resources and processes 
according to changes in the environment and to national differences (Knight & Cavusgil, 2004), in order to keep 
a constant balance between the firm's routines and local needs (Frasquet et al., 2013). Jantunen et al. (2005) and 
Evers (2011) empirically demonstrate that the dynamic capability to adapt, combined with international 
entrepreneurial orientation, facilitates the overcoming of the difficulties met in the various markets and improves 
a firm’s performance.  

A first large group of specific capabilities can be identified in the marketing dynamic capabilities (Day, 1994; 
Knight, 2000), defined as the ability to adapt, integrate and appropriately reconfigure marketing tools and 
strategic competences to identify a value proposition for the customer and efficiently distribute it on international 
markets (Weerawardena, Mort, Liesch & Knight, 2007). They represent strategic capabilities as they are closely 
associated with the ability to supply products in an efficient way, align the offer with the solutions sought by 
customers, grasp market signals and sustain the competitive advantage by identifying the relevant market 
(Krasnikov & Jayachandran, 2008; Moretta Tartaglione & Formisano, 2018). Integration and reconfiguration of 
internal and external organizational skills, of resources and functional skills, including developing new products, 
new pricing, distribution and communication policies (Griffith, Yalcinkaya & Calantone, 2010; Bruni & Verona, 
2009) allow a more efficient reaction to the changes that are taking place ever more quickly in a competitive 
environment (Murray, Gao & Kotabe, 2011). 

Using the Uppsala model, Cunningham et al. (2012) identify other types of specific dynamic capabilities that are 
important for the growth in international markets: (1) the capability to identify growth opportunities and to use 
relevant resources both within the company and within other firms involved; (2) the capability to approach and 
develop different markets and countries under different circumstances (defined as the capability to 
internationalize); (3) the capability to build, maintain and coordinate relationships in a reticular context (also 
called networking capabilities or relational capabilities). 

Luo (2000), on the other hand, focuses on a firm's capability to allocate and exploit its distinctive resources 
among geographically dispersed and globally coordinated units, defining it as the dynamic capability of 
resources allocation.  

2.2 The Dynamic Capabilities Framework for the SMEs’ Internationalization 
Most of the works on the dynamic capabilities in internationalization processes study multinational enterprises 
(Pitelis & Teece, 2010; Teece, 2014; Chakrabarty & Wang, 2012; Gooderham, 2007; Vahlne & Johanson, 2013; 
Augier & Teece, 2007; Michailova; & Zhan, 2015). Other works focus on born globals (Teece, 2012, Oviatt & 
McDougall, 1994; Weerawardena, Mort, Liesch & Knight, 2007; Sharma & Blomstermo, 2003; Zhou, Wu & 
Barnes, 2012). There is instead a noticeable gap in the literature on the dynamic capabilities in the processes of 
internationalization of gradual global SMEs. This gap is particularly relevant because, while multinational 
corporations have an advantage in terms of size, resources and managerial know-how, and the born globals have 
an advantage in terms of superior technology, unique products and advanced marketing skills (Chen & Chen, 
1998), gradual global SMEs often face several challenges such as scarcity of financial resources, difficulties in 
exploiting technology, limited managerial skills, limited production capacity and regulatory constraints, which 
are aggravated by a global system and a technology-dominated environment.  

Several authors argue that SMEs constantly need to create, adapt and reconfigure their relationships and network 
resources in order to remain competitive in an international environment (Eberhard & Craig, 2013; Naudé, 
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Zaefarian, Tavani, Neghabi & Zaefarian, 2014), which means that they need to develop dynamic capabilities. 

According to Prange and Verdier (2011), when analyzing dynamic capabilities for internationalization, it is 
necessary to distinguish between the incremental internationalization of traditional SMEs, which is supported by 
dynamic exploitative capabilities, and the accelerated internationalization of the born globals, which is supported 
by dynamic explorative capabilities. Borrowing from March (1991) the notions of exploitation versus 
exploration, capabilities deployed in incremental and accelerated internationalization processes are clearly 
different (O'Reilly & Tushman, 2007). Exploitation is mainly based on previously acquired knowledge, on local 
research and recycling of existing routines (Vermeulen & Barkema, 2002; Baum, Li & Usher, 2000). The aim is 
to reduce the uncertainty and the risks associated with internationalization (Flatten, Engelen, Zahra & Brettel, 
2011) by transferring across borders business models refining existing processes, products, services and markets 
(Drnevich & Kriauciunas, 2011). Dynamic explorative capabilities, on the other hand, refer to exploring, risk 
taking, planned testing, flexibility and innovation (Prange & Verdier, 2011). They aim at exploring and 
exploiting new opportunities by developing new knowledge, new solutions (Shane & Venkataraman, 2000), new 
processes and new routines (Zahra & George, 2002). Currently, firms are increasingly facing friction between 
exploiting existing capabilities and exploring new ones (Raisch & Birkinshaw, 2008, Simsek, 2009). Both 
capabilities are essential, but combining them (ambidexterity) is a hard task. Barkema and Drogendijk (2007) 
suggest choosing exploration when entering culturally distant foreign markets, and exploitation for culturally 
closer countries.  

3. Method 
Through the case study of a firm from South Italy, this paper aims to analyze the role played by dynamic 
capabilities in the growth and success of a gradual global SME in international markets. The firm subject to 
study was selected based upon certain criteria: small and medium-sized - based on the EU Recommendation 
2003/361; greater than 60% export percentage on total turnover; presence in several markets (at least 10 
countries); continuous and consolidated presence in foreign markets for at least a decade. The study was carried 
out applying the triangulation technique (Yin, 2003), i.e., through gathering, analysis and comparison of multiple 
sources of data. Secondary data were acquired from various company documents such as the last available 
budget, Company Registration Report, firm's reports, website. Primary data were acquired through a 
semi-structured interview with the firm's Marketing Director as suggested by Yin (2003), who regards interviews 
as one of the most important sources of information in case studies. 

The case study method is the most used in the literature on dynamic capabilities. In fact, in this field, the 
research is mainly qualitative and based on case studies, with just a few applied quantitative methods (Wang & 
Ahmad, 2007, Ambrosini & Bowman, 2009). Many authors recognize the difficulty in operationalizing dynamic 
capabilities (Mosakowski & McKelvey, 1997; Priem & Butler, 2001; Williamson, 1999), since this framework is 
considered tautological (Arend & Bromiley, 2009) or otherwise difficult to measure (Williamson, 1999). 
However, Eriksson (2013) and Teece (2014) argue that dynamic capabilities can be measured and several authors 
have tried to do so by proposing several dimensions for them, although they have been met with criticism about 
their validity (Wu, 2010, Protogerou, Caloghirou & Lioukas, 2012; Chang, 2012; Drnevich & Kriauciunas, 2011; 
Wang & Ahmed, 2007). In this paper, indicators to identify dynamic capabilities in internationalization processes 
have been identified and used as guide for the interview. The indicators were drawn from the work of Teece 
(2007), in which the author, in addition to splitting dynamic capabilities into three levels (Sensing, Seizing, 
Reconfiguration), identifies the nature of capabilities themselves and the firm's key activities linked to them. 
Identifying the key activities that characterize each type of dynamic capability allows setting indicators to 
measure a firm's level of implementation of those activities, built from time to time according to the research 
specific targets1.  

The interview has been structured in different sections: i) general information about the enterprise; ii) 
information about the firm's internationalization; iii) capability to sense opportunities and threats in foreign 
markets; iv) capability to seize opportunities in host countries; v) capability to manage threats and reconfigure 
itself during the internationalization process. The indicators set by transforming the key activities from the Teece 
model (2007) are listed in Table 1. 

 

 
                                                        
1 For example, Cao (2011) uses activities identified by Teece (2007) to carry out an empirical research in the 
retail sector. 
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Table 1. Indicators used for conducting the semi-structured interview 

Dynamic capabilities Indicators 
Sensing 

Sensing opportunities and threats in foreign markets 
Investments in research activities 
Market research 
Information system set-up 
Trials and tests  
Use of innovative tools and techniques 

Seizing 
Seizing opportunities in host countries 

Offer adaptation  
Business model adaptation 
Redefining enterprise's boundaries 
Investments to seize sensed opportunities 
Decision-making errors analysis 
Decision-making processes redefinition 

Reconfiguration 
Threats management and reconfiguration during the 

internationalization process 

Organizational structure adjustment 
Organizational structure decentralization 
Decision-making power delegation 
Strategic choices about centralization and decentralization 
Incentives and rewards 
Knowledge management 
Co-operation with other firms 
Exchange of best practices with other actors 

Source: adapted from Teece (2007) 

 

4. Case Study 
Isaia & Isaia S.p.A. (hereafter "Isaia") is a Neapolitan firm that operates in the men's clothing sector as clothes, 
sportswear and accessories manufacturer and retailer, globally recognized as a lifestyle luxury brand. Isaia is a 
firm with a strong family vocation, and counts 125 employees with a turnover of around 46 million euro. The 
company is the Global Ultimate Owner of a Corporate Group that includes five companies with a total turnover 
of 63 million. Isaia counts 7 shareholders, 6 subsidiares and 10 branches in several countries. It was founded in 
the '20s as a fine fabrics emporium and a craft workshop. Production increased over time and the '80s led the 
brand to a successful process of industrialization and expansion through which the firm established itself as one 
of the Italian tailoring icons in the world. The garments, produced by highly specialized manpower, are divided 
into two main lines of business: "packaged" and "tailor-made" clothing, to ensure high product customization, 
and are exclusively made in Italy at the Casalnuovo di Napoli plant, in a borough of ancient sartorial traditions 
dating back to the Bourbon era. This strategic choice allows the company to constantly monitor each stage of the 
production process and oversee the product quality at all stages of production. Isaia's goal is to merge the 
excellence of the Hand Made in Italy (or better, as highlighted in the communication campaigns, the "Made in 
Naples"), the respect for tradition and the taste for innovation, preserving the image of a family-run 
post-artisanal firm, and identifying itself in the concept of "Contemporary tradition". On the commercial level, a 
selective and targeted distribution policy is pursued through the multi-brand and mono-brand wholesale channel, 
while the retail channel is managed via directly run stores. 

Isaia sells its products almost exclusively on international markets, recording a 96% turnover in a dozen 
countries outside Italy, where it managed to establish itself by operating persistently and steadily since 1970. The 
reasons for such a pronounced internationalization are surely to be found in the stagnation of the domestic 
market, where the reduction in disposable income in recent years has reduced the demand for items labelled as 
luxury clothing, which are therefore quite expensive. The firm exports 10% of the total production to Western 
Europe, another 10% to Eastern Europe, 6% to Eurasia, 3% to Japan and 50% to the USA. 

It had to focus on industrialized countries, and especially on those countries sharing a common dressing style, 
quality, sophistication and high disposable income. In each country, the company identified a segment of 
transnational demand characterized by a high purchasing power and a predilection for high quality clothing items 
(for example, a suit can cost around three thousand Euros). 

A country's approachability in terms of artificial barriers and potential demand is certainly the most influential 
factor for the firm when choosing target countries.  

The firm started establishing relations with the North American market due to its high purchasing power and a 
slightly similar liking for refined clothing. To begin with, Isaia launched its brand in men's luxury department 
stores (Saks, Barney's, Neiman Marcus, Bergdorf Goodman). Then it set up a wholly owned subsidiary (Isaia 
Corp.) and opened a local branch in order to quickly respond to the market and customers' needs. The choice to 
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entry that geographical area proved successful, and that motivated the firm to look at other markets. The search 
took to the East, and in particular to Japan. Initially the firm recruited an agent, and then it replicated what it did 
in North America by setting up Isaia Japan Ltd, a subsidiary wholly owned by the Isaia family. In any case, 
choosing how to enter a country takes into account available resources and risks as well as the country's features, 
such as distance, local distribution models, market attractiveness and country risks.  

In addition to the Milan and Capri flagship stores in Italy, Isaia is present with the same distribution formula in 
Azerbaijan (Baku), China (Beijing, Hong Kong), Japan (Tokyo), Mongolia (Ulaan Baatar), Russia (Moscow, 
Yekaterinburg, Kazan, Nizhny Novgorod and Saint Petersburg), Ukraine (Kiev), United States (New York, Los 
Angeles and San Francisco). 

Even if the company has staff dedicated to internationalization, decision making remains strongly centralized 
and exerted by the owners, who follow a proactive approach to strategically plan international development. 

4.1 Capability to Sense Opportunities and Threats in Foreign Markets 
This section of the interview aims to detect the firm's capability to sense the environment and the context in 
order to plan international strategies, i.e., the organizational capability to scan, filter, monitor, evaluate, interpret, 
understand and fine-tune opportunities and threats in foreign markets. 

The study on the selected enterprise shows that Isaia relies on research to identify opportunities and threats in 
foreign markets. The ongoing search for and gathering of information has proved to be a key tool when choosing 
a destination country as well as to survive and grow in it. 

Isaia runs a first search with secondary information sources for an overall survey of a country's attractiveness in 
terms of potential demand, consumer spending, company products' compatibility, per capita income, nature of 
the artificial barriers (first of all, duties). Since the firm mainly exports its products directly through single-brand 
stores, the main actor they gather information about is the consumer. In fact, most of the success comes from the 
presence in a foreign country of a satisfactory share of potential customers who can be associated with that 
particular transnational segment identified by the firm. Only at a later stage Isaia sends its export managers on a 
regular basis to the target country to identify commercial partners. In addition, the firm set up an internal 
information system to collect primary data and competitor analysis. 

4.2 Capability to Seize Opportunities in Host Countries 
This section of the interview aims to probe the organizational capability to seize potential opportunities through 
new products, processes or services, namely to identify the firm's strategic choices to adapt the offer according to 
each source of competitive advantage. 

In particular, the interviewee was asked to describe the activities carried out by the company in order to put 
together and manage a valuable offer, calibrating the choices in relation to the competitive environment, the 
management and the entire enterprise; and how relevant these processes are to internationalization. To this end, 
particular attention has been given to factors such as business model adaptation, firm's boundaries redefinition 
and decision-making process enhancement. 

Isaia adapts the offer to a host country by taking into account market and social factors such as employment 
dynamics, income availability and consumer spending, and the power of communication and new media (for 
example, the influence of social media on people's lives). Moreover, Isaia states to pay adequate attention to the 
complexity of social dynamics, such as immigration, crime, politics and the crisis of values while weighing up 
the choices related to the value proposition in a foreign country. As stated by Isaia's Marketing Director: “if you 
want to seize opportunities in emerging countries with a relative political stability, those opportunities have to be 
seized upon a series of pre-assessments that lead you to a cautious management of the process with no room for 
improvisation. Therefore, there are opportunities but you need to act with maximum caution. If we think of a 
country like Ukraine, we have to take into consideration very complex social dynamics. In Turkey, we have to 
consider political, operational and instability risks. Therefore, we are there in less engaging ways such as the 
launch in the wholesale channel of a shop in shop in Istanbul”. 

Since it started the internationalization process, Isaia has revised its business model several times, changing 
some elements and keeping others, or rather protecting them. For example, clothing for women designed by the 
firm in the early ‘60s were abandoned ten years later, when the firm began to expand across borders, allowing it 
to specialize and focus on producing clothing for "man". Depending on the country it entered, the firm had to 
adapt the cost and revenue structure and the value proposition from time to time, as well as having to identify 
new key partners. In addition, Isaia has created an internal e-commerce channel and set up ad hoc functions for 
its management. What the firm has always protected and never changed is communication - a clear, bursting, 
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sarcastic and self-deprecating communication. From that point of view, the firm is not very receptive to change, 
focusing exactly on communication as a way to obtain competitive advantages. 

During the internationalization process, Isaia redefined its boundaries by adopting a lateral diversification 
strategy aimed at developing and producing new products linked to those already designed by the firm itself, in 
order to gain a greater capability to adapt to new markets. The firm, specialized in the production of outerwear, 
trousers and shirts, has allocated the production of knitwear, footwear and accessories to highly specialized firms, 
thus expanding the range of products offered and maintaining a high degree of flexibility through outsourcing to 
other Italian companies. The most successful diversification project on foreign markets is the "Saracino" bracelet 
that resembles the brand logo and is produced by a coral supplier from Torre del Greco, the coral and cameo 
capital of the continent. Besides being distributed through the same distribution channels, that product acts as a 
fashion accessory characterized by a strong image. The firm also has carried out a downstream vertical 
integration by opening direct stores and proprietary flagship stores, with the aim to get close to consumers and 
reinforce the brand image. 

In order to seize market opportunities offered by host countries, Isaia has made specific investments that are 
decisive for the success of internationalization strategies. Those investments were mainly made in new 
technologies, research for specific products, production of complementary goods, and to hire or train managers 
for the supervision and coordination of functional activities. Those investments represent fundamental assets of 
dynamic capabilities: innovation, complementary assets and learning. 

Isaia issued two mini bonds on the Italian stock market and used the proceeds to finance further development 
abroad and open direct sales points in the US (New York and Los Angeles), the United Kingdom and Japan. 
Investments have also been made in product innovation, improvement of the technology applied to fabrics - 
suede with anti-stain treatments, improved yarn and cashmere quality. 

Isaia admits to having made mistakes in decision-making, mainly with regard to product pricing, customer 
relationships management, product offering and product standardization/adaptation. However, it claims to have 
reacted by increasing consultations at top management level with partners and managers of international stores, 
or through data analysis from market researches planned ad hoc or purchased elsewhere, in order to avoid or 
overcome mistakes when making decisions concerning internationalization. 
4.3 Capability to Manage Threats and Reconfiguration During the Internationalization Process 
This section of the interview aims to probe the firm's ability to modify activities and organizational structure 
through reconfiguration and continuous adaptation, according to changes in the environment. 

Reconfiguration and adaptation mean the firm's ability to regularly call into question the management, the 
strategic choices and the organization, in order to safeguard competitiveness in turbulent and ever-changing 
markets through processes of adaptation and decentralization of the organizational structure, knowledge 
management, incentives for staff and partners, and more. 

Isaia's internationalization process resulted in an organizational structure adjustment through the introduction of 
a marketing strategy aimed at the foreign market as well as through a rethinking of the distribution structure, as 
stated by the firm's Marketing Director: “Internationalization is a long process that has to be constantly 
reviewed, adjusted, corrected, to try and conform to a variety of cultural, social and economic differences that 
required various adaptations, especially in the distribution structures. If we look at the continuous innovations in 
the two different realities of wholesale and retail trade, they created a need to produce an ad hoc structure that 
can take care of every detail, and to identify a global marketing direction overseas that has been entrusted to a 
manager who lives in the USA.” 

The internationalization process has also required the decentralization of decision making, although Isaia have 
always preferred for strategic decisions to be taken by the CEO. Following international expansion, 
decision-making is shared with family business partners and the firm's managers, in a system where delegation 
and integration play an essential part. The governing body has always been intent on bringing on board managers 
with proven international experience. For example, the interviewee has five years of experience in the Warnaco 
Group, a licensee of the Calvin Klein brand where he covered the role of Export Sales Manager, and was chosen 
by Isaia to develop the wholesale network and strengthen the relationships within the retail business.  

While centralizing most of the decisions in consideration of the structural differences of the countries in which 
they operate, the firm uses marketing tools, leaving some decision power to foreign subsidiaries to help them 
build their own relationships with local partners. To this end, Isaia has decentralized the decision-making 
concerning distribution channels and customer relationships. However, it deemed vital to keep decision-making 
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centralized with regard to logistics, brand and image, pricing, and level of product standardization or adaptation. 

In order to empower the parties involved in the strategic choices on internationalization, Isaia has implemented 
an incentive and bonus scheme for the results achieved. It also provides its employees with a positive 
environment and continuous training. 

For Isaia, knowledge management has proved to be crucial for the success of internationalization strategies. Isaia 
deems taking part in fairs and congresses very important. The firm has always been present at trade fairs such as 
Pitti Uomo, but in the last year it changed strategy and stopped taking part in the international fair to create an ad 
hoc event for its clients, to be able to "pamper" them in a direct and personal way, and show them the Isaia 
collection. In order to manage knowledge in an appropriate way, Isaia has allocated funds for safeguarding its 
intellectual property and for training courses, most of which are aimed at middle management. The Marketing 
Director states that “knowledge is widespread, i.e., it is not the parent company's exclusive prerogative. The 
knowledge that comes from Isaia's experience and the ability to share it are factors that help also the 
subsidiaries' managers to undertake initiatives of cooperation in the markets in which they operate, creating a 
knowledge cross-fertilization that brings benefits at a global level. Moreover, the partners' experiential 
knowledge in "particular" markets from a cultural point of view (e.g., Russia and China) is an important factor 
that allows acquiring information about the actual innovative needs and in terms of demand, supporting the 
company's process of internationalization in similar markets and representing a resource that increases value 
and is strategic for the whole enterprise”. 

To overcome the difficulties associated with internationalization in a highly competitive and global environment, 
the firm started collaborating with other companies. Isaia has joined the Altagamma Foundation - which since 
1992 brings together the cultural and creative high end of the Italian industry, companies recognized as authentic 
ambassadors of the Italian style in the world - and the National Chamber for Italian Fashion. Being part of such 
organizations increases competitiveness, widens knowledge about specific foreign markets, expands the 
professional network and certainly represents a key element in the internationalization process. 

According to Isaia, collaboration with different actors such as managers, suppliers, local partners or even 
consumers, has been a great motivation to innovate logistics, human resources, image and brand. 

5. Conclusions, Implications and Limitations 
This paper highlights the strategic role played by dynamic capabilities in achieving competitive advantages in an 
economy characterized by increasingly complex, dynamic and global markets. The literature points out that 
dynamic capabilities are considered essential for enterprises’ international development as they improve 

performances and results in foreign markets. However, the literature lacks empirical research on the relationship 
between dynamic capabilities and performance in international markets, especially with regard to gradual global 
SMEs. 

The case study analyzed in this paper confirms the strategic role of internationalization for the survival and the 
growth of companies in a global environment. Internationalization, at times forced by external factors such as the 
contraction of the domestic market or the international competition, at others by internal reasons, is in any case a 
source of advancement and competitiveness but also a great challenge, to which the studied firm showed to 
respond to through capabilities of adaption, reaction and transformation. In the analyzed case, learning and 
innovation processes, relationships and collaborations, adaptations and reconfigurations were fundamental to 
overcome the obstacles to the internationalization process, usually caused by the limited size and scarce 
resources of SMEs, proving the importance of dynamic capabilities.  

At the initial stage of expansion abroad, volatility, risk and lack of previous international experience have been 
dealt with research activities, information gathering and knowledge expansion, essential to the choice of the 
target markets, the way to approach them and the strategies to implement. The firm has not always been able to 
satisfy its need for information and knowledge on its own, so it used external sources to fill the blanks. In some 
cases, needed information on the relevant market was missing so reports and surveys from research institutes 
were purchased, consulting companies or export managers were hired, or local distributors and partners' 
knowledge was exploited. On other occasions, the need for information demanded a more active involvement of 
the firm in seeking inter-firms collaboration in the same industry. In any case, sensing capabilities allowed the 
firm to sense opportunities and threats in distinct markets, taking it to set out its internationalization processes 
during which a series of capabilities that can be related to the seizing capability category have been deployed. 
The firm has in fact adapted the offer according to the different markets in order to meet the local demand, thus 
gaining a successful position for its products.  
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Firm's boundaries have been redefined through diversification strategies aimed at expanding the range of 
products offered across borders or at protecting the firm from the typical fluctuations in demand in some sectors, 
and through vertical integration strategies aimed at achieving a greater contractual power and reducing sales 
risks. In particular, the importance of exploiting complementarities as well as of direct investments to better 
penetrate a local market and the neighboring ones emerged.  

However, the same interviewee admits that mistakes were made in decision-making, caused mainly by excessive 
optimism or, at other times, by a low risk propensity. However, the company has shown also in those 
circumstances capability to react, scrutinize errors and revisit decision-making processes, allowing not only 
company's managers but also external figures such as partners and international clients to play a part in 
decision-making. 

Lastly, the capability to transform itself was essential for the company that, although having to change its 
organizational structure in order to adapt to international contingencies and, in some cases, decentralize 
decision-making, was able to maintain its family-run nature with strong ownership centralization. 

The firm's international success can certainly be attributed to the relational and networking skills developed by 
taking part in industry trade fairs and conventions, and through productive collaborations with other players that 
let Isaia access those resources, knowledge, skills, distribution channels, areas of specialization, products or 
complementary assets it needed but it could not, or that at least would not have been convenient to develop 
internally. 

Thanks to these dynamic capabilities applied in the internationalization process, in the last 5 years the company 
has managed to increase its turnover and the number of employees by 41% and the Shareholders funds by 55%, 
obtaining a value of intangible assets around to 3.5 million euros. 

Based on this study, we come to the conclusion that it is not possible to draw boundaries for SMEs' success in 
foreign markets in terms of size, resources or corporate structures if those have the dynamic capabilities to adapt, 
reinvent themselves, innovate and open up to the outside world. If a firm is small-sized, it can expand its 
boundaries through trade agreements; if knowledge is limited, it can draw on other actors' experience by 
developing relationships; if resources are scarce it can, for example, enter a network or implement vertical 
integration processes if the economic and financial situation allows it. 

In short, it does not seem possible to identify in a deterministic way a virtuous path, a recipe to follow, a list of 
strategies to be implemented. Targets set for expansion on foreign markets can be achieved via several strategic 
routes (Moretta Tartaglione, 2018). It has been possible instead to identify those capabilities that marked the 
internationalization process of a successful SME, such as the capability to set up an information marketing 
system, capability to learn, orientation towards innovation, receptiveness to change, flexibility, adaptability, 
networking skills and ability/willingness to systematically call itself into question, breaking the established 
routines. 

This paper provides empirical evidences about the importance of dynamic capabilities for the international 
growth of gradual global SMEs. However, the principal limitation of this work is that it is based on a single case 
study, thus not allowing the generalization of the results. Future researches are aimed at analyzing multiple case 
studies, maybe referred to companies belonging to different countries and sectors, in order to consider also the 
country of origin effect and the influence of the business sector in the investigation of the influence of dynamic 
capabilities on the international competitive advantage. Moreover, studying multiple cases would allow to 
empirically validating the indicators used in this work and attempt an operationalization of dynamic capabilities.  
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Abstract 
Demand for cash is generally known to be influenced by several factors—including transaction motive used for 
payment, opportunity cost, precautionary motive, and other motives (such as aging and demand from abroad). In 
recent years, cashless payment methods have increasingly become prevalent in the world through various 
conventional tools and innovative convenient financial services using mobile phones and smart phones. 
Nevertheless, cash in circulation has been rising in many economies, especially after the global financial crisis. 
This paper seeks to examine factors affecting cash in circulation for 22 economies for the period 2000–2018. It 
also investigated the movements of banknotes in circulation differentiated by denomination for seven economies 
whose data were available. The empirical analysis of this paper found that the opportunity cost proxied by the 
central bank policy rates and age-related variable were the two most important robust determinants for cash 
demand. Namely, cash demand tends to grow with a decline in the policy rates and with an advancement of 
aging. 

Keywords: money demand, monetary policy, central bank 

JEL Classification: E41, E52, E58 
1. Introduction 
Cash is a useful instrument for payment of goods and services and other transactions. Cash remains essential in 
many economies today and will likely remain relevant in the future, since cash is likely to be used often by the 
elderly and marginalized, low-income people. Cash becomes useful especially when natural disasters or military 
conflicts cause serious damage to communities and people’s daily lives by generating power shortage and 

destruction of buildings and computer system. Thus, many central banks view that retaining some level of cash 
in the society could be useful, despite high cash-handling cost and prevalent cash-associated crimes. 

Conceptually, cash is central bank-issued money. It is the safest, liquid payment and financial instruments for the 
public. Cash fulfills the following basic functions of money—that is; unit of account, means of exchange, and 
store of value. Cash is legal tender and an official medium of payment determined by the government through 
the passage of law that requires creditors to accept debt service payment in the legal tender. Cash is also used for 
public charges and taxes. For the public, cash remains an important means of payment, but it is increasingly 
being taken over by private sector-issued money, such as bank deposits and other cashless and contactless tools. 
Central bank-issued money consists not only of cash, but also reserve balances of financial institutions with a 
central bank. Cash and reserve balances constitute the liability of the balance sheets of a central bank. 

Cash demand of the public is generally influenced by (1) transaction motive used for payment, (2) opportunity 
cost, (3) precautionary motive, and (4) other motives. Transaction motive reflects demand for cash used for 
payments of goods and services as well as other transactions, which is likely to strengthen with an expansion in 
economic activities (normally proxied with nominal gross domestic product (GDP)). The opportunity cost for 
holding cash is related to the financial return arising from the close substitutes of cash, such as retail deposit 
rates paid by commercial banks to the public or cost of holding credit cards and bank cards (such as annual fees 
charged for the card membership). Generally, cash utilization tends to decline as GDP per capita increases due to 
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greater access to bank deposits, debit cards, credit cards, and other cashless payment instruments. Moreover, the 
higher the opportunity cost, the lower the demand for cash becomes. As a related indicator, inflation also 
influences cash demand. Low inflation means that the opportunity cost of holding cash is low since the value of 
cash remains stable. Precautionary motive reflects demand for cash among households and firms that tend to 
grow at the time of financial and economic crises and/or a sharp decline in risk appetite among investors. 
Moreover, firms may maintain some liquidity assets in the form of cash to ensure smooth business operations 
even in a normal period. 

Other motives include aging, tax-saving purposes, informal or illegal activities, and cash demanded from abroad. 
Cash is prevalent in economies with a large share of elderly population due to the habits and affinity for using 
cash as compared with the economies with a small share of elderly population. Some elderly people stop using 
credit cards after retirement. Cash demand from abroad is large for the case of the United States given that the 
US dollar is the most important reserve currency, invoice currency used for international trade and debt issuance, 
vehicle currency used for various foreign exchange transactions, as well as safe haven currency. Also, an 
increase in frequent foreign tourists, businesspersons, and students may raise cash demand for foreign currencies, 
especially when the exchange rates are perceived to be favorable (Flannigan and Parsons 2018). Thus, demand 
for cash tends to grow with an expansion of economic activities, a decline in the opportunity cost, an 
intensification of precautionary motive, and other motives. “Cash hording” is defined as cash lying idle that is 

not being utilized for payments and thus could be driven by the opportunity cost, precautionary motive, and other 
motives. 

A central bank normally determines the amount of cash to be issued passively by responding to changes in 
demand for cash. Therefore, the amount of cash in circulation mainly reflects the demand-driven factors 
mentioned above—rather than supply-driven or issuer-side factors—and are thus beyond the control of a central 
bank. A central bank issues and circulates cash through the banking system by providing commercial banks with 
cash demanded by withdrawing the equivalent amount from their reserve balances with a central bank; these 
commercial banks then distribute the acquired cash to the public on demand through windows of bank branches 
and/or automated teller machines (ATMs). It should be noted that the conduct of monetary policy (such as open 
market operations) directly influences the amount of reserve balances, not the amount of cash, although 
monetary policy indirectly influences cash demand through adjustment of interest rates.  

The value of cash is stable in an economy where a central bank successfully conducts monetary policy in 
accordance with the price stability mandate (mostly, specified at around 2% in advanced economies) and thus 
avoids substantially high inflation or serious deflation. Most of the public do not differentiate cash and retail 
deposits and view them as close substitutes partly because both are denominated in the same unit of account (i.e., 
legal tender) and partly because providers of retail deposits are regulated by tight banking regulations and 
deposits are guaranteed up to the certain amount per account holder set by the deposit guarantee system in many 
economies. 

In recent years, cashless and contractless payments methods have increasingly become prevalent in the world 
through various conventional tools (such as credit cards, debit cards) and innovative convenient financial 
services using mobile phones and smart phones. Nevertheless, cash in circulation has been rising in many 
economies especially after the global financial crisis. The rising trend is prevalent, even in advanced economies 
notwithstanding that the public normally has had full access to bank accounts and credit cards for long periods of 
time and other cashless and contactless payment tools in recent years. The low interest rate environment appears 
to have affected the rising trends. Meanwhile, emerging/developing economies continue to issue cash partly 
because their nominal GDP growth rates have been greater than those of advanced economies. Interestingly, 
some emerging economies, such as China have experienced a decline in the ratio of cash in circulation to 
nominal GDP. This may indicate that the Chinese have gained access to the bank accounts and/or other non-bank 
cashless payment and financial services.  

The rising trends on cash in circulation might have several impacts on monetary policy as well as the economy. 
On the one hand, greater cash hoarding results in the erosion of the effectiveness of monetary policy through 
weakening the money creation process. On the other hand, greater cash issuance increases a central bank’s 

income through greater seigniorage. Moreover, greater cash utilization deteriorates the efficiency in the economy 
owing to high cash-handling costs arising from the direct fees (i.e., cost of paper and design fees to prevent 
counterfeiting) and indirect cost (i.e., the security and personnel cost associated with the maintenance of cash 
provision and payment services by commercial banks, shops, firms, and individuals). Cash prevalence may also 
discourage new technology firms to enter into innovative payment and financial activities.  
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This paper focuses on the movements of cash in circulation by investigating demand-driven factors contributing 
to the movements for the period 2000–2018. The paper covers 22 economies—eleven advanced (Australia, 
Canada, Denmark, the Euro Area, Japan, Korea, Norway, Singapore, Sweden, the United Kingdom, and the 
United States), and 11 emerging/developing economies (Brazil, China, India, Indonesia, Malaysia, Mexico, the 
Philippines, Poland, Russia, Thailand, and Turkey). The paper is composed of five sections. Section 2 focuses on 
the time-series movements of cash in circulation among 22 economies for the period 2000–2018. This paper 
differentiates between advanced and emerging/developing economies due to the well-developed banking system 
in the case of former and the presence of large unbanked population in the case of latter. Section 3 highlights the 
movements of banknotes in circulation differentiated by denomination in the economies whose data are 
available—covering Canada, the Euro Area, Japan, Korea, Poland, the United Kingdom, and the United States. 
Section 4 provides an empirical analysis cash demand covering all the 22 economies for the period 2000–2018. 
Section 5 concludes. 

2. Global Developments of Cash in Circulation 
There are various indicators tracing the movement of cash in circulation. For example, Kiaonarong and 
Humphrey (2019) used four indicators to measure the cash usage for payment: cash in circulation as a ratio of 
nominal GDP; difference between total consumption and the amount of all non-cash payment instruments used 
in consumption as a ratio of total consumption; the amount of cash withdrawn from ATMs and banks’ windows 

as a ratio to total consumption; and the amount of all cash withdrawals as a ratio to cash plus the amount of 
non-cash payment instruments. This paper views cash in circulation as a ratio of nominal GDP as a preferred 
indicator to the three other indicators since the focus of this paper is cash demand driven not only by the 
transaction or payment motive, but also by the opportunity cost, precautionary motive, and other motives.  

The 22 economies in this study are classified as either advanced economies or emerging/developing economies 
because the degree of the public’s access to the banking system is likely to generate different impacts on cash 

demand depending on the stage of economic development. While bank accounts are widely available to the 
public in advanced economies, the public’s access to bank accounts remains limited in many 

emerging/developing economies. The gradual decline in the unbanked population in the latter economies may 
promote financial inclusion and encourage the public to shift transaction or settlement instruments from 
cash-based to cashless-based, thereby helping to lower the ratio of cash to nominal GDP ratio. For these 
economies, a decline in the cash ratio may suggest higher levels of financial inclusion, strengthened financial 
intermediation function of the banking system, and improved monetary policy transmission mechanism. It could 
be also associated with greater transparency and efficiency as a result of reduced activities in the informal 
economy and in illegal activities. The demand for cash will be stimulated further with an increase in the ATM 
networks and declined charges applicable to ATM usage and cash/debit cards. 

Demand for cash by households and firms is determined largely by various motives as already pointed out in the 
previous section. Namely, most of these motives are heavily influenced by the pace of economic activities 
(which heavily influence the transaction motive), interest rates (that represent opportunity cost), the occurrence 
of economic/financing crises (that tend to strengthen precautionary motive), and other factors such as pace of 
aging and safe haven demand from abroad. Generally, households are the largest holders of cash among 
economic entities (such as households, firms, financial institutions, and governments) because of their frequent 
purchases of daily goods and services with low-value banknotes. Households are often sensitive to interest rates 
since ordinary/checking bank accounts are a close substitute for cash, as both such bank deposits and cash serve 
as payment tools for daily small-value transactions payments and serve to store value.  

Following households, non-financial firms are generally the second largest holder of cash. They demand cash 
and cash equivalents (such as checking accounts) mainly due to intensions to maintain the flexibility in their 
daily transactions and business decisions related to mergers and acquisitions (M&A) and research and 
development (R&D). Especially when there is information asymmetry between borrowing firms and creditors, 
firms with a large growth opportunity or a high external funding risk tend to maintain more liquid assets rather 
than using uncertain external funding (Myers and Majluf 1984). For firms, a lower interest rate promotes greater 
cash demand due to a decline in the opportunity cost. Nonetheless, cash holdings are likely to be dominated by 
households, not by firms, because households often keep cash in safety boxes due to smaller amounts of cash 
holdings while firms often keep money in the form of cash equivalents rather than in the form of cash itself for 
security reasons. For example, in the case of Japan, where the data on cash holdings by types of holders are 
available from the flow of funds data, households’ cash holdings as of the end of 2018 accounted for 80% of 
total outstanding cash issued, growing steadily from 53% in 2000. In contrast, the ratio of non-financial firms’ 

holdings dropped from 37.5% to 8.6% over the period. Due to a lack of such detailed data decomposed by types 
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of holders for other economies, this paper examines total cash in circulation without distinguishing between 
households and firms. 

2.1 The Case of the 11 Advanced Economies 
Figure 1(1) shows the amount of cash in circulation as a percentage of GDP and Figure 1(2) shows cash in 
circulation in terms of the index (by setting the amount in the first quarter of 2002 being equal to 100) for the 
period 2000–2018 regarding the 11 advanced economies. Charts in Appendix Figure 1 show the development of 
these two indicators for each economy. These figures indicate that the 11 economies can be classified into the 
following three types of economies with regards to the trend related to cash-nominal GDP ratio: (1) economies 
with a rising trend, (2) economies roughly with a stable or constant trend, and (3) economies with a declining 
trend.  

The economies with a rising trend include the Euro Area, Japan, Korea, Singapore, the United Kingdom, and the 
United States. The rising trend strengthened in these economies especially after economic uncertainty rose as a 
result of the global financial crisis of 2008–2009. Greater political/economic/financial uncertainty tends to 
increase the precautionary demand for cash, reflecting diminished trust in the banking system. By contrast, the 
economies with a declining trend in the cash-nominal GDP ratio include Demark, Norway, and Sweden, which 
all have a well-developed cashless and contactless payment system. The economies with a more or less stable 
trend include Australia and Canada. Regarding the amount of cash in circulation, all the advanced economies 
except Sweden and Norway experienced a rising trend, reflecting transaction motive of cash demand. The 
amount of cash in circulation has grown fast in the Euro Area since the early 2000s, details of which will be 
discussed later. Since the global financial crisis, Korea showed a faster growth in the amount of cash in 
circulation. In sharp contrast, a declining trend began in Sweden from 2009 and in Norway recently from 2017.  

Among the advanced economies, it is noted that Japan’s cash-nominal GDP ratio has always exceeded other 
economies by a wide margin and has even increased to around 20% recently, further widening the gap. Japan’s 

high cash demand may reflect that cultural habits such as high levels of public trust in the stable government and 
legal tender in the face of persistently-low inflation. In addition, the Bank of Japan has performed a series of 
unconventional monetary easing measures since the late 1990s, ranging from the zero interest rate policy in 
1999–2000, to Quantitative Easing in 2001–2006, and further to Comprehensive Monetary Easing from 2010, 
which was then replaced in April 2013 by the Quantitative and Qualitative Monetary Easing (Shirai, 2018). 
Japan’s intensified demand for cash in recent years might also be driven by tax-saving incentives motivated as a 
result of various government tax-raising measures: (a) an inheritance tax hike in January 2015; (b) an adoption of 
a compulsory reporting system requiring residents to submit information on detailed foreign assets to the 
National Tax Authority in 2014 if exceeding 50 million yen; and (c) an adoption of a compulsory reporting 
system requiring individuals to submit detailed information about domestic financial/non-financial assets and 
debts to the National Tax Authority in 2016. The government also introduced the “My Number” system in 2015, 

providing all the residents with an individual identification number for social security, tax payments, 
renumerations, financial investment, and other government records. Nonetheless, the growth rate of cash in 
circulation has declined recently partly due to the higher penetration of cashless payment instruments, although 
the cash growth rates have remained above the rates of nominal GDP growth. 

In the case of the Euro Area, the circulation of euro banknotes (and coins) began at the end of 2001 and those 
euro banknotes (and coins) became legal tender in 2002. Demand for euro banknotes appears to have increased 
gradually as the public gained confidence over the common currency euro as well as monetary policy conducted 
by the European Central Bank (ECB), as evidenced by the steady increase in the amount of euro in circulation. 
ECB conducted monetary easing after the global financial crisis and a series of innovative unconventional 
monetary easing especially from 2014—including negative interest rate policy, Targeted Long-term Refinancing 
operations (TLTRO I and II), and large-scale asset purchase program. The resultant declining interest rates made 
cash holding more attractive than before. ECB terminated the asset purchase program at the end of December 
2018, announced a continuation of the reinvestment strategy to maintain the outstanding amount of asset 
holdings, and presented a plan to conduct the first hike on policy rates within 2019. However, economic 
slowdown in the region and declines in the rates of inflation and inflation expectation forced to the ECB to shift 
its monetary policy stance from a move toward normalization to a move toward accommodation since early 2019. 
ECB, thus, postponed the planned timing to raise policy rates and made the decision to adopt the new TLTRO III 
in March 2019 with the effect from September 2019. In September 2019, furthermore, ECB reduced the negative 
interest rate from -0.4% to -0.5%, and also decided to resume asset purchase program with effect from 
November 2019. These series of enhanced monetary easing measures may promote further demand for cash.  
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Figure 1(1). Cash in Circulation (% of Nominal GDP) in the Advanced Economies 

Source: CEIC, Bank of Canada, and Bank of England 

 

Figure 1(2). Amount of Cash in Circulation in the Advanced Economies (2002 Q1 =100) 

Source: CEIC, Bank of Canada, and Bank of England 

 
The United Kingdom has also faced a moderate increase in the ratio of cash to nominal GDP ratio even though 
the economy is more advanced in terms of new cashless, contactless retail payment systems compared with other 
advanced economies. The economy had already adopted a retail Faster Payments Scheme in 2008 as a banking 
sector initiative to accelerate payment times between different banks’ customer accounts from three working 

days to a few seconds. Nevertheless, cash in circulation continues to grow in the United Kingdom. The low 
interest rate environment generated by the monetary easing by the Bank of England and other major central 
banks appear to have contributed to greater cash demand. The first quantitative easing was announced in late 
2009, expanded further in 2012, and resumed in August 2016 for a short while after the surprise 23 June 2016 
Brexit referendum result. Simultaneously, the Bank of England, after having maintained the policy rate at 0.5% 
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from 2008, decided to lower it to 0.25% in August 2016 to cope with expected economic slowdown. Resilient 
economic performance subsequently led to an increase in the policy rate back to 0.5% in November 2017 and 
further to 0.75% in August 2018. Since early 2019, the greater concerns related to Brexit and uncertainty related 
to internal politics have undermined the British economy and households’ and firms’ sentiments. This may 

increase precautionary demand for cash. 

In the case of the United States, the cash-nominal GDP ratio continued to rise even after the Federal Reserve 
increased the federal funds rate nine times from 0–0.25% to 0.25–0.5% in December 2015 to 2.25–2.5% in 
December 2018 in the process of monetary policy normalization. This happened even though households are 
using cash less frequently than the past. According to the 2018 Diary of Consumer Payment Choice by the 
Federal Reserve, Kumar and O’Brien (2019) found that individuals used cash in 26% of transactions (down from 

30% in 2017 and 31% in 2016), while credit cards and debit cards accounted for 23% (rose from 21% in 2017 
and 18% in 2016) and 28% (rose from 26% in 2017 and 27% in 2016), respectively. Prepaid and electronic 
instruments remained unpopular, accounting for only 2%–3% and 10%–11% over the same period, respectively. 
Surprisingly, the share of cash use among individuals under 25 years old was the highest (34%) of any age group, 
slightly higher than those aged 55 years old and above. In early 2019, the Federal Reserve has shifted the 
monetary policy stance from normalization to an accommodative one by abruptly stopping the interest rate 
normalization process and advancing the timing to end the balance sheet run-off (so-called “balance sheet 

tightening”) from the end of 2019 to the end of September 2019. In July 2019, the Federal Reserve officially 
ended the balance sheet runoff earlier than scheduled and cut the federal funds rate by 25 basis points from 
2.25%–2.5% to 2%–2.25% for the first time since 2008. The rate was further cut by 25 basis points in September 
and October 2019, reaching 1.5%-1.75%. These accommodation policies are expected to lead to stronger 
demand for cash in the economy.   

In sharp contrast to Japan, the Euro Area, the United Kingdom, and the United States, Sweden exhibits a 
completely different pattern. Sweden progressed to become the most-advanced cashless society among the 11 
advanced economies examined because of the declining trend concerning the cash-nominal GDP ratio and the 
amount of cash in circulation. Credit cards and a mobile-phone-based fast payment system called Swish have 
been widely available for some time. The pace of decline in the cash-nominal GDP ratio accelerated since 2008, 
which is contrary to the movements observed among other advanced economies. It should be noted that the 
Swedish cash-nominal GDP ratio continued to drop, even after a negative interest rate policy was adopted on the 
repo rate in February 2015 and was deepened gradually toward -0.5% by February 2016 and maintained the 
same rate until the rate was raised to -0.25% in January 2019 as part of monetary policy normalization. This 
indicates that a negative interest rate policy did not promote substitution from bank deposits to cash.  

2.2 The Case of the 11 Emerging/Developing Economies 
The cash-nominal GDP ratios and the amount of cash in circulation in the case of the 11 emerging 
economies/developing economies are shown in Figure 2(1) and 2(2), respectively. Charts in Appendix Figure 2 
show developments with regards to the two indicators for each economy. While all the 11 economies recorded 
roughly a secular rising trend from early 2000s concerning the number of banknotes in circulation, divergent 
movements were observed with regards to the ratio of cash-nominal GDP ratios. The economies with a rising 
cash-nominal GDP ratio include Mexico, the Philippines, Poland, and Thailand. Their rising trend prevailed from 
early 2000s. The economies with the declining cash-nominal GDP ratio include China from early 2000s and 
Turkey since 2017. India experienced a sharp drop in the amount and the ratio in October–November 2016 due 
to the impact of the demonetization currency reform as mentioned below. Finally, the economies with the more 
or less stable cash-nominal GDP ratio include Brazil, Indonesia, Malaysia, and Russia.  
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Figure 2(1). Cash (% of Nominal GDP) in the Emerging/Developing Economies 

Source: CEIC 

 
Figure 2(2). Amount of Cash in Circulation in the Emerging/Developing Economies 

(2002 Q1=100) 

Source: CEIC 
 

In particular, a secular declining trend in the cash-nominal GDP ratio in China is noticeable. This is likely to 
reflect a shift in the form of money held by the public from cash to bank deposits and/or other cashless payment 
tools (such as Alipay or WeChat Pay). This is in line with the deepening of the banking system and an increase in 
the number of depositors with commercial banks. Meanwhile, India’s cash–GDP ratio remained stable until the 
fourth quarter of 2016, suggesting that India’s cash growth is associated more or less in line with transaction 
demand growth. A sharp drop in the ratio in India happened temporarily in 2016 after the government abruptly 
implemented a currency reform that triggered a temporary shortage of banknotes in circulation. India’s 

government banned the Rs100 and Rs500 banknotes and instead introduced a new Rs500 note for the first time 
and issued new Rs2,000 banknotes. This currency reform was meant to fight corruption and anti-money 
laundering/illegal activities, but it created severe disruptions to economic activities as a result of creating serious 
cash shortages. While the cash ratio recovered somewhat in the following year, it appears that the ratio has been 
lower than the past trend, suggesting a moderate shift from cash to bank deposits or cashless payment tools.  

Many emerging/developing economies have increasingly reduced cash usage for payments of goods and services 
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and other transactions in recent years. This is because payment systems are currently experiencing rapid 
innovation and transformation with the increasing number of technology companies and financial institutions 
being involved as payment providers. Many governments also encourage the use of electronic payment 
instruments to improve efficiency in the payment systems. Nevertheless, cash demand remained strong in many 
economies with the exception of China.  

3. Outstanding Banknotes Issued Differentiated by Denomination in Selected Economies 
Demand for high-denomination banknotes is likely to be associated more with cash hoarding. Such demand may 
have become more important during the times of the global financial crisis, since concerns about the solvency of 
financial institutions might have prompted depositors to withdraw their funds from commercial banks or other 
equivalent money market funds to increase their precautionary holdings of banknotes (Cusbert and Rohling 
2013). Demand for high-denomination banknotes of international reserve currency might be increased by the 
increased number of foreign tourists, businesspersons, and students who frequently visit the economy under 
investigation. High-denomination banknotes are also preferred by the people who wish to materialize flight to 
safety investment. Demand for higher-denomination banknotes could be associated more negatively with 
changes in interest rates (Arango-Arango and Suarez-Ariza, 2019). Regarding payment tools, non-cash payment 
tools such as credit cards are more frequently used for high-value purchases such as home electronics, furniture, 
expensive clothes, etc. On the other hand, low-denomination banknotes are more often used for lower-value 
purchases such as food and beverages. The expansion of ATM networks may increase demand for 
lower-denomination banknotes because of the increased frequency of trips to withdraw small numbers of 
banknotes. 

3.1 Economies with Greater Demand for Highest-Denomination Banknotes 
The consistent time-series data on the number of outstanding banknotes issued classified by denomination are 
available for seven economies—Canada, the Euro Area, Japan, Korea, Poland, the United Kingdom, and the 
United States. Figure 3 exhibits the annual time-series developments of outstanding banknotes issued 
differentiated by denomination for these economies for the period 2000–2018. These seven economies can be 
classified into two groups: the first group with dominant largest-denomination banknotes (Japan, Korea, and the 
United States) and the other group with dominant middle-denomination banknotes (Canada, the Euro Area, 
Poland, and the United Kingdom).  

Regarding the first group, the outstanding issuance amount of the largest 10,000-yen note has always been 
largest over the observation period in Japan (Figure 3(1)). In addition, the pace of issuance increased further 
since 2013 when the Bank of Japan adopted the Quantitative and Qualitative Monetary Easing. Meanwhile, 
Korea began to circulate the 50,000 won in June 2009 as the largest-denomination banknote and since then the 
outstanding amount issued rose rapidly (Figure 3(2)). The United States experienced a rapid rise in the issuance 
outstanding amount concerning the $100 note since the global financial crisis (Figure 3(3)). In both Korea and 
the United States, the amounts of the largest-denomination banknotes exceeded those of smaller-denomination 
banknotes recently. Consequently, the figures related to Japan, Korea, and the United States indicate the presence 
of high and rising demand for cash holdings since large-denomination banknotes are best suited for this purpose.  

In the case of Japan, the dominant issuance amount of the 10,000-yen note could be attributed to the increase in 
cash hoarding driven by downward pressures in interest rates (and low rate of inflation even after massive 
monetary easing) as well as intensified tax-saving motives mentioned earlier. Otani and Suzuki (2008) estimated 
cash hoarding by choosing 1995 as the base year, assuming that transaction motive was present, but no cash 
hoarding was present, thus regarding the difference between the total 10,000-yen banknotes in circulation and 
that of the base year as the estimated amount of cash hoarding. Fujiki and Nakashima (2019) assumed that cash 
hording took place only in the form of the 10,000-yen banknote and thus estimated cash hoarding from the 
difference between all the units of 10,000-yen issued and the estimated transaction motive proxied by the 
movement of the 1,000-yen banknote (major note used in daily transactions). The paper concluded that about 40% 
of banknotes in circulation were attributed to cash hoardings, provided that the hoarding of 10,000-yen 
banknotes began in 1995.  

Regarding the United States, the rapidly rising trend of the US$100-note issuance especially after the global 
financial crisis is noted. The amount of the US$100 note issue exceeded that of the US$20 note and all other 
denominates except the US$1 note (the most frequently used note in daily transactions) in 2009 and finally 
exceeded even the amount of the $1 note in 2017. There has been no sign of reversal of these trends. According 
to the 2017 Diary of Consumer Payment Choice (DCPC) conducted by the Federal Reserve, Greene and Stavins 
(2018) found that the average value of a cash transaction was only $23, compared with $109 for the average 
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non-cash transaction (and $83 for all transactions). From the 2018 DCPC, Kumar and O’Brien (2019) pointed 

out that cash represented 50% of transactions under $10 representing and 42% of payments less than $25. In 
contrast, cash is used for approximately 10% of payments $25 and higher. This suggests that consumers 
evaluated cash highly for being low cost and easy to use. Cash is also an important payment option for 
low-income households because of the difficulty to obtain credit cards or the high annual charges associated with 
credit cards.  

Several studies pointed out that the rising trend of US$100 issuance is attributable not to only domestic demand 
but also to foreign demand, which regards the US dollar as a safe haven currency, especially from 
emerging/developing economies with unstable financial systems and weak macroeconomic fundamentals (Haasl, 
Schulhofer-Wohl, and Paulson 2018; Judson 2017). High demand for the banknotes from abroad is unique to the 
case of the US dollar, given the dominant status of the US dollar in various cross-border transactions. Foreign 
holdings of the US dollar banknotes take place through immigrants or tourists’ or other cash flows especially 

from the United States to Mexico, as well as other commercial banking and non-banking cross-border cash 
transfer channels. Judson (2017) found that foreign demand for the US dollar has increased from the 1990s to 
early 2000s—a period that coincided with external uncertainties (such as the fall of the Berlin Wall, the collapse 
of the Soviet Union, and several economic and political crises in Latin America). After such demand stabilized, 
the global financial crisis has given rise to renewed demand for US dollar banknotes and rising demand 
continues until the present. Judson also estimated that such foreign demand has accounted for more than 60% of 
all US dollar banknotes and nearly 80% of $100 banknotes.  

 
Figure 3(1). Banknotes Issued by Denomination in Japan (Unit: Billions) 

Source: CEIC 

 
Figure 3(2). Banknotes Issued in Korea by Denomination (Unit: Billions) 

Source: CEIC 
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Figure 3(3). Banknotes Issued in the United States by Denomination (Unit: Billions) 

Source: CEIC 

 

3.2 Economies with Greater Demand for Middle-Value Banknotes 
As for the second group, the outstanding amount issued over medium-denomination banknotes has dominated 
that of other larger-denomination and small-denomination banknotes. This is because the public use cash only 
for lower-value transactions and use credit cards or other cashless payment tools for higher-value transactions. 
For example, Canada has used the 20 Canadian dollar banknotes dominantly over the period and the gap 
between it and the largest-denomination (100 Canadian dollar) banknotes has remained large (Figure 3(4)). The 
Euro Area was dominated by the €50 banknote, followed by the €20 banknote so that the outstanding amounts 

issued of the €500 banknote, the €200 banknote, and the €100 banknote remained small (Figure 3(5)). In Poland, 

the value of outstanding issued 100 Poland zloty banknote has been dominant and has widened the gap with that 
of the 500 and the 200 Poland zloty banknotes (Figure 3(6)). In the United Kingdom, the outstanding amount 
issued on the £100 banknote has remained dominant and the gaps with the larger-denomination £500 banknote 
and £200 banknote have expanded over time (Figure 3(7)).  

In the case of the Euro Area, the outstanding amount issued on the €500 note issued was never large as compared 
to other smaller-denomination banknotes such as the €50 and the €20 banknotes despite the adoption of various 

unconventional monetary easing tools including the large-scale asset purchase program and the negative interest 
rate policy. It may be related to the fact that the residents in the Euro Area maintained smaller-denomination 
banknotes for daily transactions and did not increase precautionary demand for cash. The ECB conducted a 
survey in 2016 to analyze the use of cash, cards, and other payment instruments used at points of sale (POS) by 
Euro Area households (Esselink and Hernández 2017). The survey results indicated that nearly two-thirds of the 
transactions were below €15. Moreover, two-thirds of all transactions took place in shops for purchases of 
day-to-day items, as well as in restaurants, bars, and cafés. On the other hand, only 8% of all transactions were 
above €50, and only 14% were made in shops for durable goods or in petrol stations. The report stated that 
access to payment cards could not be a major factor in explaining the payment behavior due to there being high 
access on average in the region; nevertheless, a negative relationship appeared to exist between card acceptance 
and cash usage. The limited usage of the €500 note indicates that the adverse impact of the ECB’s decision in 

2016 to stop printing the €500 note from the end of April 2019 (although continuing to circulate in the economy 

as legal tender) had limited impact on the economy. 
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Figure 3(4). Banknotes Issued by Denomination in Canada (Unit: Billions) 

Source: CEIC 

 

Figure 3(5). Banknotes Issued by Denomination in the Euro Area (Unit: Billions) 

Source: CEIC 

 
Figure 3(6). Banknotes Issued by Denomination in Poland (Unit: Billions) 

Source: CEIC 
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Figure 3(7). Banknotes Issued by Denomination in the United Kingdom (Unit: Billions) 

Source: CEIC 

 
4. Empirical Analysis on Cash Demand in Advanced and Emerging/Developing Economies 
This section develops several econometric models and conducts pooled-data regressions for the 22 economies 
based on the following generic equation:  

 

Cash in circulation to nominal GDP ratio for CASH is set as the dependent variable. Among independent 
variables, the central bank policy interest rate (INTEREST) or the yield of the benchmark 10-year yield 
(10-YEAR) is used to capture the opportunity cost. As for the precautionary motive, crisis dummy variable 
(CRISIS) is adopted, where the variable is set equal to one during the IT bubble burst in early 2000 (from the 
second quarter of 2000 to the third quarter of 2001) and the global financial crisis (from the second quarter of 
2007 to the first quarter of 2009), and zero otherwise. As age-related factors, AGE is used interchangeably with 
log (LIFE). The logarithmic form is used for LIFE to enable measuring the impact of its change on the 
dependent variable in a percentage term. The term i refers to country index, while t refers to time index. 

refers to the error term for the respective economy. The Hausman test is conducted to select the appropriate 
form (between the random-effect or fixed-effect) for each model. 

The signs of parameters in the model are expected to be negative for INTEREST and 10-YEAR and positive for 
AGE, log (LIFE), and CRISIS. An increase in the INTEREST (or the 10-YEAR) variable is expected to reduce 
demand for cash, as an interest rate increase implies rising opportunity cost of holding cash. The increase in the 
AGE (or log(LIFE)) variable is expected to increase demand for cash, as the elder cohort prefer to hold cash than 
the younger ones due to habitual or affinity reasons. A crisis is expected to increase households’ demand for cash 

due to precautionary reason.  

Table 1 shows the results of the models with relatively good performance: Model (1), with INTEREST and AGE 
as independent variables; Model (2), with INTEREST and log (LIFE) as independent variables; and Model (3), 
with 10-YEAR and log (LIFE) as independent variables. Table 1 does not display models that incorporate the 
CRISIS variable, as it was not statistically significant in the models; this implies that crisis was not a major 
determinant for cash hoarding once covering the 22 economies in the sample.  

Results from Model (1) exhibited that INTEREST and AGE were statistically significant, with a negative sign on 
INTEREST and a positive sign on AGE. These signs were in line with the hypotheses. This suggests that for the 
22 economies combined, the central bank policy rate hike reduced demand for cash, while an increase in the 
ratio of elderly population increased demand for cash. Both INTEREST and log (LIFE) were statistically 
significant in Model (2). The parameter sign for INTEREST was negative, while positive for log (LIFE) — in 
line with the hypotheses. Similar to Model (1), demand for cash increased when life expectancy rose, but it fell 
when the policy rates increased. As proxy for opportunity cost, 10-YEAR was less robust than INTEREST as a 
regressor in the pooled-data models. Results from Model (3) showed that the 10-YEAR and log (LIFE) variables 
were statistically significant, with a negative sign for 10-YEAR and positive for log (LIFE). Yet, in the model 
using 10-YEAR and AGE as independent variables, it turned out that 10-YEAR was not statistically significant, 
while AGE remained statistically significant.    
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Table 1. Pooled-Data Regression Results for the 22 Economies 

(Probability of t-statistics in bracket, * = significant at 5% significance level) 

MODEL 1 MODEL 2 MODEL 3 

Constant 1.7877* (0.0346) Constant -64.4437* (0.0000) Constant -72.7090* (0.0000)  

INTEREST 

(%) 

-0.0162* (0.0000) INTEREST 

(%) 

-0.0122* (0.0000)  10-YEAR (%) -0.0652* (0.0000) 

AGE (%) 0.3811* (0.0000) Log (LIFE) 17.2276* (0.0000) Log (LIFE) 18.2785* (0.0000) 

Random Effects Coefficients (Cross) Fixed Effects Coefficients (Cross) Fixed Effects Coefficients (Cross) 

_Australia -3.9408 _Australia -3.5006 _Australia -3.7631 

_Canada -4.8990 _Canada -3.7581 _Canada -4.0857 

_Denmark -0.6594 _Denmark -3.3173 _Denmark -3.6377 

_Euro Area 6.1656 _Euro Area 1.0526 _Euro Area 0.6967 

_Japan -2.8132 _Japan 8.7332 _Japan 8.2646 

_Korea -5.6550 _Korea -3.9400 _Korea -4.2019 

_Norway 1.8051 _Norway -5.0321 _Norway -5.7552 

_Singapore -6.0034 _Singapore 0.0783 _Singapore -0.4282 

_Sweden -5.1291 _Sweden -4.2778 _Sweden -5.1914 

_Utd. Kingdom -0.6614 _Utd. Kingdom -3.7920 _Utd. 

Kingdom 

-4.0926 

_United States -1.0866 _United States -0.3497 _United States -0.6184 

_Brazil 5.6836 _Brazil -2.1657 _Brazil -1.9685 

_China 7.2645 _China 5.1633 _China 3.6757 

_India 0.9613 _India 7.4676 _India 7.5922 

_Indonesia 2.9679 _Indonesia 0.3533 _Indonesia 0.7204 

_Malaysia 0.5760 _Malaysia 1.0694 _Malaysia 0.9763 

_Mexico 2.5939 _Mexico -1.5151 _Mexico -1.3618 

_Philippines -0.3385 _Philippines 1.6567 _Philippines 1.7516 

_Poland 3.1243 _Poland 0.6448 _Poland 0.4499 

_Russia 4.6195 _Russia 5.3306 _Russia 5.5561 

_Thailand -1.2731 _Thailand 4.3703 _Thailand 4.1772 

_Turkey -1.0866 _Turkey -2.2893 _Turkey -1.9811 

Weighted Statistics   

R-squared 0.2855 R-squared 0.9515 R-squared 0.9618 

Adj. R-squared 0.2845 Adj. R-squared 0.9506 Adj. R-squared 0.9611 

Prob (F-stats.) 0.0000* Prob (F-stats.) 0.0000* Prob (F-stats.) 0.0000* 
Source: Authors’ calculations  
 
5. Conclusion 
This paper focused on the movements of cash in circulation by investigating demand-driven factors contributing 
to the movements for the period 2000–2018. It focused on the time-series movements of cash in circulation (both 
in terms of the amount and nominal GDP) among 22 economies for the period 2000–2018. The results of the 
analysis can be summarized as follows:  

� Among the 11 advanced economies with regards to the trend related to cash-nominal GDP ratio, there were 
economies with a rising trend (the Euro Area, Japan, Korea, Singapore, the United Kingdom, and the United 
States), economies roughly with a stable or constant trend (Australia and Canada), and economies with a 
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declining trend (Demark, Norway, and Sweden). Regarding the economies with a rising trend, the rising 
pace accelerated especially after the economic uncertainty rose as a result of the global financial crisis of 
2008–2009. As for the amount of cash in circulation, all the economies except Sweden from 2009 and 
Norway from 2017 showed a secular rising trend. In particular, Japan’s substantially high and rising 

cash-nominal GDP ratio is noticeable, perhaps reflecting the public’s trust in the stable government and 

legal tender in the face of persistently-low inflation; a limited number of crimes associated with cash 
handlings and counterfeiting; and, the highest proportion of the elderly in total population.  

� As for the 11 emerging/developing economies, all the economies recorded the secular rising trend from early 
2000s concerning the amount of cash in circulation. Some divergent movements were observed with regards 
to the ratio of cash-nominal GDP ratios. The economies with the rising cash-nominal GDP ratio included 
Mexico, the Philippines, Poland, and Thailand—all growing from early 2000s. Meanwhile, the economies 
with the declining cash-nominal GDP ratio included China from early 2000s and Turkey since 2017. India 
experienced a sharp drop in the amount and the ratio in October–November 2016 due to the impact of the 
demonetization currency reform. Finally, the economies with a more or less stable cash-nominal GDP ratio 
included Brazil, Indonesia, Malaysia, and Russia.  

� With regards to the seven economies where data on banknotes in circulation differentiated by denomination 
are available, the economies were found to be classified into two groups: economies with dominant 
highest-denomination banknotes (Japan, Korea, and the United States) and economies with 
lower-denomination banknotes (Canada, the Euro Area, Poland, and the United Kingdom). The former 
group may indicate the presence of high and rising demand for cash hoarding since high-denomination 
banknotes are best suited for this purpose. In addition, the rising trend of the highest denomination, US$100, 
could be attributable not to only domestic demand-driven factors but also to foreign demand that regards the 
US dollar as a safe haven currency. As for the second group, the outstanding amount issued over 
medium-denomination banknotes has dominated that of other higher-denomination and lower-denomination 
banknotes. This is because the public use cash only for lower-value transactions and use credit cards or other 
cashless payment tools for higher-value transactions.  

� This paper found empirically that the low interest rate environment generated by massive monetary easing 
contributed to increasing demand for cash based on the data including advanced economies and 
emerging/developing economies. Age-related factors were also found to be important contributor to higher 
cash demand. As a future topic, it will be interesting to examine whether demand for cash will decline if 
stable crypto assets such as Facebook’s Libra—which will stabilize the value against the basket of reputable, 
fiat currencies such as the US dollar— become widely used in the world.  
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APPENDIX Figure 1. Cash in Circulation in the Advanced Economies (% of Nominal GDP, 2002 Q1=100) 

 

(1) Australia                    (2) Canada 

 
(3) Denmark           (4) Euro Area 

 

(5) Japan                        (6) Korea 



http://ibr.ccsenet.org     International Business Research                   Vol. 12, No. 12; 2019 

90 
 

 
(7) Norway               (8) Singapore 

 
(9) Sweden                 (10) United Kingdom 

     
     (11) United States 

Source: CEIC  
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APPENDIX Figure 2. Cash in Circulation in the Emerging/Developing Economies (% of Nominal GDP, 2002 
Q1=100) 

 
(1) Brazil                   (2) China 

 
(3) India                  (4) Indonesia 

 
(5) Malaysia                   (6) Mexico 
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(7) Philippines                       (8) Poland 

 
(9) Russia                     (10) Thailand 

   
(11) Turkey 

Source: CEIC 
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Abstract 
Information and communication technology ICT infrastructure is an essential foundation of the information 
society characterized by modernization and advance. ICT infrastructure consists of main five elements including 
physical resources, human resources, software, databases and networks and communication. The study aims at 
identifying the impact of the development of ICT infrastructure, which includes physical and human resources, 
software, databases and networks and communications, on the effectiveness of accounting information systems. 
To achieve the purposes of the study, a researcher has used a descriptive research methodology; a questionnaire has 
been distributed to the employees at various management and accounting positions in the bank. 

The study found that the developments of ICT infrastructure, consisting of physical and human resources, software, 
databases and networks and communications, affects extremely the effectiveness and security of accounting 
information systems. 

Keywords: information technology, effectiveness of information technology, information security 

1. Introduction  

Accounting information system is a significant part of business organizations and a main source of planning and 
monitoring processes. Availability of effectiveness property of accounting information system, therefore, is one of 
main factors of business organizations’ success, particularly banks. ICT is a competitive feature in banking sector; 

it is used for providing banking services, transaction and banking processes. In addition, ICT provides 
management department with information on planning, monitoring and decision-making which mainly contributes 
to rationalize the decisions and succeed the administrative processes. Thus, providing such information meets 
management needs and contributes to achieve bank goals . 

Effectiveness of accounting information systems is linked to a provision of ICT infrastructure which consists of 
physical and human resources, software, databases, and networks and communications providing and processing 
the data . 

In light of the use of wire and wireless communication technology, banks shall provide programs of accounting 
data protection and confidentiality; bank and clients data shall be protected against the penetration which may 
distort bank reputation and cause financial losses. In addition, human resources specializing in these systems shall 
be provided; one of the most significant elements of infrastructure of banking accounting information systems is 
database. Techniques of the database and technological cloud systems have been developed in order to save the 
data and perform the processes . 

Accordingly, Jordanian banking sector seeks to develop IT infrastructure and security and keep up with the 
changes and risks of accounting information systems; it also tries to ensure the effectiveness of accounting 
information systems and achieve competition feature . 

2. Purposes of the Study 

The study aims at identifying the following: 

-The most important development of the elements of ICTinfrastructure and its role in achieving the effectiveness 
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of accounting information system in Jordanian banks. 

-To which extent Jordanian banks pay attention to develop ICT infrastructure and security and its impact on 
achieving the effectiveness of accounting information systems. 

-The impact of the development of infrastructure elements, including physical and human resources, software, 
database, communications and networks, on achieving the effectiveness of accounting information system in 
banking sector. 

-The role of the development of information security systems in Jordanian banking sector in achieving the 
effectiveness of accounting information systems. 

3. Importance of the Study 

This study is important because it identifies the development of IT infrastructure and its role in the effectiveness of 
accounting information systems in banking sector, the most significant part of economic sector . 

This sector seeks to use highly IT in order to provide banking services and prepare the data. At present, banks 
depends greatly on ICT through using electronic sites in order to provide the services. However, using ICT is 
usually accompanied with various risks. Jordanian banks, therefore, seek to provide security and protection 
methods evolved according to the development of IT infrastructure and uses. As a result, the accompanied risks 
which may damage the accounting information and cause financial losses may be reduced. Consequently, a 
harmony between the development of IT infrastructure and its security shall be provided in order to achieve the 
effectiveness of accounting information systems .  

4. Problem of the Study  

Accelerated development of accounting information technology and its infrastructure is linked to information 
security in a way that achieves the effectiveness of accounting information systems. This study aims to answer the 
following questions : 

-Does the development of ICT infrastructure, including physical and financial resources, software, databases, 
communication and networks, affect the effectiveness of e-banking information systems in Jordanian banks? 

-Does the development of information system infrastructure and data security contribute to achieve the 
effectiveness of e-banking accounting systems in Jordanian banks ? 

5. Hypotheses of the Study  

The study tests the following hypotheses :-  

First hypothesis: There is no statistically significant relationship between the development of ICT infrastructure, 
including physical and financial resources, software, databases, communication and networks, and its security and 
the effectiveness of accounting information systems in Jordanian banks . 

The study also tests the following sub-hypotheses related to the elements of ICT infrastructure : 

There is no statistically significant relationship between the development of physical resources as a part of ICT 
infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in Jordanian banks . 

There is no statistically significant relationship between the development of software as a part of ICT infrastructure 
and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in Jordanian banks. 

There is no statistically significant relationship between the development of databases as a part of ICT 
infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in Jordanian banks. 

There is no statistically significant relationship between the development of human resources as a part of ICT 
infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in Jordanian banks. 

There is no statistically significant relationship between the development of communications and networks as a 
part of ICT infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in Jordanian banks. 

Second hypothesis: There is no statistically significant relationship between the development of information 
security system as a part of ICT infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in 
Jordanian banks. 

6. Previous Studies and Theoretical Framework 

Siyam study (2004), entitled ‘Evaluation of the Effectiveness of Computerized Accounting Information Systems 
In Jordanian Commercial banks in the light of technological development’, touched upon the evaluation of the 

effectiveness of accounting information systems; it examined a set of standards (i.e quality, flexibility, simplicity 
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and reliability) which reflect the effectiveness of the performance of these systems. The researcher designed a 
questionnaire distributed to financial managers and employees working in financial departments of (9) nine 
Jordanian commercial banks listed in stock marks (Amman Stock Exchange) of the year of 2003. 45 
questionnaires were distributed; 42 questionnaires were valid for the purposes of the analysis. The study found that 
computerized accounting information systems in Jordanian commercial banks have been characterized by the 
quality due to the accuracy and adequacy of the outputs of these systems in the light of technological development. 
In addition, the study showed that computerized accounting information systems in Jordanian commercial banks 
have been characterized by the flexibility, simplicity and reliability in the light of technological development; these 
features have been listed in a descending order as follows: quality, reliability, flexibility and simplicity. The study 
recommended that computerized accounting information systems should be developed . 

Qatawneh study (2005), entitled ‘Impact of the Use of Information Technology On the Effectiveness of accounting 

information systems: A case study of Banks and Insurance Companies listed in Amman Stock Exchange’, aimed at 

identifying the impact of the use of information technology on the effectiveness of accounting information systems 
in banks and insurance companies listed in Amman Stock Exchange. The researcher designed two questionnaires 
in order to achieve the purposes of the study; the first aimed at measuring the effectiveness of accounting system; 
the second aimed at measuring the impact of information technology on the effectiveness of accounting 
information systems. Numbers of insurance and bank facilities were 10 and 13, respectively; 138 questionnaires 
had been distributed to 138 and 113 had been valid for analysing. The study found that the use of information 
system affected the effectiveness of accounting information systems; the most important factor has been the use of 
communication networks, followed by hardware and software, then databases. The study indicated that technology 
levels used by banking sector are higher than that used by insurance companies. The study recommended that 
information technology should be increasingly invested; technological developments should be kept with.  

Fadel study (2007), entitled ‘ Extent of the Impact of Environmental, Regulatory, Behavioural, and Technological 
Factors on the Effectiveness of Accounting Information Systems in Commercial Banks in Republic of Yemen: A 
field Study’, aimed at identifying the extent of the impact of environmental, regulatory, behavioural, and 
technological factors on the effectiveness of accounting information systems, whether these factors have been 
taken together or independently in financial departments and accounting sections. A study sample was composed 
of 340 employees working in Yemeni commercial banks. 172 questionnaires were analysed. The study found that 
when these factors were taken together, the technological and regulatory factors had affected the effectiveness of 
accounting information system. However, when these factors were taken independently, each one had a clear and 
positive impact on the effectiveness of accounting information systems used in Yemeni commercial banks. The 
study recommended that the employees and users should involve in the design and development of accounting 
information systems; computers and advanced software should be used; administrative decentralization system 
should be expanded . 

Ghassan Falah Al-Matarneh and Jamal Adel Al-Shrairi study (2009), entitled ‘Impact of Information Technology 

on The Effectiveness of Accounting Information Systems in Jordanian pharmaceutical companies’, aimed at 

identifying the impact of information technology on the effectiveness of accounting information systems in 
Jordanian pharmaceutical companies; it also was to identify the impact of the use of hardware, software and 
databases on the effectiveness of accounting information systems in these companies. To achieve study purposes 
and to test study hypotheses, a questionnaire was designed and distributed to study sample composed of 42 
respondents. Arithmetic mean, standard deviation and t-test were used for testing the hypotheses. The study found 
that using IT, hardware, software and databases affected the effectiveness of accounting information systems. The 
researcher recommended that the use of accounting and administrative information technology should be 
developed in accordance with work requirements and changes of external environment . 

7. Theoretical Framework of Study  

Due to new work environment, work organizations are forced to develop their traditional businesses and switch to 
e-business which is in line with modern tools and methods. At a present, businesses are directly provided on line 
via websites. In addition, financial statements are presented and submitted through e-disclosure via company 
website and Securities Commission website. Hence, IT infrastructure is important because it contributes greatly to 
achieve systems’ goals and improve making-decision processes which depend on accurate and speedy information. 
Providing a sophisticated infrastructure with high capabilities of processing accounting data and information via 
new communication channels may increase the speed of information flow and exchange among administrative 
departments. The researchers unanimously agreed that the components of IT infrastructure are physical and human 
resources, software, databases and wireless networks ( Loudon & laden 2003:176) and (Al-Abbadi 2006 pp. 
36-45 .(Effectiveness of accounting information systems is an ability of accounting system to achieve its goals 
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such as a provision of appropriate and reliable information which helps decision-makers achieve their goals 
( karfou, Mohsen, and Ahmad, 2016, P. 278 .( 

Al-Matarneh and Al-Sharairi, 2010, P.102 pointed out that effectiveness of accounting information technology is 
the ability of the system to achieve its planned and desired goals . 

The researcher has believed that if e-banking accounting system is effective, it will be able to achieve its assigned 
goals. Accordingly, the system is less or more effective according to its ability to achieve the assigned and desired 
goals. Regarding information security, accounting information system operates within a secure environment which 
makes the financial and accounting statements more reliable, confidential and integrated. In addition, accounting 
information is protected against the risks and threats which accompany IT . 

Next section of the study outlines the role of IT infrastructure and security in the effectiveness of e-accounting 
information systems . 

8. Physical Resource as a Part of IT Infrastructure in the Banks and Its Role in Achieving the Effectiveness 
of E-accounting Information Systems 

Physical Resources are the equipment and hardware used for performing information systems’ activities and tasks 

such as data entry, processing and output (Al-Shammari, 2013,P.12). The researcher believes that e-banking 
system infrastructure system is composed of banking data entry units, processing hardware and storage units. Then, 
the branch saves all the data in database until the end of accounting period including processes and operation files 
in order to be used at the end of fiscal year for preparing yearly financial report and interim data. Due to the 
development of banking information system, Banks have used large-sized computers for processing banking 
operations and terminal units for saving the data then transferring them to the management. However, small-sized 
computers, mobile devices and tablets have recently be used for data entry and processing by the banks because of 
the continuous development of computers. In addition, the banks have used a set of devices such as data readers 
which read cheques’ data. Data entry and processing’s development contributes to achieve the effectiveness of 

accounting information systems through the availability of the accuracy and reliability of data entry, thereby 
achieving the reliability of banking accounting data processing. With regard to the development of storage units 
and data transmission means, the development of material unit contributes to use databases, e-clouds which 
achieve confidentiality, reliability and integration of preparing e-banking accounting data and the speed of access 
to the data .  

9. Software as a Part of IT infrastructure in the Banks and Its Role in Achieving the Effectiveness of 
E-accounting Information Systems 

Software applied by e-banking accounting information system controls and manages physical resources through a 
set of detailed instructions and orders; it also controls all system operations and contributes to achieve accounting 
information system’s goals; by using such system, specialized human resources can retrieve or modify the data, 

when necessary . 

Software of e-banking accounting information system is composed of a set of programs required for operating the 
devices which regulate and control software’s parts and accessories plus software applications specialized in 

banking works . 

The development of software as a part of accounting information system infrastructure contributes to achieve the 
effectiveness of e-banking accounting system; working mechanism of material components of data processing and 
access are controlled; in addition, the data can be modified in order to achieve the reliability and integration . 

Moreover, software of processing of banking operations has been developed; banking operations are processed and 
controlled by specialized advanced accounting banking applications. Banking software has evolved into electronic 
applications the clients can use for processing banking operations via electronic means such as smart phones and 
tablets; software of accounting information security attached to e-banking accounting applications has been 
developed in order to achieve the security of accounting information and ensure the confidentiality and reliability 
of banking accounting data; security and protection programs allow only authorized employees to access the data. 

10. Human resource as a Part of IT infrastructure in the Banks and Its Role in Achieving the Effectiveness 
of E-accounting Information Systems 

Human resource is one of significant components of IT infrastructure and contributes greatly to the success of 
accounting information system. Employees, therefore, shall be know the methods of using physical resources, 
software and operating this system. In addition, they shall know the methods of processing and preparing 
accounting data and reports. Continuous training for the employees contributes to achieve the effectiveness of 
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accounting information system . 

11. Database as a Part of IT infrastructure in the Banks and Its Role in Achieving the Effectiveness of 
E-accounting Information Systems 

Database is one of essential components of IT infrastructure of e-banking accounting information system; it is a set 
of files and data linked mutually and organized within a logical framework; they are saved and can be retrieved in 
order to prepare necessary information. Database allows for data sharing among data users in work organizations 
including banks. The users are able to share the data when necessary; data sharing is managed in order to maintain 
data security through programs of database management; these programs can be used to protect the data against 
unauthorized access; they also ensure data reliability and the confidentiality and integration of preparing the data .  

12. Networks and Communication Systems as Parts of IT infrastructure in the Banks and their Role in 
Achieving the Effectiveness of E-accounting Information Systems 

Networks and communication systems are essential parts of modern e-banking accounting system; they contribute 
deeply to the success of banking activities and operations; in addition, they are key factors achieving competitive 
advantage and increasing bank profitability . 

Networks and communication systems connect the operations and systems altogether; Networks and 
communication systems make data transferring and sharing inside the bank and between various banks and the 
central bank and correspondent banks easier; it is noted that various services provided by ATMs are acceptable; 
banking systems use a set of networks and communication systems which can be divided into : 

13. Specialized Internal Computer Networks 

They aim at providing a certain level of data protection and privacy while data is transferred and shared between 
bank branches, management and internal sections. These network applications are only used by authorized 
employees working in the banks; the banks can also use internal mail as e-application . 

14. Internet 
The bank uses internet in various fields; internet used by the bank includes a set of specialized protection programs 
with high levels of quality; the bank may use bank websites in order to provide e-banking services. Moreover, 
internet can be used to exchange the information and e-mails between correspondent banks, general administration 
and the central bank . 

15. Extranet 
It is an internal communication network which allows authorized persons to access a local network and perform 
certain tasks. Communication systems such as wire communications, wire transmission lines, data sharing and 
accessing, wireless communications, have highly developed. Because of continuous development of 
communication systems, various data protection programs have been invented and developed. Such programs 
protect the data against unauthorized access and modification, abuse of the banks and clients. Accordingly, these 
systems contribute to achieve the effectiveness of e-accounting system . 

16. Field Study  

Study Methodology 

Analytical descriptive method has been used for describing accurately a phenomenon as it is in the reality. In 
addition, it has expressed the phenomenon quantitatively and qualitatively. It has based on two sources to collect 
the data : 

Primary sources 

A questionnaire has been designed and distributed to the employees working in various positions in Jordanian 
banks including bank branch manager, assistant branch manager, head of department, internal auditor. 

Secondary sources 

They include the literatures such as books, periodicals, researchers, reports, Arab and foreign publications related 
to the subject of the study. They also consist of governmental documents, laws and relevant systems . 

Study Tool  
The questionnaire has been designed to collect the data required for achieving study goals. likert five point scale 
has been employed in order to measure respondents’ agreement with all questionnaire statements. The data has 
been converted into numerical results which can be statistically measured and described. Likert scale has five 
points as follows: agree strongly, agree, undecided, disagree, and disagree strongly. Numerical values range from 
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1-5, respectively; these values give the weight of the responses . 

Study Population and Sample  

Study population consists of 15 banks listed in Amman Stock Exchange; 4 questionnaires have been distributed to 
each bank; 60 questionnaires have been distributed; 50 valid questionnaires have been retrieved . 

17. Validity and Reliability of Study Tool  
Validity of Study Tool  
The questionnaire has been arbitrated by a group of academic professors specializing in accounting, auditing and 
statistics for ensuring the validity; their notes have been taken into consideration and some statements have been 
reformulated in order to achieve consistency and balance among questionnaire statements . 

Reliability of Study Tool  
Cronbach’s alpha coefficient has been used for testing the validity of questionnaire results and an availability of 

internal consistency among questionnaire statements; an acceptable value of Alpha coefficient is 60% or more. 
Alpha coefficient has been applied to all parts of questionnaire; Table 1 illustrates that the value of Cronbach’s 

alpha coefficient of respondents’ answers to all questions and fields is higher than the acceptable value. It means 
that a high degree of internal consistency is available. As a result, study tool has a high level of reliability and its 
answers can be adopted for achieving study goals and analyzing the results. Table below outlines the results of 
Cronbach’s alpha test : 

 

Table 1. Consistency Coefficients extracted by Cronbach’s Alpha 

Results  
Field Result Alpha Coefficient Number of 

Question 
Accepted 87 5 Development of physical resource as a part of ICT 

infrastructure in the banks and its role in achieving the 
effectiveness of e-accounting information systems 

Accepted 72 15 Development of software as a part of ICT infrastructure in the 
banks and its role in achieving the effectiveness of 
e-accounting information systems 

Accepted 97 11 Development of database as a part of ICT infrastructure in the 
banks and its role in achieving the effectiveness of 
e-accounting information systems 

Accepted 86 7 Development of human resource as a part of ICT 
infrastructure in the banks and its role in achieving the 
effectiveness of e-accounting information systems 

Accepted 86 8 Development of communications and network systems as part 
of ICT infrastructure in the banks and their role in achieving 
the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems 

Accepted 82 15 Development of information security as a part of ICT 
infrastructure in the banks and its role in achieving the 
effectiveness of e-accounting information systems 
 
18. Descriptive Analysis of Sample Study’s Response  

Respondents’ answers have been analysed by using statistical package for social science; the following statistical 

methods have been used: 

Cronbach’s Alpha Test: It tests the internal consistency and reliability of measurement tool . 

Arithmetic means: they identify the rate of response of respondents according to study variables . 

Standard deviations: they are used for measuring the degree of absolute dispersion that represents answers’ 

values. 

One sample T-test: It is used for testing study hypotheses . 

Criteria of Descriptive Analysis  

Each set of questions which reflect study hypotheses has been named a field. For the purposes of data 
characterization and identification of respondents’ opinions on questionnaire’s statements and study fields, each 

statement has been divided according to likert five point scale as the following : 
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Classification Extremely 
influential 

Very influential Somewhat 
influential 

Slightly 
influential 

Not at all 
influential 

Encoding  5 4 3 2 1 
 

According to table above, adopted arithmetic mean is 3; it is extracted from a sum of values which is divided by 
values’ number. Adopted influence ratio is 3 divided by 5, i.e 60%. Accordingly, the values of arithmetic means, 
reached by the study, are processed in order to interpret the data as the following: 

1 2 3 4 5 
Not at all influential Slightly influential Somewhat influential Very influential Extremely influential 

1-1.79  1.80-2.59  2.60-2.59  3.40-4.19  4.20-5  
The development of 
ICT infrastructure does 
not influence the 
effectiveness of 
e-accounting 
information 
technology at all 

The development of 
ICT infrastructure 
influences slightly the 
effectiveness of 
e-accounting 
information 
technology  

The development of 
ICT infrastructure 
influences moderately 
the effectiveness of 
e-accounting 
information technology  

The development of 
ICT infrastructure 
influences highly 
the effectiveness of 
e-accounting 
information 
technology  

The development of 
ICT infrastructure 
influences extremely 
the effectiveness of 
e-accounting 
information 
technology  

 
19. Data Analysis and Study Hypotheses Testing  

This section outlines and discusses the results the field study has reached in the light of study goals, questions and 
hypotheses . 

First Hypothesis Testing  

 First hypothesis states that there is no statistically significant relationship between the development of ICT 
infrastructure, including physical and financial resources, software, databases, communication and networks, and 
its security and the effectiveness of accounting information systems in Jordanian banks. The study also tests the 
following sub-hypotheses related to the elements of ICT infrastructure. Sub-hypotheses have been firstly tested; 
then first main hypothesis has been tested . 

First Sub-hypothesis Testing  

In order to validate this hypothesis, arithmetic means and standard deviations have been extracted; the relation 
between the development of physical resource as a part of ICT infrastructure and the effectiveness of the 
effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in Jordanian banks has been measured. Table 3 outlines 
arithmetic means and standard deviations. 

Table 3. Arithmetic mean and standard deviation of the development of physical resource as a part of ICT 
infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information system  

Statements  Arithmetic mean Standard Deviation Answer Orientation  
Following statements measure to which extent the development of physical resource as a part of ICT infrastructure in the banks 
contributes to achieve the effectiveness of accounting information systems: 
The development of using modern and sophisticated 
hardware and devices in banking operations 
contributes to achieve the effectiveness of 
e-accounting information systems 

4 0.49 Very influential  

periodical update and maintenance of hardware and 
devices contribute to achieve the effectiveness of 
e-accounting information systems  

4.14 0.49 Very influential 

Hardware and devices used for processing and 
entering the data are compatible with the nature and 
number of the users and work nature and contribute to 
achieve the effectiveness of e-accounting information 
systems  

4.71 0.49 Extremely influential  

Hardware and devices are compatible with operation 
systems applied by the banks in the manner that 
achieves the effectiveness of e-accounting 
information systems 

4.71 0.49 Extremely influential  

Hardware and devices of alternative energy shall be 
provided in order to cope with power outages or and 
malfunction of e-system, thereby achieving the 
effectiveness of e-accounting information system  

4.71 0.49 Extremely influential  

Total  4.39 0.45 Extremely influential  
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The responses stated above have illustrated that the development of physical resource has extremely and 
positively influenced. In addition, they have showed that the development of using modern and advanced 
hardware and devices contributes to achieve the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in the banks; 
total calculated arithmetic mean has been 4.39, which is higher than hypothetical mean which is 3. Accordingly, 
responses’ orientation has indicated that the development of physical resources has extremely influenced .  

In addition, arithmetic mean of the statements which form first sub- hypothesis has been compared with standard 
mark 3- hypothesis acceptance standard- by using t-test as stated in table 4 . 

 

Table 4. Arithmetic Means, Standard Deviations and T-test of Statements which form the First Sub-Hypothesis 

The development of 
physical resource as a 
part of ICT in the 
banks has influenced 
the effectiveness of 
accounting information 
systems: 

Number Arithmetic 
Mean 

Standard 
Deviation 

T-Value Freedom 
Degree 

Statistical 
Significance 

50 4.39 .45  10.967 21 .000  

 
Table 4 has indicated that there are statistical differences at ( =0.05) between arithmetic mean and standard 
deviation 3; T-value has been 10.967; statistical significance has been 0.000. Thus, the hypothesis, stating that 
there is no statistically significant relationship between the development of physical resource as a part of ICT 
infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in Jordanian banks, has been rejected; 
alternative hypothesis, stating that there is statistically significant relationship between the development of 
physical resource as a part of ICT infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in 
Jordanian banks, has been accepted . 

Second Sub-hypothesis Testing  

In order to validate this hypothesis, arithmetic means and standard deviations have been extracted for measuring 
the relation between the influence of the development of software and the effectiveness of e-accounting 
information systems. Table 5 outlines arithmetic means and standard deviation . 

 

Table 5. Arithmetic Means and Standard Deviation of the Impact of Software on the Effectiveness of 
E-Accounting Information System 

Statements  Arithmetic mean Standard Deviation Answer Orientation  
Following statements measure to which extent the development of software as a part of ICT infrastructure in the banks 
contributes to achieve the effectiveness of accounting information systems: 
Banking Applications ( Specialized Software ( 
Latest software used by Jordanian banks 
contributes to achieve the effectiveness of 
accounting information systems 

4.41 0.90 Very influential  

The development of programs used by 
Jordanian banks contributes to achieve 
the effectiveness of accounting 
information systems 

4.41 0.90 Very extremely 

Banks update the software required for 
management requirements in order to 
achieve the effectiveness of accounting 
information systems 

4.71 0.49 Extremely influential 

Using modern and advanced software in 
data processing contributes to achieve the 
accuracy of accounting data . 

4.43 0.98 Very influential  

Using modern and advanced software 
contributes to achieve the speediness of 
accounting data. 

4.41 0.90 Very influential  

Using modern and advanced software 
contributes to achieve the integration of 
accounting data. 

4.41 0.90 Very influential  

Jordanian banks use software which is 
characterized by easiness and flexibility 
of use. 

4.71 0.49 Extremely influential 
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Operation systems 
Modern and advanced operation systems 
used by Jordanian banks contribute to 
achieve the effectiveness of accounting 
information systems  

4.71 0.49 Extremely influential 

Using modern and advanced operation 
systems contributes to achieve the 
integration of accounting data 

4.71 0.49 Extremely influential 

Using modern and advanced software and 
application operation systems contributes 
to achieve the accuracy of accounting 
data 

4.41 0.90 Very influential  

Operation systems used by Jordanian 
banks are characterized by easiness and 
flexibility of performing the required 
tasks. 

4.57 0.53 Extremely influential 

E-applications via cell phones: 
E-applications and programs via cell 
phones and smart devices used by 
Jordanian banks are characterized by the 
easiness of use 

4.71 0.49 Extremely influential 

 E-applications and programs via cell 
phones and smart devices used by 
Jordanian banks contribute to achieve the 
effectiveness of accounting information 
systems  

4.71 0.49 Extremely influential 

E-applications and programs via cell 
phones and smart devices used by 
Jordanian banks contribute to achieve the 
speediness of accounting information 
systems  

5 0 Extremely influential 

E-applications and programs via cell 
phones and smart devices used by 
Jordanian banks contribute to achieve the 
accuracy of accounting information 
systems 

4.71 0.49 Extremely influential 

E-applications and programs via cell 
phones and smart devices used by 
Jordanian banks contribute to achieve 
banks’ competition and profitability  

5 0 Extremely influential 

Total 4.50 0.18 Extremely influential 
 
The responses stated above have illustrated that the development of software applications and programs has 
extremely influenced the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems. Arithmetic mean has been 4.50, 
which is higher than hypothetical mean which is 3. Accordingly, responses’ orientation has indicated that the 

development of software has extremely influenced. In addition, they have showed that using modern and 
advanced software contributes to achieve the accuracy, speediness, reliability and integration of e-accounting 
information systems in the banks. 

In addition, arithmetic mean of the statements which form second hypothesis has been compared with standard 
mark 3- hypothesis acceptance standard- by using t-test as stated in table 6 .

 

Table 6. Arithmetic Means, Standard Deviations and T-test of Statements which form Second Sub Hypothesis 

the development of 
software as a part of 
ICT in the banks has 
influenced the 
effectiveness of 
accounting 
information systems: 

Number Arithmetic 
Mean 

Standard 
Deviation 

T-Value Freedom 
Degree 

Statistical 
Significance 

50 4.50 .18  10.835 21 .000  

Table 6 has 
deviation 3; T-value has been 10.835; statistical significance has been 0.000. Thus, this hypothesis has been 
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rejected; alternative hypothesis, stating that there is statistically significant relationship between the development 
of software as a part of ICT infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in Jordanian 
banks, has been accepted . 

Third Sub-hypothesis Testing 
In order to validate this hypothesis, arithmetic means and standard deviations have been extracted for measuring 
the relation between the influence of the development of database as a part of ICT infrastructure and the 
effectiveness of e-accounting information systems. Table 7 outlines arithmetic means and standard deviation . 

 

Table 7. Arithmetic Means and Standard Deviation of the Impact of database on the Effectiveness of 
E-Accounting Information System 

Statements  Arithmetic 
mean 

Standard 
Deviation 

Answer Orientation  

Following statements measure to which extent the development of database as a part of ICT infrastructure in the banks 
contributes to achieve the effectiveness of accounting information systems: 
Database characterized by the flexibility, which is in line with the 
development of IT, contributes to achieve the accuracy of 
accounting information  

4.34 1.25 Extremely influential  

Database characterized by the flexibility and modernization, which 
are in line with the development of IT, contributes to achieve the 
integration of accounting information 

4.43 0.49 Extremely influential  

Database characterized by the flexibility, which is in line with the 
development of IT, contributes to achieve the speediness of 
accounting information 

4.43 0.49 Extremely influential  

Database characterized by the flexibility, which is in line with the 
development of IT, contributes to achieve the reliability of 
accounting information 

4.43 0.49 Extremely influential 

The development of database contributes to sort and tabulate 
accounting information properly, thereby processing and providing 
easily the appropriate information 

4.43 0.82 Extremely influential  

The development of database contributes to achieve the speediness 
of response and access to information at the right time  

4.43 0.82 Extremely influential  

The development of database contributes to achieve the ability of 
database to detect errors and redundancies in accounting information 

4.34 1.25 Extremely influential 

The development of database of banking accounting systems 
contributes to provide the most useful information for planning  

5 0.82 Extremely influential 

The development of database of banking accounting systems 
contributes to provide the most useful information for controlling 

5 0.82 Extremely influential  

The development of database of banking accounting systems 
contributes to provide the most useful and effective information for 
decision-making 

4.73 0.82 Extremely influential 

Total 4.73 0.82 Extremely influential 
 

The responses stated above have illustrated that the development of database has extremely influenced the 
effectiveness of e-accounting information systems. Arithmetic mean has been 4.43, which is higher than 
hypothetical mean which is 3. Accordingly, responses’ orientation has indicated that the development of the 
database has extremely influenced the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems. In addition, they have 
showed that using advanced database contributes to achieve an integration, confidentiality and speediness of 
e-accounting information systems in the banks. 

In addition, arithmetic mean of the statements which form third sub- hypothesis has been compared with 
standard mark 3 - hypothesis acceptance standard- by using t-test as stated in table 8 . 

 

Table 8. Arithmetic Means, Standard Deviations and T-test of Statements which form Third Sub-Hypothesis 

the development of 
database as a part of ICT 
in the banks has 
influenced the 
effectiveness of 
e-accounting 
information systems: 

Number Arithmetic 
Mean 

Standard 
Deviation 

T-Value Freedom 
Degree 

Statistical 
Significance 

50 4.73 0.82 9.485 21 .000  
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deviation 3; T-value has been 9.485; statistical significance has been 0.000. Thus, this hypothesis, stating that 
there is no statistically significant relationship between the development of database as a part of ICT 
infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in Jordanian banks, has been rejected; 
alternative hypothesis, stating that there is a statistically significant relationship between the development of 
databases as a part of ICT infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in Jordanian 
banks, has been accepted . 

Fourth Sub-hypothesis Testing  
In order to validate this hypothesis, arithmetic means and standard deviations have been extracted for measuring 
the relation between the influence of the development of human resource as a part of ICT infrastructure and the 
effectiveness of e-accounting information systems. Table 9 outlines arithmetic means and standard deviation . 

 

Table 9. Arithmetic Means and Standard Deviation of the Impact of the development of human resource on the 
Effectiveness of E-Accounting Information System 

The responses stated above have illustrated that the development of human resources has extremely influenced 
the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems. Arithmetic mean has been 4.43, which is higher than 
hypothetical mean which is 3. Accordingly, responses’ orientation has indicated that the development of human 

resources has extremely influenced the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems .  

In addition, arithmetic mean of the statements which form fourth sub-hypothesis has been compared with 
standard mark 3- hypothesis acceptance standard- by using t-test as stated in table 10 .

 

Table 10. Arithmetic Means, Standard Deviations and T-test of Statements which form fourth Sub-Hypothesis 

the development of
human resource as a 
part of ICT in the banks 
has influenced the 
effectiveness of 
e-accounting 
information systems:

Number Arithmetic 
Mean 

Standard 
Deviation 

T-Value Freedom 
Degree 

Statistical 
Significance 

50 4.43 .49  10.835 21 .000  

 
Table 10 has indicated that there are statistical differences at (
deviation 3; T-value has been 10.835; statistical significance has been 0.000. Thus, this hypothesis has been 

Statements  Arithmetic 
mean 

Standard 
Deviation 

Answer 
Orientation  

Following statements measure to which extent the development of human resource as a part of ICT infrastructure in the banks 
contributes to achieve the effectiveness of accounting information systems: 
Banks’ managements train the accountants and develop their skills 
which are appropriate for the development of information 
technology  

4.43 0.53 Extremely 
influential  

The accountants are trained in advance software applications in 
order to achieve the effectiveness of modern accounting system and 
provide bank’s management with the appropriate information  

4.14 0.9 Very influential  

The accountants participate in the processes of developing and 
modernizing electronic systems in order to achieve the effectiveness 
of e-accounting systems, thereby providing managements and 
departments with the appropriate information  

4 0.0 Very influential  

The banks try to engage the employees in training programs in order 
to develop a knowledge on the risks of electronic systems which 
spoil accounting information systems 

4.29 0.49 Extremely 
influential  

The banks try to engage the accountants in choosing the software 
which is appropriate for accounting processing  

3.71 0.49 Very influential  

The accountants are engaged in choosing the software in order to 
prepare the reports which are appropriate for making various 
decisions 

4.71 0.49 Very influential  

The accountants are trained on all security software and programs of 
accounting systems  

4.29 0.49 Extremely 
influential  

Total 4.43 0.49 Extremely 
influential  
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rejected; alternative hypothesis, stating that there is a statistically significant relationship between the 
development of human resource as a part of ICT infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information 
systems in Jordanian banks, has been accepted . 

Fifth Sub-hypothesis Testing  
In order to validate this hypothesis, arithmetic means and standard deviations have been extracted for measuring 
the relation between the influence of the development of communication and network system as a part of ICT 
infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems. Table 11 outlines arithmetic means and 
standard deviation . 

 

Table 11 .Arithmetic Means and Standard Deviation of the Impact of the development of communication and 
network system on the Effectiveness of E-Accounting Information System 

Statements  Arithmetic 
mean 

Standard 
Deviation 

Answer 
Orientation  

Following statements measure to which extent the development of communication and network system as a part of ICT 
infrastructure in the banks contributes to achieve the effectiveness of accounting information systems: 
The bank develops communication networks linking the branches 
and management according to the recent developments, and 
maintains them periodically  

4.43 0.53 Extremely 
influential  

The development of communication and network systems 
contributes to the easiness and speediness of exchanging the 
information between various branches and departments  

4.43 0.53 Extremely 
influential  

The development of communication and network systems 
contributes to achieve the integration of e-accounting information 
systems 

4.43 0.9 Extremely 
influential  

The development of communication and network systems 
contributes to achieve the confidentiality of e-accounting 
information systems 

4.43 0.53 Extremely 
influential  

The development of communication and network systems 
contributes to achieve the accuracy of e-accounting information 
systems 

4.43 0.9 Extremely 
influential  

The development of communication and network systems 
contributes to the speediness of exchanging the information between 
the banks, branches and the central bank, thereby making accounting 
systems more effective  

4.43 0.9 Extremely 
influential  

The development of communication and network systems 
contributes to the accuracy and speediness of exchanging the 
information between the banks and the clients, thereby making 
accounting systems more effective  

4.43 0.9 Extremely 
influential  

The development of communication and network systems 
contributes to the easiness of data access among the users and 
provision of the best services, thereby making accounting systems 
more effective  

4.43 0.9 Extremely 
influential 

Total 4.43 0.96 Extremely 
influential  

The responses stated above have illustrated that the development of communication and network system has 
extremely influenced the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems. Arithmetic mean has been 4.43, 
which is higher than hypothetical mean which is 3. It means that developing the methods of exchanging and 
excessing the data via wireless network contributes extremely to achieve the effectiveness of accounting 
information systems. Accordingly, responses’ orientation has indicated that the development of communication 

and network systems has extremely influenced the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems .  

In addition, arithmetic mean of the statements which form sub-fifth hypothesis has been compared with standard 
mark 3 - hypothesis acceptance standard- by using t-test as stated in table 12 . 
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Table 12. Arithmetic Means, Standard Deviations and T-test of Statements which form Fifth Hypothesis

 

deviation 3; T-value has been 10.855; statistical significance has been 0.000. Thus, this hypothesis has been 
rejected; alternative hypothesis, stating that there is statistically significant relationship between the development 
of communication and network as a part of ICT infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information 
systems in Jordanian banks, has been accepted . 

First Hypothesis Testing  
It states that there is no statistically significant relationship between the development of ICT infrastructure, 
including physical and financial resources, software, databases, communication and networks, and its security 
and the effectiveness of accounting information systems in Jordanian banks . 

Table 13 outlines arithmetic means, standard deviations and T-test of hypotheses which form first main 
hypothesis. 

 

Table 13. Arithmetic Means, Standard Deviations and T-test of the statements which form first main hypothesis 

Field  Number  Arithmetic 
mean 

Standard 
Deviation 

T-Value Freedom 
Degree 

Statistical 
Significance 

The contribution of the 
development of physical 
resources to the effectiveness 
of e-accounting information 
systems  

50  4.39  .45  10.967 21 .000  

The contribution of the 
development of software to 
the effectiveness of 
e-accounting information 
systems 

50 4.50 .18  10.835 21 .000  

The contribution of the 
development of databases to 
the effectiveness of 
e-accounting information 
systems 

50 4.73 0.82 9.485 21 .000  

The contribution of the 
development of human 
resources to the effectiveness 
of e-accounting information 
systems 

50 4.43 .49  10.835 21 .000  

The contribution of the 
development of 
communication and network 
systems to the effectiveness 
of e-accounting information 
systems 

50 4.43 .96  10.855 21 .000  

Total 50 4.496 .60  10.655 21 .000  
 

According to statistical tests, responses’ orientation has indicated that the development of ICT infrastructure 

which consists of five components has extremely influenced the effectiveness of e-accounting information 
systems. Arithmetic mean has been 4.496, which is higher than hypothetical mean which is 3. It means that 
developing the components of ICT infrastructure contributes extremely to achieve the effectiveness of 

the development of 
communication and 
network system as a part 
of ICT in the banks has 
influenced the 
effectiveness of 
e-accounting 
information systems: 

Number Arithmetic 
Mean 

Standard 
Deviation 

T-Value Freedom 
Degree 

Statistical 
Significance 

50 4.43 .96  10.855 21 .000  
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accounting information systems. Accordingly, the contribution of the development of database has occupied the 
first rank, followed by software in second and communication and network systems and human resources in 
third. 

In addition, arithmetic mean of hypothesis fields which form the hypothesis has been compared with standard 
mark 3 - hypothesis acceptance standard- by using t-test as stated in previous table .  

deviation 3; T-value has been 10.655; statistical significance has been 0.000. Thus, this hypothesis has been 
rejected; alternative hypothesis, stating that there is statistically significant relationship between the development 
of ICT infrastructure, including physical and financial resources, software, databases, communication and 
networks, and its security and the effectiveness of accounting information systems in Jordanian banks, has been 
accepted . 

Second Hypothesis Testing  
In order to validate this hypothesis, arithmetic means and standard deviations have been extracted for measuring 
the relation between the influence of information security as a part of ICT infrastructure and the effectiveness of 
e-accounting information systems. Table 14 outlines arithmetic means and standard deviation . 

 

Table 14. Arithmetic Mean and Standard Deviation of the Impact of the development of Information Security 
System on the Effectiveness of E-Accounting Information System 

Statements  Arithmetic 
mean 

Standard 
Deviation 

Answer 
Orientation  

Following statements measure to which extent the development of information security as a part of ICT infrastructure in the 
banks contributes to achieve the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in the banks 

The role of developing information security in achieving information confidentiality  

Developing information security and protection programs 
contributes to maintain accounting information confidentiality 

3.71 49 Very influential  

Developing physical means of information protection contributes to 
maintain accounting information confidentiality  

4.41 0.90 Very influential  

The banks develop policies and procedures of information 
protection and security, thereby maintaining information 
confidentiality  

4.71 0.49 Extremely 
influential  

Developing information protection systems contributes to the classification of accounting information, confidentiality, thereby 
tightening control procedures according to the degree of information confidentiality  

Developing information security and protection such as anti-virus 
and firewalls contributes to achieve the integrity of accounting 
information  

4.71 0.49 Extremely 
influential  

Developing information security and protection programs and 
amending and deletion processes performed by the employees, 
clients and users contributes to achieve the integrity of accounting 
information

4.71 0.49 Extremely 
influential

The banks develop the policies and procedures of information 
protection and security in accordance with technical advance, 
thereby maintaining the integrity of accounting information  

4.14 0.9 Very influential  

The development of copying systems of accounting systems and 
shifting from traditional electronic copying processes to modern 
systems of e-clouds contributes to achieve the integrity of 
accounting information  

3.71 0.49 Very influential  

The role of developing information security programs in ensuring information access (readiness( 

Developing information security and protection such as anti-virus 
and firewalls contributes to the easiness of accessing the information 

4.71 0.49 Extremely 
influential  
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The results of statistical analysis have indicated that the arithmetic mean of study statements has been 4.43 
which is higher than hypothetical mean. Thus, it has illustrated that the development of information security 
system as a part of ICT infrastructure influences the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems .  

In addition, arithmetic mean of the statements which form second hypothesis has been compared with standard 
mark 3- hypothesis acceptance standard- by using t-test as stated in table 15 . 

 

Table 15. Arithmetic Means, Standard Deviations and T-test of Statements which form second Hypothesis 

Table 15 has indicated that there are 
deviation 3; T-value has been 35.686; statistical significance has been 0.000. Thus, this hypothesis, stating that 
there is no statistically significant relationship between the development of information security system as a part 
of ICT infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in Jordanian banks, has been 
rejected; alternative hypothesis, stating that there is statistically significant relationship between the development 
of information security system as a part of ICT infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information 
systems in Jordanian banks , has been accepted . 

20. Results and Recommendations  
Results  
Based on statistical analysis, the study found the following results  

There is statistically significant relationship between the development of ICT infrastructure, including physical 
and financial resources, software, databases, communication and networks, and its security and the effectiveness 
of accounting information systems in Jordanian banks .

There is statistically significant relationship between the development of physical resource as a part of ICT 
infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in Jordanian banks . 

at any time . 

Developing information security and protection such as anti-virus 
and firewalls contributes to the possibility of information access 
without problems or errors  

4.71 0.49 Extremely 
influential  

The banks develop the policies and procedures of information 
protection and security for ensuring information readiness and 
security  

5 0 Extremely 
influential  

The bank has security department which control and develop all 
activities of information security in order to ensure the continuity of 
systems and processes 

5 0 Extremely 
influential  

The role of the development of information security in achieving user satisfaction  

The development of information security contributes to increase the 
trust of e-banking data and transactions  

5 0 Extremely 
influential  

the users find the systems easy to use and understandable due to the 
development they have witnessed  

5 0  

Total 4.43 0.18 Extremely 
influential  

The development of 
information security 
system as a part of ICT 
infrastructure 
influences the 
effectiveness of 
e-accounting 
information systems .  

Number Arithmetic 
Mean 

Standard 
Deviation 

T-Value Freedom 
Degree 

Statistical 
Significance 

50 3.37 .18  35.686 21 .000  
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There is statistically significant relationship between the development of software as a part of ICT infrastructure 
and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in Jordanian banks. 

There is statistically significant relationship between the development of databases as a part of ICT infrastructure 
and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in Jordanian banks. 

There is statistically significant relationship between the development of human resources as a part of ICT 
infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in Jordanian banks. 

There is statistically significant relationship between the development of communication and networks as a part 
of ICT infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in Jordanian banks. 

 There is no statistically significant relationship between the development of information security system as a 
part of ICT infrastructure and the effectiveness of e-accounting information systems in Jordanian banks. 

Recommendations 
The following recommendations for research have been based on the study findings : 

Jordanian banks shall continually pay a special attention to all developments of information technology field and 
its impact on accounting information systems . 

Security controls of accounting information systems shall be paid a special attention in order to ensure the 
confidentiality, reliability and integration of accounting information. 

 Training programs, workshops of information technology and accounting information systems shall be held for 
the employees, in particularly the accountants, in order to provide a specialized knowledge on e- systems. 

 The accountants shall be engaged in the stages of purchasing electronic and controlling accounting systems; 
their opinions shall be taken in order to provide the appropriate information and internal controls . 

Implementation process of the policies and procedures of information systems and security shall be followed up 
and objectively evaluated . 

All policies and procedures shall be amended in order to keep up with the developments of information 
technology systems and security and achieve the properties of accounting information .  
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Abstract 

Gender budgeting has great potential to promote the United Nations 2030 Agenda concerning gender equality 

and women’s empowerment. This article shares some reflections on the need to implement and institutionalize 

gender budgeting at the regional level, both by embedding gender issues into the overall regional government 

budgetary process and by promoting gender equality disclosures. An empirical insight into the institutional 

behavior of Italian regional governments is provided. The study seeks to understand how the gender perspective 

is integrated into the governmental strategy that informs the entire budgetary cycle of Italian regional 

governments, by performing a thematic analysis of the key regional planning documents. The local promotion of 

gender budgeting implementation through institutional norms and the practice of gender performance reporting 

in Italian regional governments are also addressed. The results highlight that although there are differing degrees 

of commitment to gender equality and women’s advancement within the regions, the gender perspective is quite 

homogeneously integrated into the governmental strategy. Four gendered transversal thematic priorities are 

identified: the encouragement of women’s employment, the promotion of equal gender opportunities, the 

enhancement of social inclusion, and the combatting of gender-based violence. Furthermore, although nine 

regional laws establish gender performance reporting, additional reporting tools integrating non-financial 

information on gender issues are included solely in a small part of the regional government performance 

reporting systems. A greater organizational and cultural commitment to the institutionalization of the gender 

budgeting idea is needed in order to allow stakeholders to appreciate the government’s value outcomes in all 

their dimensions, including the gender-related social dimension. 

Keywords: gender budgeting, gender-responsive policies, gender performance reporting, regional governments, 

sustainable development goals 

1. Introduction 

1.1 Background and Rationale for the Study 

Gender budgeting (also called gender responsive budgeting or even gender sensitive budgeting) refers to a 

systematic approach involving tools, techniques and procedures of the budget cycle to integrate a gender 

perspective into all stages of the budgetary process, from the planning phase to the final reporting (Downes et al., 

2017; Galizzi et al., 2018; Steccolini, 2019). This perspective serves to inform the allocation of government 

budgets to ensure that spending and revenue allocations address the needs and interests of different social groups, 

in order to give them equal opportunities and erase gaps and social discrimination linked to sex, ethnicity, class, 

poverty, location and age (Sodani & Sharma, 2008). Indeed, by adopting a gender lens, gender budgeting is 

intended to ―achieve more gender equal outcomes as a consequence‖ (O’Hagan, 2018: p.19). Gender budgeting 

entails therefore an integrated approach to the budgeting system, which is adopted in order to incorporate (and 

disclose information about) gender-oriented goals within the strategic plans, programs, and performance reports 

of an institution. Gender budgeting also represents a tool with which to achieve public sector objectives of 

improving effectiveness, efficiency, accountability and transparency, thus supporting the principles of good 

(public) governance and democratic participation (Budlender & Hewitt, 2002; Corner, 2005; Pollifroni, 2005; 

2008; Brody, 2009; Tommaso et al., 2019). Consequently, the implementation of gender-responsive budget 

statements - that highlight gender priorities and related goals and outcomes - can constitute a pillar of sustainable 
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economic development and social progress, given their great potential to reduce persistent gender disparities 

worldwide (Villagomez, 2004; Rubin & Bartle, 2005; Pulejo, 2011a; Chakraborty, 2016). 

Gender budgeting has been internationally recognized as a key instrument for the promotion of real gender 

equality and the economic and social empowerment of women, which are very current issues in the field of 

country sustainable development (Pulejo, 2011a; Addabbo et al., 2015; Koehler, 2016; Leach et al., 2016). 

Reducing gender-related discrimination, female unemployment, violence against women, persistent gender pay 

gaps in education and work, and improving family life conditions and so forth, are among the most important 

priorities of modern society. Indeed, the aim to ―achieve gender equality and empower all women and girls‖ 

matches specifically one of the Sustainable development goals (SDGs) of the United Nations 2030 Agenda (SDG 

number five), which commits policymakers, governments, organizations and all stakeholders worldwide to step 

up their efforts to alleviate inequalities relating to gender (Razavi, 2016). To contribute to this, Europe has also 

developed a common approach to promoting equality between men and women as a central drive for sustainable 

economic growth of European countries. In particular, the European Union member states have adopted the EU 

Gender Action Plan 2016-2020 (GAP II) which aims to promote gender budgeting at national and local levels in 

partner countries (European Commission, 2018). Accordingly, an institutional approach to the promotion of 

gender budgeting implementation in order to contribute to the achievement of the goals of United Nations 2030 

Agenda is highly topical, and therefore needs more attention both from scholars and practitioners.  

However, the interest in gender budgeting from public administration and accounting scholars appears to have 

been relatively limited, despite growing political, social and economic attention at the macroeconomical level 

(Marks Rubin & Bartle, 2005; Siboni et al., 2016; Galizzi et al., 2018). Furthermore, although there has been no 

lack of countries, both across and beyond Europe, that have introduced gender budgeting into their 

budget-making (Chakraborty, 2016; Quinn, 2016; Stotsky et al., 2016), gender budgeting appears so far to have 

been implemented weakly and ineffectively (O’Hagan, 2018). In Europe in particular, a legislative framework, 

from national and regional governments, has developed across countries to support gender budgeting 

implementation. Legislation began with the Beijing Platform for Action – formed in 1995 at the Fourth World 

Conference on Women – which first institutionalized gender budgeting but despite this, the adoption of gender 

budgeting remains a challenge in different contexts (Quinn, 2017; O’Hagan & Klatzer, 2018).  

In order to achieve the goal of gender equality and women’s empowerment, it is essential to advocate gender 

budgeting at the institutional level to promote and stimulate greater application and thus support effective gender 

mainstreaming in government strategies, decision-making, programs, processes and reporting. In other words, 

given the potential gender budgeting has in contributing to the closure of gender gaps, this instrument needs to 

become institutionalized further in public policy and society in order to encourage successful implementation 

(Stotsky et al., 2016; Steccolini, 2019). In particular, its establishment within the budgetary cycle and the 

performance reporting processes can also be made effective through regulations, norms and guidelines. Regional 

governments worldwide, in virtue of the importance of favoring a sustainable and inclusive development of their 

territories (Morgan, 2009), have a significant role to play in promoting gender budgeting implementation at a 

local level to make gender equality and women’s empowerment a reality. Thus, in the face of their commitment 

to tackle gender diversities, regions need to integrate gender-related goals into their internal budgetary processes. 

In addition, they need to ensure that gender budgeting is established as an officially recognized accounting and 

accountability practice. 

The background outlined above provides the motivation for this research, which seeks to present an empirical 

insight into the institutional behavior of Italian regional governments with respect to gender budgeting 

implementation. Specifically, this study aims to explore the degree to which gender budgeting is institutionalized 

in Italian regions in terms of their concrete commitment to achieving gender equality and women’s 

empowerment, as a goal of the United Nations 2030 Agenda. The following research questions are addressed: 

RQ1: How is the gender perspective integrated into the governmental strategy informing the budgetary 

cycle of Italian regional governments? 

RQ2: Is gender budgeting implementation promoted by Italian regions in their territories through 

institutional norms, in order to encourage local institutions to disclose information on their commitment to 

gender equality? 

RQ3: Is the reporting on gender performance information a common practice in Italian regional 

governments? 

In the case of Italian regions, as bottom-up promoters of gendered initiatives, the interest in gender budgeting 

appears to be recent with some legislative movement in the last decade. Indeed, although not extensively and 
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systematically widespread, gender-responsive budget statements have been implemented in the form of 

voluntary final gender-responsive reports used to disclose information covering gender issues, related to 

performance and impacts (Gori et al., 2018; Tommaso et al., 2019). In this study, the current experience of Italian 

regions in institutionalizing gender budgeting implementation is analyzed by focusing attention firstly on their 

core regional planning documents, and secondly on their publication of norms and final reports substantiating 

gender-responsive budgeting. In particular, the fundamental document of regional general planning is the 

Regional Economic and Financial Document (DEFR, or ―Documento di Economia e Finanza Regionale‖) which 

was mandatorily introduced in Italian regional governments, starting in 2015, with decree no. 118/2011 on public 

accounting harmonization (decree no. 118/2011, paragraph 36, subsection 3; and subsequent modifications and 

additions). The DEFR contains the regional strategic objectives in the various policy areas (economics, social, 

environmental, etc.) in which the region will intervene during the reference period relating to three years. It is a 

strategic planning document from which spending and revenue allocations of the regional budget derives, 

therefore informing the entire regional budgetary cycle.  

This article shares some reflections on the need to implement and institutionalize gender budgeting at the 

regional level, both by embedding gender issues into the overall regional government budgetary process and by 

promoting gender equality disclosures. It has implications for policymakers, administrators and practitioners in 

regional and local governments, researchers and all other actors involved in promoting gender budgeting 

development, both for the budgetary process of governments and the mainstream of scholarly research into 

public management and accounting. The article continues below with an in-depth look at gender budgeting to 

support gender equality disclosures through a literature review. The subsequent section 2 better identifies the 

analyzed target population and materials and explains the methodologies used to answer the research questions. 

The research results are presented in section 3. The article concludes by discussing the results in section 4, which 

highlights useful elements for further research and some practical recommendations for better gender budgeting 

implementation. 

1.2 A Review of Previous Literature 

Gender budgeting was first implemented in Australia in the mid-1980s. By the mid-1990s, it had been introduced 

in numerous countries throughout the world thanks to the impetus of the Beijing Platform for Action of United 

Nations in 1995, which called for the integration of a gender dimension into budgetary processes (Sharp & 

Broomhill, 2002). Today, gender budgeting initiatives have been introduced worldwide both at the national and 

subnational levels, with varying forms, aims, approaches, scopes and outcomes based on the different political 

contexts in which they are implemented (Stotsky, 2006; Chakraborty, 2016; Klatzer et al., 2018). Scholarly 

studies on these initiatives have also increases since the 1990s by highlighting that gender budgeting has been 

used – ―as a disruptive and radical approach to decision-making on public resources and public policy‖ 

(O’Hagan, 2018: p.37) – to engender macroeconomic policy aimed at reducing gender inequalities and 

advancing gender issues, such as tackling violence against women or enhancing women’s rights, their status, 

their access to education or their working conditions, etc. (Budlender & Hewitt, 2002; Budlender, 2006). 

In short, there has been a growth in gender budgeting and several governments around the world have integrated 

aspects concerning gender issues into budget in order to address gender equality and women’s development 

(Hopper, 2019). Nevertheless, gender budgeting has not been sufficiently considered in the managerial and 

accounting literature and, as has been highlighted in particular recently, the field of the gender agenda needs 

greater engagement from accounting scholars (Broadbent, 2016; Siboni et al., 2016). 

Gender issues are high up on the agendas of private and public organizations (UN, 2014; UN Women, 2019). 

This entails the need for an organization to disclose information about their commitment to gender equality, as 

stakeholder demand for gender performance information increases (Miles, 2011). As Hossain and colleagues 

argue, providing gender-related disclosures is necessary to meet the increasing call for transparency from and the 

accountability needs of stakeholders who have a right to be informed about organizational gender practices and 

matters related to gender equality (Hossain et al., 2016). Moreover, as highlighted by Hopper, a broader vision of 

accounting and accountability that goes beyond financial value information is required in order to drive 

organizations towards achieving the compelling global sustainable development goals of the United Nations 

2030 Agenda (Hopper, 2019). Gender equality is an important part of this Agenda, which calls for greater social 

responsibility to ensure well-being and prosperity for the entire society worldwide. In line with this call, various 

authors have considered gender issues in their studies on corporate social responsibility and stakeholder 

accountability concerns. Khlif & Achek (2017) have found however, in their review of the accounting literature 

dealing with gender issues, that most of these studies have placed emphasis on equal opportunities for women on 

the board composition and leadership positions of private companies (Grosser & Moon, 2005; Grosser, 2009, 
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Fernandez‐Feijoo et al., 2014; Velte, 2017). 

Gender balance as a social outcome is one of the multiple dimensions of the value an organization creates, be it 

public or private. This is because the creation of value includes relevant social aspects, as well as economic, 

environmental and whole-system aspects of sustainability development and corporate social responsibility 

(Bebbington & Dillard, 2008; Henriques, 2013). This is emphasized by the growing literature on sustainability 

reporting and integrated reporting, which argues that performance reporting systems should include, with a more 

holistic and comprehensive view of performance, all dimensions of the organizational value creation and thus 

provide stakeholders with economic, social, environmental, and governance (financial and non-financial) 

information (Dumay et al., 2016; Adams, 2017; de Villiers & Maroun, 2017; Manes-Rossi et al., 2018; Del 

Gesso, 2019). Considering gender diversity matters therefore, has the ability to create an organization’s value 

and consequently, organizational disclosures need to include gender impact information. Gender equality 

disclosures are also supported by the Global Reporting Initiative (GRI) which, in promoting sustainability 

reporting practices in private and public organizations internationally, includes gender related indicators in its 

―GRI Sustainability Reporting Framework‖ and enacts specific ―Social Standards‖, namely the ―GRI 

401-Employment‖ and the ―GRI 405-Diversity and Equal Opportunity‖ Standards that help organizations to 

report on their social impact related to gender (GRI & IFC, 2009; GRI website). Despite this, although research 

on company reporting on gender equality has been developed (e.g., Fernandez‐Feijoo et al., 2014) and while 

sustainability reporting has attracted attention from accounting researchers (e.g., de Villiers & Maroun, 2017), 

little research has analyzed organization disclosures on gender issues within the public sector budgetary process. 

Some recent experiences of gender budgeting have been analyzed in the Italian public sector. One study focused 

on gender equality disclosures in the public university context (Galizzi & Siboni, 2016). Some other studies, in 

contrast, have dealt with gender budgeting implementation in regional and local governments (Galizzi et al., 

2018; Gori et al., 2018; Tommaso et al., 2019). In particular, Gori and colleagues, who explored local authority 

commitment to gender mainstreaming by examining the strategic planning documents of the regional 

chief-towns, have pointed out the need to develop a clear framework, with respect to strategies, resources, and 

performance and impact indicators, to issue effective gender policies (Gori et al., 2018). Furthermore, Galizzi 

and colleagues analyzed the fully developed practice of gender budgeting in the municipality of Bologna and 

emphasized how gender budgeting is in line with the principles of public governance processes, such as equity, 

transparency, participation and accountability (Galizzi et al., 2018). In addition, Tommaso and colleagues 

examined gender budgeting experiences in Italian local governments by focusing on rules and gender-responsive 

reports implemented at the regional level, and highlighted the opportunity these reports provide to advance 

public sector management and public governance processes (Tommaso et al., 2019). This research revealed, 

however, a sporadic implementation of gender reports and a widespread methodological homogeneity in 

approaching their adoption. Previous literature has also shown that gender budgeting in Italian regional and local 

governments is basically designed as an instrument of the reporting stage, while a more holistic budgetary 

approach to gender issues is required, starting with a definition of the policies that differently determine male 

and female well-being and leading to the measurement and reporting of their impact (Galizzi, 2010; Addabbo et 

al., 2011; Pulejo, 2011b). 

The gender budgeting potential for a budget reform has already been highlighted (Marks Rubin & Bartle, 2005); 

the recent work of Steccolini (2019) has also emphasized the need for the institutionalization of gender 

budgeting. Therefore, although some gender budgeting experiences at the Italian regional level have been 

analyzed in previous work, the originality of the present research lies in its investigation of gender budgeting 

implementation from the standpoint of the need to institutionalize it as an established practice of accounting and 

accountability processes; this is essential so that gender budgeting is able to deliver long lasting results to realize 

gender equality and women’s rights. In other words, the gender perspective needs to be systematically embedded 

within the corporate budgetary systems of regional governments (and drive their institutional behavior and 

commitment) to create gender balance as a social value. 

2. Materials and Methods 

This research is qualitative in nature. It aimed to investigate the institutional commitment of Italian regional 

governments, with respect to the United Nations 2030 Agenda, to achieving gender equality and women’s 

advancement through gender budgeting implementation. 

In Italy, the promotion of gender budgeting appears to have been influenced by a bottom-up movement led by 

local governments but without coordination, indications for method, tools or funding from central government. 

Indeed, no specific norms have been enacted by the central government. However, references to gender 
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budgeting implementation do appear in two laws. Firstly, decree no. 150/2009, which in imposing the adoption 

of a performance measurement and management cycle for all Italian public administrations, requires them to 

report on gender performance in their annual performance reports (decree no. 150/2009, paragraph 10, 

subsection 1b). Secondly, law no. 196/2009, which in defining the process of the reform and harmonization of 

public sector accounting, affirms the need for the adoption of a gender budget as a reporting tool to assess the 

different impacts of budgetary policies on men and women in order to pursue gender equality (law no. 196/2009, 

paragraph 38-septies; and subsequent modifications and additions). 

Therefore, this study focuses on a target population consisting of all 20 Italian regional governments. Regional 

governments are the largest level of territorial subdivision in Italy, above the provincial and municipal levels. A 

documentary data collection and analysis were carried out between June and September 2019 in order to answer 

the three research questions outlined in the Introduction that were addressed sequentially. 

Firstly, given the role regions play in promoting gender equality policies in their territories, the study sought to 

understand how the gender perspective is currently established within their corporate budgetary cycles (RQ1). To 

this end, the DEFR for the three-years 2019-21 was gathered from the regions’ official websites where it is 

generally published under the heading ―Planning‖ or ―Finances‖. The decision was made to analyze the DEFR as 

this mandatory planning document initiates the budgetary process of Italian regional governments, by defining 

the programming guidelines (or policy objectives) of the government action that guides expenditure allocations 

both in the annual financial budget (for the year 2019) and in the triennial financial budget (for 2019-2021). 

Indeed, its narrative structure allows the Regional Executive Council to set out all governmental policies and 

programs to be implemented over the three-years, as well as the resources needed for the pursuit of regional 

planning objectives. The three-year planning cycle of the regional budgeting therefore necessarily starts with 

(and is supported by) the DEFR which constitutes an essential tool for the government’s strategic control. In 

reality, during this study, the Italian regions were in the process of publishing the new DEFR 2020-22 but very 

few had actually published it, thus the only available document for the entire target population was the DEFR 

2019-21 which is currently in force. However, for two regions (Lombardy and Trentino Alto-Adige) the DEFR 

2019-21 was not available on the respective websites and consequently, the last available document was 

analyzed, which related to the period 2017-2019. 

The collected DEFR documents were examined by means of a thematic analysis in order to identify the gendered 

thematic priorities set out by Italian regional governments. Thematic analysis is an independent research 

approach within the qualitative descriptive methodologies defined as ―a method for identifying, analysing and 

reporting patterns (themes) within data‖ (Braun & Clarke, 2006: p.79; Vaismoradi et al, 2013; Nowell et al., 

2017). This commonly used method for qualitative research was chosen because it allows themes within a data 

system which are important to the description of a phenomenon, to be identified (Daly et al., 1997). Thus, it 

appeared to be particularly appropriate to aid a deeper analysis of the DEFRs to identify all the thematic 

categories regarding gender-responsive policies and their related disclosures. 

In order to build a set of meaningful and established themes, thematic analysis requires a six step process to be 

carried out. The steps are: familiarization with the data, the generation of initial codes, the search for themes, the 

reviewing of themes, the definition and naming of themes, and the production of a report (Braun & Clarke, 2006; 

Nowell et al., 2017). By following this iterative process, thematic analysis was performed on all 20 DEFRs with 

the help of the Qualitative Data Analysis software ―QDA Miner Lite‖. The length of the documents was very 

variable and ranged from 37 to 472 pages. The documentary raw data were therefore explored, and themes (i.e. 

the gender-related policy priorities set out) were inductively defined and extrapolated. In particular, as a first step, 

the DEFRs were carefully read so that familiarity with their content could be achieved. Subsequently, a 

systematic coding for potential themes was done and then, similar codes that were common to the 20 cases were 

grouped together. In the following step, all the collected codes were sorted to form themes and subthemes. These 

were then reviewed to check that the data had been well-arranged and to finalize the themes and subthemes; 

finally, a thematic matrix was defined. 

Once the DEFRs were examined through thematic analysis, the study sought to determine whether the Italian 

regions are promoting gender budgeting implementation in their territories through institutional norms that 

encourage local provinces and municipalities to disclose information on their commitment to gender equality 

(RQ2), such as through regional laws and guidelines. Thus, in order to answer the second research question, an 

electronic search was conducted within the official regional bulletins (containing laws and regulations) published 

during the last decade to review gender budgeting-related legislation. 

Finally, the study also sought to determine to what extent reporting on gender performance information is a 
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common practice in Italian regional governments (RQ3). In order to address the last research question, an 

analysis of regional official websites was carried out to search for published non-financial performance reports 

which disclose information on gender impacts, such as gender-responsive reports, social reports and 

sustainability reports, in addition to traditional financial reporting statements. 

3. Results 

The results of the study in relation to the three research questions are described below. 

Table 1 shows the results relating to RQ1 (How is the gender perspective integrated into the governmental 

strategy informing the budgetary cycle of Italian regional governments?). The thematic analysis conducted on 

the DEFRs across 20 Italian regional governments made it possible to distinguish four main global themes. 

These themes were established through the identification of a specific set of subthemes that represent the 

gender-related policy priorities integrated into the DEFR documents. As detailed in Table 1, the integration of a 

gender perspective into governmental strategy, which subsequently informs the entire budgetary cycle of Italian 

regional governments can be expressed through the following four themes: the encouragement of women’s 

employment; the promotion of equal gender opportunities; the enhancement of social inclusion; and the 

combatting of gender-based violence. 

The total number of regions that include the four aforementioned themes within their DEFRs and thus integrate 

them into their budgetary cycle, is reported in Table 1; the regions that integrate each subtheme are also detailed. 

As can be seen from this table, the identified themes are all transversal themes, as each theme is recurrent in 

most Italian regional policies. This would suggest that the experience of promoting gender equality and women’s 

empowerment is homogeneous on the whole. However, by looking at the various subthemes, it can be seen how 

some regions stand out because they are much more proactive than the others. Indeed, some subthemes are not 

common, rather they characterize only a part of the regional experience. This is the case of the subtheme 

―promote gender equality by implementing reporting on gender impact‖, which is only considered by three 

regions (Calabria, Emilia-Romagna and Piedmont); in addition, the subtheme ―encourage full equity in 

remuneration‖ is relatively isolated because only two regions (Friuli-Venezia Giulia and Veneto) have integrated 

it into their governmental strategy. In contrast, almost all regions (19 regions) have addressed the subtheme 

―contrast poverty by aiding job placement and income support to vulnerable people‖ in order to enhance social 

inclusion of some categories at risk of exclusion, such as the elderly, the disabled, single mothers, and the 

unemployed who may be experiencing a situation of particular economic fragility. Moreover, several regions (14 

regions) have integrated into their DEFRs the political intention to ―increase women’s access to the labor market 

through active labor policies, support measures and training‖; likewise, there are also 14 regions that have 

included in their DEFRs the general principle of ―promoting a regional policy guaranteeing equal opportunities 

without discrimination for women and men in work and in social life‖, as well as their commitment to ―support 

female victims of violence and their children‖. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



http://ibr.ccsenet.org     International Business Research                   Vol. 12, No. 12; 2019 

116 

 

Table 1. Integration of the gender perspective in the governmental strategy of Italian regional governments 

Themes Subthemes In which regions 
Total 

number of 
regions 

Encourage 
women’s 
employment 

 Increase women’s access to the labor 
market through active labor policies, 
support measures and training; 

Abruzzo; Basilicata; Calabria; 
Emilia-Romagna; Friuli-Venezia Giulia; 
Lazio; Liguria; Lombardy; Marche; 
Molise; Piedmont; Puglia; Tuscany; and 
Veneto. 

15 regions 
 Improve women’s employment 

through family policies aimed at 
reconciling home and work life; 

Calabria; Emilia-Romagna; Friuli-Venezia 
Giulia; Liguria; Molise; Piedmont; Puglia; 
Valle d’Aosta; and Veneto. 

 Support women’s access to career 
opportunities, decision-making and 
entrepreneurship; 

Emilia-Romagna; Friuli-Venezia Giulia; 
Lombardy; Piedmont; and Veneto. 

 Encourage full equity in 
remuneration. 

Friuli-Venezia Giulia; and Veneto. 

Promote equal 
gender 
opportunities 

 Promote gender equality by 
implementing reporting on gender 
impact; 

Calabria; Emilia-Romagna; and Piedmont. 

14 regions 
 Promote a regional policy 

guaranteeing equal opportunities 
without discrimination for women 
and men in work and in social life. 

Abruzzo; Basilicata; Calabria; 
Emilia-Romagna; Friuli-Venezia Giulia; 
Lazio; Lombardy; Marche; Piedmont; 
Puglia; Sicily; Tuscany; Valle d’Aosta; and 
Veneto. 

Enhance social 
inclusion 

 Improve women’s well-being through 
educational projects, gender-specific 
care, or sport; 

Abruzzo; Basilicata; Emilia-Romagna; 
Friuli-Venezia Giulia; Liguria, and 
Lombardy. 

19 regions 

 Contrast poverty by aiding job 
placement and income support to 
vulnerable people; 

Abruzzo; Basilicata; Calabria; Campania; 
Emilia-Romagna; Friuli-Venezia Giulia; 
Lazio; Liguria; Lombardy; Marche; 
Molise; Piedmont; Puglia; Sardinia; Sicily; 
Tuscany; Umbria; Valle d’Aosta; and 
Veneto. 

 Promote social inclusion through 
targeted social measures and services. 

Calabria; Emilia-Romagna; Friuli-Venezia 
Giulia; Lazio; Lombardy; Marche; Molise; 
Piedmont; and Puglia. 

Contrast 
gender-based 
violence 

 Support female victims of violence 
and their children; 

Abruzzo; Basilicata; Calabria; 
Emilia-Romagna; Friuli-Venezia Giulia; 
Lazio; Liguria; Lombardy; Marche; 
Piedmont; Puglia; Sicily; Tuscany; and 
Veneto. 

14 regions 
 Promote territorial networks, 

partnerships and information 
campaigns to raise awareness of the 
gender violence issue; 

Abruzzo; Emilia-Romagna; Lombardy; 
Marche; Piedmont; Puglia; Tuscany; and 
Veneto. 

 Support anti-violence centers and 
shelters. 

Abruzzo; Calabria; Emilia-Romagna; 
Lombardy; Marche; Piedmont; Puglia; 
Tuscany; and Veneto. 

Source: data analyzed from the results of the thematic analysis of the DEFRs 2019-21 of Italian regional 

governments. 

 

Table 2 shows the results in response to RQ2 (Is gender budgeting implementation promoted by Italian regions in 

their territories through institutional norms, in order to encourage local institutions to disclose information on 

their commitment to gender equality?). Nine regions out of twenty have enacted a law promoting gender 

budgeting establishment from 2007 to date. The nine regional laws are listed in chronological order in Table 2, 

which reports what they state about gender budgeting implementation at the local level. As is detailed in this 

table, eight laws are specifically concerned with gender issues, while one law (in the case of Calabria) is a 

general legal provision in which only the government’s adoption of gender budgeting is promoted. Therefore, 

eight regions promote gender budgeting implementation both in their budgetary process and in those of the local 

authorities in their territories; however, only two of these regions (Emilia-Romagna and Piedmont) also provide 

guidelines for their local authorities. The regional laws establishing gender budgeting are quite homogeneous in 

their objectives and scope. Although some laws also establish specific training and updating activities to instruct 
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staff on how to apply gender budgeting and prepare gender-responsive reports, the requirement of other 

paragraphs are somewhat identical. 

 

Table 2. The promotion of gender budgeting implementation in Italian regional laws 

Region Regulatory law 

The establishment of gender budgeting at the local level Were 
guidelines 
provided? 

Establishment of government adoption 
Promotion among the regional 

local authorities  

Puglia 

Law no. 7 from 21 
March 2007: 
―Rules for gender 
policies and 
work-life balance 
services‖. 

―The Region in the report that 
accompanies both the forecasting 
budget and the final financial reporting 
statements includes the gender budget 
as a tool for monitoring and assessing 
the impact of regional policies on men 
and women‖. (Paragraph 19, 
subsection 1). 

―The Region promotes the 
dissemination of gender budget 
among the Apulian local 
authorities through initiatives, 
awareness raising and 
information from the Regional 
Resource Center for Women‖. 
(Paragraph 19, subsection 3). 

No 

Calabria 

Law no. 15 from 13 
June 2008: 
―General measures 
of a legal and 
financial type‖ 

―... to improve citizen participation 
and comprehensibility and 
transparency of the budget, the 
Regional Executive Council prepares 
in addition to the social report, a 
gender-responsive report‖. (Paragraph 
12, subsection 1). 

--- No 

Liguria 

Law no. 26 from 1 
August 2008: 
―Integration of 
gender equal 
opportunities 
policies in the 
Liguria Region‖. 

―The Region adopts gender budgeting 
as a social reporting tool that allows 
the integration of the gender 
perspective into economic planning 
documents in which public policies are 
defined and summarized‖. (Paragraph 
8, subsection 1). 

―The Region promotes the 
dissemination of the gender 
budgeting tool among all local 
authorities. ... With a specific 
act, the Regional Executive 
Council dictates the guidelines 
and identifies the methodologies 
for the design and 
implementation of the gender 
budget‖. (Paragraph 9, 
subsections 1 and 3). 

No 

Piedmont 

Law no. 8 from 18 
March 2009: 
―Integration of 
gender equal 
opportunities 
policies in the 
Piedmont Region 
and provisions for 
the establishment of 
gender budgets‖. 

―For the purposes of this law, gender 
budgeting consists of assessing the 
impact of budgetary policies on gender 
by identifying gender-sensitive areas in 
order to promote equality of 
opportunity between men and 
women‖. (Paragraph 3, subsection 1). 

―The Regional Executive 
Council ... prepares a vade 
mecum relating to the guidelines 
for the implementation of gender 
budgets in order to promote and 
solicit their adoption in local 
authorities‖. (Paragraph 5, 
subsection 2). 

Yes 

Tuscany 

Law no. 16 from 2 
April 2009: 
―Gender 
citizenship‖. 

―The gender budget, drawn up by the 
Regional Executive Council, is a tool 
for monitoring and evaluating regional 
policies on equal opportunities in the 
context of the overall legislative 
evaluation of regional public policies‖. 
(Paragraph 13, subsection 1). 

―The Region also promotes the 
dissemination of the gender 
budget among local authorities 
for the purpose of guiding 
actions for work-life balance‖. 
(Paragraph 13, subsection 3). 

No 

Friuli- 
Venezia 
Giulia 

Law no. 20 from 16 
November 2010: 
―Measures for the 
promotion of social 
reporting in the 
Administrations of 
Friuli-Venezia 
Giulia‖. 

―The present law pursues the objective 
of developing the ability of ... regions 
and local authorities to implement 
effective social reporting processes, 
through documents such as the annual 
social report, the mandate social 
report, the environmental report, the 
gender-responsive report ... and other 
social reporting documents‖. 
(Paragraph 1). 

―The present law pursues the 
objective of developing the 
ability of ... regions and local 
authorities to implement 
effective social reporting 
processes…. (Idem as paragraph 
1). 

No 

Marche 

Law no. 23 from 23 
July 2012: 
―Integration of 
gender equal 
opportunities 

―The gender budget, drawn up by the 
Regional Executive Council, is a tool 
for monitoring and evaluating regional 
policies on equal opportunities, as part 
of the overall assessment of regional 

―The Region also promotes the 
dissemination of the gender 
budget among local authorities 
for the purpose of guiding action 
for work-life balance‖. 

No 



http://ibr.ccsenet.org     International Business Research                   Vol. 12, No. 12; 2019 

118 

 

policies in the 
Region‖. 

public policies‖. (Paragraph 7, 
subsection 1). 

(Paragraph 7, subsection 3). 

Emilia- 
Romagna 

Law no. 6 from 27 
June 2014: 
―Framework law 
for equality and 
against gender 
discrimination‖. 

―The gender budget, as social reporting 
of the integration of a gender 
perspective in the economic planning 
of public policies ... is prepared 
annually by the Regional Executive 
Council, coinciding with the 
presentation of the annual report on the 
basis of the guidelines and with the 
methods established by it, and involves 
the adoption of a gender impact 
assessment of budgetary policies‖. 
(Paragraph 36, subsection 1). 

―The Region also promotes the 
dissemination of the gender 
budget among local authorities in 
order to promote positive action 
for reconciling life and work 
times and sharing care 
responsibilities‖. (Paragraph 36, 
subsection 3). 

Yes 

Umbria 

Law no. 14 from 25 
November 2016: 
―Rules for gender 
policies and for a 
new civilization of 
relations between 
women and men‖. 

―The gender budget, approved by the 
Regional Executive Council, is a tool 
for monitoring and assessing the 
impact of regional policies on men and 
women‖. (Paragraph 47, subsection 1). 

―The Region promotes its 
dissemination among local 
authorities by sharing 
methodologies, support, and 
implementation support‖. 
(Paragraph 47, subsection 1). 

No 

Source: elaboration from the review of the regulatory laws on gender budgeting published in the official regional 

bulletins. 

 

Table 3 shows the results in relation to RQ3 (Is the reporting on gender performance information a common 

practice in Italian regional governments?). In particular, it shows the behavior of Italian regions in respect to the 

dissemination of gender-responsive and social reports that disclose gender performance information in terms of 

the impacts of the implemented policies on men and women. As can be seen, regional government reporting of 

this information in addition to their traditional financial reporting is sporadic. Indeed, additional reporting tools 

that integrate non-financial information about gender issues are included solely in a small part of the Italian 

regional government performance reporting systems, although several regions have integrated some disclosures 

into their annual performance reports to comply with the provisions of national decree no. 150/2009. Specifically, 

only three regions are now reporting on gender performance or have recently reported on it with specific 

gender-responsive reports (Emilia-Romagna, Tuscany and Piedmont), whereas some regions have only published 

a single edition of such a report, more than a decade ago (such as the Marche and the Valle d’Aosta). A positive 

note is that gender budgeting projects are on the agenda in many regions, meaning that the implementation of 

performance reporting on gender issues is scheduled for the near future. 

 

Table 3. Regional government reporting on gender performance information 

Region 
Additional reporting tools disclosing 
non-financial information on gender 

performance  
Projects of implementing gender performance reporting 

Abruzzo 
Some disclosure is integrated into the 
Annual Performance Report. 

Resolution no. 380 of the Regional Executive Council from 
1 July 2019 which plans to prepare a Gender-Responsive 
Report by 2021. 

Basilicata 
Some disclosure is integrated into the 
Annual Performance Report. 

--- 

Calabria 
Some disclosure is integrated into the 
Annual Performance Report. 

A regional communication from 27 June 2016 describes an 
ongoing project concerning the drafting of the first social 
and gender report of the Region. 

Campania --- 
The regional Council presented a law proposal from 17 
March 2017 on the implementation of gender budgeting. 

Emilia- 
Romagna 

Gender-Responsive Report 2015; 
Gender-Responsive Report 2016. Some 
disclosure is also integrated into the Annual 
Performance Report. 

--- 

Friuli-Venezia 
Giulia 

Some disclosure is integrated into the 
Annual Performance Report. 

--- 

Lazio 
Some disclosure is integrated into the 
Annual Performance Report. 

In an informative note on the regional website, the region 
declares that it will establish a Control room for the 
experiment of a Gender-Responsive Report starting from 
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2019. 

Liguria 
Some disclosure is integrated into the 
Annual Performance Report. 

--- 

Lombardy --- --- 

Marche 
Gender-Responsive Report 2005. Some 
disclosure is now integrated into the Annual 
Performance Report. 

--- 

Molise --- --- 

Piedmont 

Gender-Responsive Report 2006; 
Gender-Responsive Report 2007/2008; 
Gender-Responsive Report 2009/2010; 
Simplified (social) Report for Citizens 2016. 

--- 

Puglia 

Proof of a gender-responsive report 
2010/2011 is available. Some disclosure is 
integrated into the Annual Performance 
Report. 

The Resolution no. 1798 of the Regional Executive Council 
from 7 October 2019 planned the preparation of a social and 
gender report. 

Sardinia --- --- 

Sicily 
Some disclosure is integrated into the 
Annual Performance Report. 

--- 

Trentino Alto 
Adige 

--- --- 

Tuscany 

Gender-Responsive Report 2012/2013; 
Gender-Responsive Report 2010/2014; 
Social Report 2010; Social Report 2011; 
Social Report 2010-2014. 

--- 

Umbria --- --- 

Valle d’Aosta Gender-Responsive Report 2004. --- 

Veneto 
Several annual editions of the social report 
from 2004 to 2010, some of which include 
gender performance information. 

The Resolution no. 1701 of the Regional Executive Council 
from 24 October 2017 refers to the adoption of gender 
budgeting as a planning and auditing tool. 

Source: elaboration from the results of an analysis of regional official websites. 

 

4. Discussion and Conclusion 

This research was based on the view that regions can play a decisive role in establishing gender budgeting within 

governmental accounting and accountability systems in virtue of their institutional commitment to the United 

Nations 2030 Agenda goal concerning gender equality and women’s empowerment in local communities. The 

institutional behavior of Italian regional governments was analyzed in respect to the integration of the gender 

perspective in the regional budgetary strategy, the local promotion of gender budgeting implementation and 

performance reporting. 

In response to the first research question, the results described in the previous section highlight that although 

there are differing degrees of commitment to gender equality and the advancement of women, the gender 

perspective is quite homogeneously integrated into the governmental strategy that informs the budgetary cycle of 

Italian regional governments. Gender-responsive policies are therefore adopted and they may be traced back to 

four main themes or areas where regional governments make interventions: the encouragement of women’s 

employment, the promotion of equal gender opportunities, the enhancement of social inclusion, and the 

combatting of gender-based violence. 

In particular, better access to the labor market for women is considered a priority and supported by most of the 

regional policies that are also concerned with tackling women’s unemployment through gender training. It has 

been confirmed that the latter has received much attention from Italian local policies that aim to increase 

women’s empowerment (Gori et al., 2018). In some regions, social and labor policies also aim to help balance 

women’s family and work roles and hours, or to support their career opportunities through entrepreneurship and 

self-employment in order to reach a greater economic and social equity for the community. Ensuring equal 

opportunities for all, with no discrimination at work and in social life, as well as tackling poverty and violence 

against women, appear to be policies informing the budgetary cycle of almost all Italian regional governments. 

However, only three regions (Calabria, Emilia-Romagna, and Piedmont) include among their governmental 

policies the promotion of gender performance reporting to help equal gender opportunities. These regions have 

also enacted a law to promote gender budgeting implementation. In addition, two of these regions 

(Emilia-Romagna and Piedmont) are the only regions that have issued regional guidelines to help region local 

authorities implement gender budgeting. These two regions are also those whose performance reporting systems 
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include reporting tools (such as gender-responsive reports), which disclose gender performance information that 

is essential to enable the impact evaluation of the policies to be carried out. 

In response to the second research question, the results corroborate the fact that a legislative movement has 

occurred during the last decade, which has concerned Italian regional governments (Pulejo, 2011a; Tommaso et 

al., 2019). To date, nine regions have enacted a regional law establishing gender budgeting implementation in 

their territories. Eight laws promote it, both in the regional government’s budgetary process and in that of the 

region’s local authorities. However, the regional laws address gender budgeting with a mostly homogeneous 

approach and remain limited in scope and objectives (Tommaso et al., 2019). 

Furthermore, some laws have also envisaged the enactment of regional guidelines in order to help gender 

budgeting establishment in the territorial local authorities; however, as already highlighted, only two regions 

have actually issued such guidelines. This may be due to the change in the elective decision-making bodies 

which, based on their governmental political orientation, give different levels of salience to gender issues during 

their electoral mandate. The duration of the elected bodies’ mandate therefore can critically affect the regional 

administration and limit the long-lasting effects of some policies, such as promoting gender budgeting. 

Nonetheless, gender budgeting implementation cannot be an idea that belongs to one political alignment but 

needs to be seen as an accounting matter to be established within governmental practice relating to accounting 

and accountability. Indeed, accounting cannot remain blinkered when considering sustainable development 

issues such as gender equality and women’s empowerment (Hopper, 2019). In addition, providing non-financial 

information on gender equality commitment is becoming relevant to meet the growing demands from 

stakeholders for efficiency, equity, transparency and accountability (Miles, 2011; Hossain et al., 2016). This is 

also in line with public governance principles (Galizzi et al., 2018), according to which the performance 

disclosure fulfills the governmental need to address value creation for all of society, in all its many dimensions 

(Bebbington & Dillard, 2008; Dumay et al., 2016). 

From the Italian regional laws, it has emerged that gender budgeting is mainly conceived as a social reporting 

tool with which to disclose the gender impact assessment of budgetary policies that have been implemented 

(Galizzi, 2010; Addabbo et al., 2011; Pulejo, 2011b). These laws, therefore, aim to institutionalize a performance 

reporting tool promoting government disclosures on gender equality evaluation. Inconsistently, however, most 

regions that have established gender budgeting implementation through the adoption of a gender-responsive 

report appear not to have adopted such a tool. 

The reporting by Italian regional governments on gender performance information was explored in response to 

the third research question. The results showed that reporting on gender performance issues is not a common 

practice, although some gender-related information is integrated into the annual performance reports of several 

regional governments. More precisely, a small number of Italian regional governments are implementing (or 

have implemented in the past) – in the final stage of their budgetary process – additional reporting tools that 

disclose non-financial information on gender issues, such as gender-responsive reports and social reports. 

Reporting on gender issues, therefore, remains isolated; however, in some regions, gender budgeting 

implementation is an ongoing project, which should allow for an increase in gender performance reporting in the 

near future. This increase will also depend on the political governance of the regions. However, the fact that 

some recent regional government institutional resolutions provide for the forthcoming adoption of gender 

budgeting suggests that gender performance reporting needs more attention not only politically but also 

academically; indeed, it needs to be studied more in the context of performance measurement and reporting 

systems and public sector sustainability reporting. 

The empirical glance of the Italian regional government experience this study has provided highlights how there 

is a need for a greater organizational and cultural commitment to the institutionalization and spread of the gender 

budgeting idea. Formally promoting gender budgeting through laws is not enough; regions also need to provide 

concrete examples by integrating gender-related information into their performance reporting systems in order to 

allow stakeholders to appreciate the government’s value outcomes in all their dimensions, including the 

gender-related social dimension. 

Gender performance reporting needs to become part of managerial culture and accounting practice as a generally 

accepted and recognized way of creating value. This is a challenge that, as the experience of Italian regional 

governments shows, has just begun. Greater political efforts from the various actors at the local level, as well as 

at the central level, are therefore required, given the strong global attention given to the United Nations 2030 

Agenda concerning gender equality and women’s empowerment. On the other hand, gender budgeting entails the 

integration of the gender perspective into the budgetary process and hence, involves the embedding of the gender 



http://ibr.ccsenet.org     International Business Research                   Vol. 12, No. 12; 2019 

121 

 

perspective into governmental policies that can be implemented and their results measured and reported. Thus, 

performance reporting systems cannot be neutral, they must become involved in order to enhance both the 

government’s accountability and strategic control. 

Finally, it is recommended that regional governments place a greater focus on gender policies in their strategic 

plans informing the governmental budgetary cycle; this is the first step in gender budgeting implementation 

which also implies the adoption of performance measurement and reporting tools that will allow the outcomes of 

these policies to be assessed and disclosed to stakeholders. In particular, some gender policies need more 

strategic integration for a real government contribution to achieving the goal of gender equality and women’s 

empowerment. These policies could include: parental leave policies aimed at balancing home and work life; 

supporting women’s access to career opportunities, decision-making and entrepreneurship; tackling inequity in 

the workplace such as by encouraging full equity in remuneration; improving women’s well-being such as by 

supporting gender-specific care, education and social projects; promoting social inclusion through targeted social 

measures and services such as by developing social housing; and encouraging territorial networks, partnerships 

and information campaigns to raise awareness of the gender violence issue. In other words, a greater integration 

of the gender perspective in governmental policies involves adopting this perspective in all strategic areas of 

intervention: labor policies, family policies, health policies and welfare and social policies. More 

gender-responsive regional policies would ultimately help to promote positive behavior. This will contribute to 

using public resources with increasing equity for citizens, thus strengthening gender equality and the role of 

women in the family, at work and in society. 
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