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BACKGROUND OF EXPERTS 

HANS BORN is a Senior Fellow at the Geneva Centre for Democratic Control of the 
Armed Forces (DCAF), where he leads DCAF’s working groups on parliamentary 
accountability of the security sector as well as legal aspects of security sector 
governance. In addition to his research responsibilities, he also acts in various 
capacities as a lecturer and advisor. He is also a member of DCAF’s Legal-Political 
Advisory Group (LPAG) on security and defence issues which currently assists, 
including others, the CIS Parliamentary Assembly and the Ukrainian Rada. In the field 
of intelligence and security services, he co-authored Making Intelligence Accountable: 
Legal Standards and Best Practice for Oversight of Intelligence Agencies (Parliament of 
Norway, 2005), and he co-edited Who's Watching the Spies? Establishing Intelligence 
Service Accountability (Potomac Publishers, 2005). 

IAIN CAMERON is Professor in Public International Law at the University of Uppsala, 
Sweden. He is a member of the Advisory Board of the Nordic Journal of International 
Law and a member of the ILA Committee on the International Criminal Court. He was 
an expert adviser to the Badinter Commission and to the Swedish Government 
commission proposing legislation on UN sanctions. His research interests lie in human 
rights, international criminal law and civil liberties.  He has published extensively in 
these fields, including National Security and the European Convention on Human Rights 
(Kluwer, 2000) and an Introduction to the European Convention on Human Rights (4th 
ed., Iustus, 2002). He is also the author of the 2002 report to the Swedish Foreign 
Office on Legal Safeguards and UN Targeted Sanctions. 
 
MARINA CAPARINI is a Senior Fellow at the Geneva Centre for the Democratic 
Control of Armed Forces (DCAF), where she heads working groups on civil society and 
internal security services (police, security intelligence and border management).  Prior 
to joining DCAF, Ms. Caparini worked in various positions in research, policy support 
and outreach in defence and security affairs. She has worked at the Military and 
Strategic Studies Program (University of Calgary), the Parliamentary Centre (Ottawa), 
and the Association of Universities and Colleges of Canada (Ottawa). Ms. Caparini 
writes on various aspects of security sector governance. Recent publications include the 
co-edited Democratic Governance of Civil-Military Relations in Europe: Learning from 
Crisis and Institutional Change (forthcoming 2005), and the co-authored Privatizing 
Security: Law, Practice and Governance of Private Military and Security Companies 
(2005).  
 
PETER GILL is Professor in Politics and Security at Liverpool John Moores University, 
UK. Professor Gill’s main research interests relate to the organization, control and 
accountability of police and security intelligence organizations.  He has also served as 
the Convenor of the Security and Intelligence Studies Group, a working group of the UK 
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Political Studies Association and British International Studies Association.  His 
publications include: An Introduction to Politics (Blackwell, 1993, with Geoff Ponton); 
Policing Politics: Security, intelligence and the liberal democratic state (Cass, 1994); 
and Rounding Up the Usual Suspects? Developments in contemporary law enforcement 
intelligence (Ashgate, 2000). He has recently co-edited two books: Democracy, Law 
and Security: internal security services in contemporary Europe (Ashgate, 2002) and 
Transnational Organized Crime: Perspectives on Global Security (Routledge, 2003).  
 
IAN LEIGH is Professor of Law at the University of Durham, U.K. He is Head of the 
Department of Law and is Co-Director of the Human Rights Centre. He has held 
appointments at several universities, including visiting appointments at Osgoode Hall 
Law School, Ontario and the University of Otago, New Zealand.  Professor Leigh is 
author of Law, Politics and Local Democracy (Oxford University Press, 2000).  He also 
co-authored In From the Cold: National Security and Parliamentary Democracy 
(Clarendon Press, 1994), and Making Intelligence Accountable: Legal Standards and 
Best Practice for Oversight of Intelligence Agencies (Norwegian Parliament Printing 
House, 2005).  Professor Leigh is co-editor of the forthcoming book, Watching the 
Spies: Establishing Intelligence Service Accountability (Potomac Books, 2005). 
 
NUALA O’LOAN is the Police Ombudsman for Northern Ireland.  She is a qualified 
solicitor and served as the Senior Lecturer holding the Jean Monnet Chair in European 
Law at the University of Ulster from 1992 to 2000.  Her interests include matters of law, 
the police and consumer rights; and she is author of several publications.  She has 
been a Member of the Police Authority, Vice-Chair of the Police Authority’s Community 
Relation Committee, and a member and Convenor of Complaints for the Northern 
Health and Social Services Board.  In 2003, the North American Association for Civilian 
Oversight of Law Enforcement presented Mrs. O’Loan with an award for her outstanding 
contribution to police accountability. 
 
 
 

 


